
                                                  

SUMMARY SHEET Date: September 28, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: #17-61 I/T Support Consultant 
 

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS 

 VENDOR VENDOR 

Vendor 

 

City/State 

ClientFirst Technology Consulting 

Corona CA 

Current Technologies Corp 

Lombard IL 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE 
Yes Yes 

Mandatory Pages? 
Yes Yes 

Exceptions? 
Yes; See Bid; additional costs Yes; See Bid 

Hours based upon C.S.T. 

(Central Standard Time) 

Year 1 

12/1/17-

11/30/18 

Year 2 

12/1/18 – 

11/30/19 

Year 3 

(optional) 

12/1/19-

11/30/20 

Year 4 

(optional) 

12/1/20-

11/30/21 

Year 1 

12/1/17-

11/30/18 

Year 2 

12/1/18 – 

11/30/19 

Year 3 

(optional) 

12/1/19-

11/30/20 

Year 4 

(optional) 

12/1/20-

11/30/21 

Fixed Monthly Rate 

Based on 30 hours a 

Month (1 day a week) on 

site consulting $4950.00 $4950.00 $5198.00 $5198.00 $4020.00 $4020.00 $4020.00 $4020.00 

Fixed Daily Rate 

Based on 7.5 hour day 

on site consulting $1238.00 $1238.00 $1299.00 $1299.00 $1005.00 $1005.00 $1005.00 $4020.00 

Hourly Rate 8 am to 5 

pm on site consulting $165.00* $165.00* $165.00 $165.00 $134.00 $134.00 $134.00 $134.00 

Hourly Rate 5 pm to 7 

am on site consulting $165.00* $165.00* $165.00 $165.00 $201.00 $201.00 $201.00 $201.00 

Hourly Rate 8 am to 5 

pm remote/ phone 

consulting  $165.00* $165.00* $165.00 $165.00 $134.00 $134.00 $134.00 $134.00 

Hourly Rate 5 pm to 7 

am remote/ phone 

consulting  $165.00* $165.00* $165.00 $165.00 $201.00 $201.00 $201.00 $201.00 
 

  



                                                  

SUMMARY SHEET Date: September 28, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: #17-61 I/T Support Consultant 
 

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS 

 

 VENDOR VENDOR 

Vendor 

 

City/State 

DSN Group Inc 

Hoffman Estates IL 

Information Resource Systems Corp 

Wheaton IL 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE 
Yes Yes 

Mandatory Pages? 
Yes Yes 

Exceptions? 
None - 

Hours based upon C.S.T. 

(Central Standard Time) 

Year 1 

12/1/17-

11/30/18 

Year 2 

12/1/18 – 

11/30/19 

Year 3 

(optional) 

12/1/19-

11/30/20 

Year 4 

(optional) 

12/1/20-

11/30/21 

Year 1 

12/1/17-

11/30/18 

Year 2 

12/1/18 – 

11/30/19 

Year 3 

(optional) 

12/1/19-

11/30/20 

Year 4 

(optional) 

12/1/20-

11/30/21 

Fixed Monthly Rate 

Based on 30 hours a 

Month (1 day a week) on 

site consulting $4950.00 $4950.00 $5445.00 $5445.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid 

Fixed Daily Rate 

Based on 7.5 hour day 

on site consulting $1237.50 $1237.50 $1361.25 $1361.25 No bid No bid No bid No bid 

Hourly Rate 8 am to 5 

pm on site consulting $165.00 $165.00 $181.50 $181.50 $140.00 $140.00 No bid No bid 

Hourly Rate 5 pm to 7 

am on site consulting $190.00 $190.00 $209.00 $209.00 $140.00 $140.00 No bid No bid 

Hourly Rate 8 am to 5 

pm remote/ phone 

consulting  $140.00 $140.00 $154.00 $154.00 $140.00 $140.00 No bid No bid 

Hourly Rate 5 pm to 7 

am remote/ phone 

consulting  $161.00 $161.00 $177.00 $177.00 $140.00 $140.00 No bid No bid 
 

  



                                                  

SUMMARY SHEET Date: September 28, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: #17-61 I/T Support Consultant 
 

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS 

 

 

 VENDOR 

Vendor 

 

City/State 

HigherGround Managed Services 

Rolling Meadows IL 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE 
Yes 

Mandatory Pages? 
Yes 

Exceptions? 
Yes; see Bid 

Hours based upon C.S.T. (Central 

Standard Time) 

Year 1 

12/1/17-

11/30/18 

Year 2 

12/1/18 – 

11/30/19 

Year 3 

(optional) 

12/1/19-

11/30/20 

Year 4 

(optional) 

12/1/20-

11/30/21 

Fixed Monthly Rate 

Based on 30 hours a Month (1 day a 

week) on site consulting $4500.00 $4500.00 $4500.00 $4500.00 

Fixed Daily Rate 

Based on 7.5 hour day on site 

consulting $1125.00 $1125.00 $1125.00 $1125.00 

Hourly Rate 8 am to 5 pm on site 

consulting $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 

Hourly Rate 5 pm to 7 am on site 

consulting $165.00 $165.00 $165.00 $165.00 

Hourly Rate 8 am to 5 pm remote/ 

phone consulting  $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 

Hourly Rate 5 pm to 7 am remote/ 

phone consulting  $165.00 $165.00 $165.00 $165.00 
 

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 5. 


