
                                                  
SUMMARY SHEET Date:  August 8, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing            Bid: 17-43 Pest Control Services 
 

Unofficial Results 

 

 VENDOR VENDOR 

NAME 

CITY/STATE 
AEREX PEST CONTROL 

ROLLING MEADOWS IL 

ANDERSON PEST SOLUTIONS 

LIBERTYVILLE IL 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE YES YES 

MANDATORY PAGES YES YES 

Pest Control Services 

Yr I 

12/1/17-11/30/18 

Monthly 

Yr II 

12/1/18-

11/30/19 

Monthly 

Yr III, optional 

12/1/19-11/30/20 

Monthly 

Yr IV, optional 

12/1/20-11/30/21 

Monthly 

Yr I 

12/1/17-11/30/18 

Monthly 

Yr II 

12/1/18-

11/30/19 

Monthly 

Yr III, 

optional 

12/1/19-

11/30/20 

Monthly 

Yr IV, 

optional 

12/1/20-

11/30/21 

Monthly 

McHenry County 

Government Center $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $103.00 

McHenry County Jail $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $70.00 $70.00 $70.00 $72.10 

Building A $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.90 

Building B $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.90 

Administration Building $70.00 $70.00 $70.00 $70.00 $42.00 $42.00 $42.00 $43.26 

Storage Building (Klehm) $52.00 $52.00 $52.00 $52.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $36.05 

Treasurer’s Building $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $36.05 

Archive Building $52.00 $52.00 $52.00 $52.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $41.20 

McHenry County Division 

of Transportation $73.00 $73.00 $73.00 $73.00 $70.00 $70.00 $70.00 $72.10 

McHenry County 

Health/Animal Control $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $36.05 

Valley Hi Nursing Home $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $103.00 

Office Building; 500 Russel 

Court $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $36.05 

TOTAL MONTHLY cost  $617.00 $617.00 $617.00 $617.00 $622.00 $622.00 $622.00 $640.66 

TOTAL ANNUAL COST $7,404.00 $7,404.00 $7,404.00 $7,404.00 $7,464.00 $7,464.00 $7,464.00 $7,607.92 
       

 

 



                                                  
SUMMARY SHEET Date:  August 8, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing            Bid: 17-43 Pest Control Services 
 

Unofficial Results 

 

 

  

ALTERNATE ANNUAL 

BEE, WASP & HORNET 

Yr I 

12/1/17-11/30/18  

Per application 

Yr II 

12/1/18-

11/30/19 

Per 

application 

Yr III, optional 

12/1/19-11/30/20 

Per 

application 

Yr IV, optional 

12/1/20-11/30/21 

Per application 

Yr I 

12/1/17-11/30/18 

Per 

application 

Yr II 

12/1/18-

11/30/19 

Per 

application 

Yr III, 

optional 

12/1/19-

11/30/20 

Per 

application 

Yr IV, 

optional 

12/1/20-

11/30/21 

Per 

application 

McHenry County 

Government Center $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $425.00 $425.00 $425.00 $450.50 

McHenry County Jail $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $425.00 $425.00 $425.00 $450.50 

Building A $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $225.00 $225.00 $225.00 $238.50 

Building B $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $225.00 $225.00 $225.00 $238.50 

Administration Building $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $135.50 

Storage Building (Klehm) $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $135.50 

Treasurer’s Building $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $135.50 

Archive Building $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $135.50 

McHenry County Division 

of Transportation $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $135.50 

McHenry County 

Health/Animal Control $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $135.50 

Valley Hi Nursing Home $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $325.00 $325.00 $325.00 $344.50 

Office Building; 500 Russel 

Court $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $135.50 

TOTAL Application cost  $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,650.00 

Exceptions?   

 

 

 

 

 



                                                  
SUMMARY SHEET Date:  August 8, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing            Bid: 17-43 Pest Control Services 
 

Unofficial Results 

 

 

 VENDOR VENDOR 

NAME 

CITY/STATE 
CHEM-WISE 

AURORA IL 

GUARDIAN PEST SOLUTIONS 

SUPERIOR WI 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE YES YES 

MANDATORY PAGES YES YES 

Pest Control Services 

Yr I 

12/1/17-11/30/18 

Monthly 

Yr II 

12/1/18-

11/30/19 

Monthly 

Yr III, optional 

12/1/19-11/30/20 

Monthly 

Yr IV, optional 

12/1/20-11/30/21 

Monthly 

Yr I 

12/1/17-11/30/18 

Monthly 

Yr II 

12/1/18-

11/30/19 

Monthly 

Yr III, 

optional 

12/1/19-

11/30/20 

Monthly 

Yr IV, 

optional 

12/1/20-

11/30/21 

Monthly 

McHenry County 

Government Center $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 $85.00 $85.00 $85.00 $85.00 

McHenry County Jail $65.00 $65.00 $65.00 $65.00 $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 $110.00 

Building A $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 

Building B $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 

Administration Building $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 

Storage Building (Klehm) $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 

Treasurer’s Building $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 

Archive Building $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $42.00 $42.00 $42.00 $42.00 

McHenry County Division 

of Transportation $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 

McHenry County 

Health/Animal Control $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 

Valley Hi Nursing Home $65.00 $65.00 $65.00 $65.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 

Office Building; 500 Russel 

Court $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 

TOTAL MONTHLY cost  $485.00 $485.00 $485.00 $485.00 $710.00 $710.00 $710.00 $710.00 

TOTAL ANNUAL COST $5,820.00 $5,820.00 $5,820.00 $5,820.00 $8,520.00 $8,520.00 $8,520.00 $8,520.00 
 



                                                  
SUMMARY SHEET Date:  August 8, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing            Bid: 17-43 Pest Control Services 
 

Unofficial Results 

 

 

 

 

  

ALTERNATE ANNUAL 

BEE, WASP & HORNET 

Yr I 

12/1/17-11/30/18  

Per application 

Yr II 

12/1/18-

11/30/19 

Per 

application 

Yr III, optional 

12/1/19-11/30/20 

Per 

application 

Yr IV, optional 

12/1/20-11/30/21 

Per application 

Yr I 

12/1/17-11/30/18 

Per 

application 

Yr II 

12/1/18-

11/30/19 

Per 

application 

Yr III, 

optional 

12/1/19-

11/30/20 

Per 

application 

Yr IV, 

optional 

12/1/20-

11/30/21 

Per 

application 

McHenry County 

Government Center $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 

McHenry County Jail $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 

Building A $75.00 $75.00 $75.00 $75.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 

Building B $65.00 $65.00 $65.00 $65.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 

Administration Building $95.00 $95.00 $95.00 $95.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 

Storage Building (Klehm) $65.00 $65.00 $65.00 $65.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 

Treasurer’s Building $75.00 $75.00 $75.00 $75.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 

Archive Building $75.00 $75.00 $75.00 $75.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 

McHenry County Division 

of Transportation $85.00 $85.00 $85.00 $85.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 

McHenry County 

Health/Animal Control $75.00 $75.00 $75.00 $75.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 

Valley Hi Nursing Home $205.00 $205.00 $205.00 $205.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 

Office Building; 500 Russel 

Court $65.00 $65.00 $65.00 $65.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 

TOTAL Application cost  $1,130.00 $1,130.00 $1,130.00 $1,130.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 

Exceptions?   

 

 

 



                                                  
SUMMARY SHEET Date:  August 8, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing            Bid: 17-43 Pest Control Services 
 

Unofficial Results 

 

 VENDOR VENDOR 

NAME 

CITY/STATE 
PEST MANAGEMENT SERVICES 

BLUE ISLAND IL 

ROSE PEST SOLUTIONS 

NORTHFIELD IL 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE YES YES 

MANDATORY PAGES YES YES 

Pest Control Services 

Yr I 

12/1/17-11/30/18 

Monthly 

Yr II 

12/1/18-

11/30/19 

Monthly 

Yr III, optional 

12/1/19-11/30/20 

Monthly 

Yr IV, optional 

12/1/20-11/30/21 

Monthly 

Yr I 

12/1/17-11/30/18 

Monthly 

Yr II 

12/1/18-

11/30/19 

Monthly 

Yr III, 

optional 

12/1/19-

11/30/20 

Monthly 

Yr IV, 

optional 

12/1/20-

11/30/21 

Monthly 

McHenry County 

Government Center $85.00 $85.00 $87.55 $90.18 $73.00 $73.00 $73.00 $73.00 

McHenry County Jail $85.00 $85.00 $87.55 $90.18 $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 

Building A $30.00 $30.00 $30.90 $31.83 $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 

Building B $30.00 $30.00 $30.90 $31.83 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 

Administration Building $58.00 $58.00 $59.74 $61.53 $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 

Storage Building (Klehm) $44.00 $44.00 $45.32 $46.68 $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 

Treasurer’s Building $50.00 $50.00 $51.50 $53.05 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 

Archive Building $42.00 $42.00 $43.26 $44.56 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 

McHenry County Division 

of Transportation $65.00 $65.00 $66.95 $68.96 $73.00 $73.00 $73.00 $73.00 

McHenry County 

Health/Animal Control $34.00 $34.00 $35.02 $36.07 $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 

Valley Hi Nursing Home $75.00 $75.00 $77.25 $79.57 $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 

Office Building; 500 Russel 

Court $45.00 $45.00 $46.35 $47.74 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 

TOTAL MONTHLY cost  $643.00 $643.00 $662.29 $682.18 $726.00 $726.00 $726.00 $726.00 

TOTAL ANNUAL COST $7,716.00 $7,716.00 $7,947.48 $8,186.16 $8,712.00 $8,712.00 $8,712.00 $8,712.00 
 

 



                                                  
SUMMARY SHEET Date:  August 8, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing            Bid: 17-43 Pest Control Services 
 

Unofficial Results 

 

 

 

 

  

ALTERNATE ANNUAL 

BEE, WASP & HORNET 

Yr I 

12/1/17-11/30/18  

Per application 

Yr II 

12/1/18-

11/30/19 

Per 

application 

Yr III, optional 

12/1/19-11/30/20 

Per 

application 

Yr IV, optional 

12/1/20-11/30/21 

Per application 

Yr I 

12/1/17-11/30/18 

Per 

application 

Yr II 

12/1/18-

11/30/19 

Per 

application 

Yr III, 

optional 

12/1/19-

11/30/20 

Per 

application 

Yr IV, 

optional 

12/1/20-

11/30/21 

Per 

application 

McHenry County 

Government Center $200.00 $200.00 $206.00 $212.18 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 

McHenry County Jail $200.00 $200.00 $206.00 $212.18 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 

Building A $200.00 $200.00 $206.00 $212.18 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 

Building B $200.00 $200.00 $206.00 $212.18 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 

Administration Building $200.00 $200.00 $206.00 $212.18 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 

Storage Building (Klehm) $200.00 $200.00 $206.00 $212.18 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 

Treasurer’s Building $200.00 $200.00 $206.00 $212.18 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 

Archive Building $200.00 $200.00 $206.00 $212.18 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 

McHenry County Division 

of Transportation $200.00 $200.00 $206.00 $212.18 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 

McHenry County 

Health/Animal Control $200.00 $200.00 $206.00 $212.18 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 

Valley Hi Nursing Home $200.00 $200.00 $206.00 $212.18 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 

Office Building; 500 Russel 

Court $200.00 $200.00 $206.00 $212.18 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 $175.00 

TOTAL Application cost  $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $2,472.00 $2,546.16 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 

Exceptions?   

 

 

 

 

 



                                                  
SUMMARY SHEET Date:  August 8, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing            Bid: 17-43 Pest Control Services 
 

Unofficial Results 

 VENDOR VENDOR 

NAME 

CITY/STATE 
SMITHEREEN PEST MANAGEMENT 

NEW LENOX IL 

TERMINIX 

ELMHURST IL 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE YES YES 

MANDATORY PAGES YES YES 

Pest Control Services 

Yr I 

12/1/17-11/30/18 

Monthly 

Yr II 

12/1/18-

11/30/19 

Monthly 

Yr III, optional 

12/1/19-11/30/20 

Monthly 

Yr IV, optional 

12/1/20-11/30/21 

Monthly 

Yr I 

12/1/17-11/30/18 

Monthly 

Yr II 

12/1/18-

11/30/19 

Monthly 

Yr III, 

optional 

12/1/19-

11/30/20 

Monthly 

Yr IV, 

optional 

12/1/20-

11/30/21 

Monthly 

McHenry County 

Government Center $50.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $85.00 $85.00 No bid No bid 

McHenry County Jail $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 $105.00 $105.00 No bid No bid 

Building A $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $55.00 $55.00 No bid No bid 

Building B $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $45.00 $45.00 No bid No bid 

Administration Building $50.00 $50.00 $60.00 $60.00 $75.00 $75.00 No bid No bid 

Storage Building (Klehm) $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 No bid No bid 

Treasurer’s Building $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $40.00 $40.00 No bid No bid 

Archive Building $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 $50.00 $50.00 No bid No bid 

McHenry County Division 

of Transportation $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $45.00 $45.00 No bid No bid 

McHenry County 

Health/Animal Control $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 No bid No bid 

Valley Hi Nursing Home $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $110.00 $115.00 $115.00 No bid No bid 

Office Building; 500 Russel 

Court $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $35.00 $35.00 No bid No bid 

TOTAL MONTHLY cost  $550.00 $560.00 $570.00 $580.00 $725.00 $725.00 No bid No bid 

TOTAL ANNUAL COST $6,600.00 $6,720.00 $6,840.00 $6,960.00 $8,700.00 $8,700.00 No bid No bid 
 

 

 

 

 



                                                  
SUMMARY SHEET Date:  August 8, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing            Bid: 17-43 Pest Control Services 
 

Unofficial Results 

 

 

  

ALTERNATE ANNUAL 

BEE, WASP & HORNET 

Yr I 

12/1/17-11/30/18  

Per application 

Yr II 

12/1/18-

11/30/19 

Per 

application 

Yr III, optional 

12/1/19-11/30/20 

Per 

application 

Yr IV, optional 

12/1/20-11/30/21 

Per application 

Yr I 

12/1/17-11/30/18 

Per 

application 

Yr II 

12/1/18-

11/30/19 

Per 

application 

Yr III, 

optional 

12/1/19-

11/30/20 

Per 

application 

Yr IV, 

optional 

12/1/20-

11/30/21 

Per 

application 

McHenry County 

Government Center $400.00 $400.00 $400.00 $400.00 $200.00 $200.00 No bid No bid 

McHenry County Jail $385.00 $385.00 $385.00 $385.00 $200.00 $200.00 No bid No bid 

Building A $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $100.00 $100.00 No bid No bid 

Building B $140.00 $140.00 $140.00 $140.00 $85.00 $85.00 No bid No bid 

Administration Building $350.00 $350.00 $350.00 $350.00 $125.00 $125.00 No bid No bid 

Storage Building (Klehm) $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 $65.00 $65.00 No bid No bid 

Treasurer’s Building $130.00 $130.00 $130.00 $130.00 $75.00 $75.00 No bid No bid 

Archive Building $180.00 $180.00 $180.00 $180.00 $85.00 $85.00 No bid No bid 

McHenry County Division 

of Transportation $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $85.00 $85.00 No bid No bid 

McHenry County 

Health/Animal Control $180.00 $180.00 $180.00 $180.00 $75.00 $75.00 No bid No bid 

Valley Hi Nursing Home $325.00 $325.00 $325.00 $325.00 $200.00 $200.00 No bid No bid 

Office Building; 500 Russel 

Court $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 $75.00 $75.00 No bid No bid 

TOTAL Application cost  $2,760.00 $2,760.00 $2,760.00 $2,760.00 $1,370.00 $1,370.00 No bid No bid 

Exceptions?   

SENT TO 11 potential bidders. Submittals received from: 8 

 


