
                                                  
SUMMARY SHEET Date:  June 27, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing            Bid: 17-32 COPY PAPER 
 

Unofficial Results 

 VENDOR VENDOR 

NAME 

CITY/STATE 

Lewis Paper International 

Wheeling IL 

Midland Paper 

Wheeling IL 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE Yes Yes 

MANDATORY PAGES Yes yes 

 Yr I 

12/1/17-11/30/18 

Yr II 

12/1/18-11/30/19 

Yr III 

12/1/19-

11/30/20 

Yr IV 12/1/20-

11/30/21 

Yr I 

12/1/17-11/30/18 

Yr II 

12/1/18-11/30/19 

Yr III 

12/1/19-11/30/20 

Yr IV 12/1/20-

11/30/21 

8-1/2 X 11 $24.00/$43,200.00 $25.00/$45,000.00 No bid No bid $26.10 $27.10 $28.35 $29.90 

8-1/2 X 14 $41.00/$492.00 $42.00/$504.00 No bid No bid $37.00 $38.00 $39.25 $40.75 

11 X 17 $32.00/$192.00 $33.00/$198.00 No bid No bid $29.00 $30.00 $31.25 $32.75 

TOTAL $43,884.00 $45,702.00 No bid No bid $47,598.00 $49,416.00 $51,688.50 $54,505.50 

Exceptions? No See Bid for prompt payment discount 

      VENDOR VENDOR 

NAME 

CITY/STATE 

Paper101 

Ankeny IA 

Premier Paper 

Columbia MO 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE Yes Yes 

MANDATORY PAGES Yes yes 

 Yr I 

12/1/17-11/30/18 

Yr II 

12/1/18-11/30/19 

Yr III 

12/1/19-

11/30/20 

Yr IV 12/1/20-

11/30/21 

Yr I 

12/1/17-11/30/18 

Yr II 

12/1/18-11/30/19 

Yr III 

12/1/19-11/30/20 

Yr IV 12/1/20-

11/30/21 

8-1/2 X 11 $24.38 $25.98 $26.98 $27.98 $23.98 $25.17 $27.68 $30.44 

8-1/2 X 14 $38.16 $40.16 $42.16 $44.16 No bid No bid No bid No bid 

11 X 17 $30.00 $32.00 $34.00 $36.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid 

TOTAL $44,521.92 $47,437.92 $49,273.92 $51,109.92     

Exceptions? no no 

 VENDOR  

NAME 

CITY/STATE 

Veritiv Operating Company 

Addison IL 
 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE Yes  

MANDATORY PAGES yes  

 Yr I 

12/1/17-11/30/18 

Yr II 

12/1/18-11/30/19 

Yr III 

12/1/19-

11/30/20 

Yr IV 12/1/20-

11/30/21 

 

8-1/2 X 11 $25.15 $25.90 No bid No bid 

8-1/2 X 14 $37.50 $39.00 No bid No bid 

11 X 17 $29.50 $30.40 No bid No bid 

TOTAL $15,299.00 $15,756.80 No bid No bid 

Exceptions? no  

Sent to 9 potential bidders. Submittals received from 5: 


