
                                                  
SUMMARY SHEET Date:  June 21, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing            Bid: 17-27 Body Armor / Court Security & Patrol 
 

Unofficial Results 

 

 VENDOR VENDOR 

NAME 

CITY/STATE UNIFORM DEN EAST 

LOVES PARK IL 

ASPETTO 

FREDERICKSBURG VA 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE YES YES 

MANDATORY PAGES YES YES 

SAMPLES INCLUDED? YES YES 

 

Yr I 

12/1/17-

11/30/18 

Yr II 

(optional) 

12/1/18-

11/30/19 

Yr III 

(optional) 

12/1/19-

11/30/20 

Yr IV (optional) 

12/1/20-11/30/21 

Yr I 

12/1/17-

11/30/18  

Yr II 

(optional) 

12/1/18-

11/30/19 

Yr III 

(optional) 

12/1/19-

11/30/20 

Yr IV  

(optional) 

12/1/20-

11/30/21 

Patrol Deputies / Court Security (Male)       

Level II Body Armor - Less 

than .90 lbs/sq ft. Less than 

.25 in thick and meet or 

exceed the minimum 

specifications for Level II 

Armor as detailed in NIJ 

Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – 

Body Armor Classification. 

Must meet all specifications 

as listed in Appendix A – 

Level II Body Armor 

Small $399.50 

 

M $399.50 

 

L $399.50 

 

XL $399.50 

Small $407.50 

 

M $407.50 

 

L $407.50 

 

XL $407.50 

Small $415.95 

 

M $415.95 

 

L $415.95 

 

XL $415.95 

Small $424.50 

 

M $424.50 

 

L $424.50 

 

XL $424.50 

Small 

$257.00 

 

M $257.00 

 

L $257.00 

 

XL $257.00 

Small 

$257.00 

 

M $257.00 

 

L $257.00 

 

XL $257.00 

Small $265.00 

 

M $265.00 

 

L $265.00 

 

XL $265.00 

Small $270.00 

 

M $270.00 

 

L $270.00 

 

XL $270.00 

Level II Body Armor - Less 

than .85 lbs/sq ft. Less than 

.25 in thick and meet or 

exceed the minimum 

specifications for Level II 

Armor as detailed in NIJ 

Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – 

Body Armor Classification. 

Must meet all specifications 

as listed in Appendix A – 

Level II Body Armor 

Small $399.50 

 

M $399.50 

 

L $399.50 

 

XL $399.50 

Small $407.50 

 

M $407.50 

 

L $407.50 

 

XL $407.50 

Small $415.95 

 

M $415.95 

 

L $415.95 

 

XL $415.95 

Small $425.50 

 

M $425.50 

 

L $425.50 

 

XL $425.50 N/A N/A N/A N/A 

Level II Body Armor - Less 

than .80 lbs/sq ft. Less than 

.25 in thick and meet or 

exceed the minimum 

specifications for Level II 

Armor as detailed in NIJ 

Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – 

Small $399.50 

 

M $399.50 

 

L $399.50 

 

XL $399.50 

Small $407.50 

 

M $407.50 

 

L $407.50 

 

XL $407.50 

Small $415.95 

 

M $415.95 

 

L $415.95 

 

XL $415.95 

Small $425.50 

 

M $425.50 

 

L $425.50 

 

XL $425.50 N/A N/A N/A N/A 



                                                  
SUMMARY SHEET Date:  June 21, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing            Bid: 17-27 Body Armor / Court Security & Patrol 
 

Unofficial Results 

Body Armor Classification. 

Must meet all specifications 

as listed in Appendix A – 

Level II Body Armor 

Option I –  

Two concealable carriers in 

navy blue. INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED $106.00 $106.00 $115.00 $115.00 

Option 2  with External 

Carrier– 

One external carrier, uniform 

shirt style, in Navy Blue with 

sown on embroidered badge 

(to be supplied by MCSO to 

vendor), custom fit to panels. 

External Carrier can come 

with  a set (a set being 2 

pockets) of either “Chicago 

pockets” or “Molle 

attachments” on the lower 

half at the Deputy’s choice. 

(Pictures are available to 

serve as exemplars of what 

each carrier should look like) 

Small $141.95 

 

M $141.95 

 

L $141.95 

 

XL $141.95 

Small $144.95 

 

M $144.95 

 

L $144.95 

 

XL $144.95 

Small $147.95 

 

M $147.95 

 

L $147.95 

 

XL $147.95 

Small $150.95 

 

M $150.95 

 

L $150.95 

 

XL $150.95 

Small $94.00 

 

M $94.00 

 

L $94.00 

 

XL $94.00 

Small $94.00 

 

M $94.00 

 

L $94.00 

 

XL $94.00 

Small $100.00 

 

M $100.00 

 

L $100.00 

 

XL $100.00 

Small $100.00 

 

M $100.00 

 

L $100.00 

 

XL $100.00 

Option 2 –  

One concealable navy carrier INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

$55.00* 

DEPENDS ON 

OPTIONS 

$55.00* 

DEPENDS ON 

OPTIONS 

$60.00* 

DEPENDS ON 

OPTIONS 

$60.00* 

DEPENDS ON 

OPTIONS 

  



                                                  
SUMMARY SHEET Date:  June 21, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing            Bid: 17-27 Body Armor / Court Security & Patrol 
 

Unofficial Results 

         

Patrol Deputies / Court Security (Female)       

Level II Body Armor - Less 

than .90 lbs/sq ft. Less than 

.25 in thick and meet or 

exceed the minimum 

specifications for Level II 

Armor as detailed in NIJ 

Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – 

Body Armor Classification. 

Must meet all specifications 

as listed in Appendix A – 

Level II Body Armor 

Small $399.50 

 

M $399.50 

 

L $399.50 

 

XL $399.50 

Small $407.50 

 

M $407.50 

 

L $407.50 

 

XL $407.50 

Small $415.95 

 

M $415.95 

 

L $415.95 

 

XL $415.95 

Small $424.50 

 

M $424.50 

 

L $424.50 

 

XL $424.50 

Small 

$257.00 

 

M $257.00 

 

L $257.00 

 

XL $257.00 

Small 

$257.00 

 

M $257.00 

 

L $257.00 

 

XL $257.00 

Small $265.00 

 

M $265.00 

 

L $265.00 

 

XL $265.00 

Small $270.00 

 

M $270.00 

 

L $270.00 

 

XL $270.00 

Level II Body Armor - Less 

than .85 lbs/sq ft. Less than 

.25 in thick and meet or 

exceed the minimum 

specifications for Level II 

Armor as detailed in NIJ 

Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – 

Body Armor Classification. 

Must meet all specifications 

as listed in Appendix A – 

Level II Body Armor 

Small $399.50 

 

M $399.50 

 

L $399.50 

 

XL $399.50 

Small $407.50 

 

M $407.50 

 

L $407.50 

 

XL $407.50 

Small $415.95 

 

M $415.95 

 

L $415.95 

 

XL $415.95 

Small $424.50 

 

M $424.50 

 

L $424.50 

 

XL $424.50 N/A N/A N/A N/A 

Level II Body Armor - Less 

than .80 lbs/sq ft. Less than 

.25 in thick and meet or 

exceed the minimum 

specifications for Level II 

Armor as detailed in NIJ 

Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – 

Body Armor Classification. 

Must meet all specifications 

as listed in Appendix A – 

Level II Body Armor 

Small $399.50 

 

M $399.50 

 

L $399.50 

 

XL $399.50 

Small $407.50 

 

M $407.50 

 

L $407.50 

 

XL $407.50 

Small $415.95 

 

M $415.95 

 

L $415.95 

 

XL $415.95 

Small $424.50 

 

M $424.50 

 

L $424.50 

 

XL $424.50 N/A N/A N/A N/A 

 

        



                                                  
SUMMARY SHEET Date:  June 21, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing            Bid: 17-27 Body Armor / Court Security & Patrol 
 

Unofficial Results 

Option I –  

Two concealable carriers in 

navy blue INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

Small 

$106.00 

 

M $106.00 

 

L $106.00 

 

XL $106.00 

Small 

$106.00 

 

M $106.00 

 

L $106.00 

 

XL $106.00 

Small $115.00 

 

M $115.00 

 

L $115.00 

 

XL $115.00 

Small $115.00 

 

M $115.00 

 

L $115.00 

 

XL $115.00 

Option 2  with External 

Carrier– 

One external carrier, uniform 

shirt style, in Navy Blue with 

sown on embroidered badge 

(to be supplied by MCSO to 

vendor), custom fit to panels. 

External Carrier can come 

with a set (a set being 2 

pockets) of either “Chicago 

pockets” or “Molle 

attachments” on the lower 

half at the Deputy’s choice. 

(Pictures are available to 

serve as exemplars of what 

each carrier should look like) 

Small $185.50 

 

M $185.50 

 

L $185.50 

 

XL $185.50 

Small $188.50 

 

M $188.50 

 

L $188.50 

 

XL $188.50 

Small $192.50 

 

M $192.50 

 

L $192.50 

 

XL $192.50 

Small $196.50 

 

M $196.50 

 

L $196.50 

 

XL $196.50 

Small $94.00 

 

M $94.00 

 

L $94.00 

 

XL $94.00 

Small $94.00 

 

M $94.00 

 

L $94.00 

 

XL $94.00 

Small $100.00 

 

M $100.00 

 

L $100.00 

 

XL $100.00 

Small $100.00 

 

M $100.00 

 

L $100.00 

 

XL $100.00 

Option 2 –  

One concealable navy carrier. INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED 

$55.00* 

DEPENDS 

ON 

OPTIONS 

$55.00* 

DEPENDS 

ON 

OPTIONS 

$60.00* 

DEPENDS 

ON OPTIONS 

$60.00* 

DEPENDS 

ON OPTIONS 

TOTAL $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ 

 % % % % % % % % 

Exceptions? OUR PRICE OF $399.50 INCLUDES 2 CARRIERS NO 

       

  



                                                  
SUMMARY SHEET Date:  June 21, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing            Bid: 17-27 Body Armor / Court Security & Patrol 
 

Unofficial Results 

 VENDOR VENDOR 

NAME 

CITY/STATE RAY O’HERRON 

DANVILLE IL 

STREICHER’S 

BUTLER WI 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE YES YES 

MANDATORY PAGES YES YES 

SAMPLES? YES YES 

 

Yr I 

12/1/17-

11/30/18 

Yr II 

(optional) 

12/1/18-

11/30/19 

Yr III 

(optional) 

12/1/19-

11/30/20 

Yr IV (optional) 

12/1/20-11/30/21 

Yr I 

12/1/17-

11/30/18  

Yr II 

(optional) 

12/1/18-

11/30/19 

Yr III 

(optional) 

12/1/19-

11/30/20 

Yr IV  

(optional) 

12/1/20-

11/30/21 

Patrol Deputies / Court Security (Male)       

Level II Body Armor - Less 

than .90 lbs/sq ft. Less than 

.25 in thick and meet or 

exceed the minimum 

specifications for Level II 

Armor as detailed in NIJ 

Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – 

Body Armor Classification. 

Must meet all specifications 

as listed in Appendix A – 

Level II Body Armor 

Small $539.00 

 

M $539.00 

 

L $539.00 

 

XL $539.00 

Small $539.00 

 

M $539.00 

 

L $539.00 

 

XL $539.00 NO BID NO BID 

Small 

$428.00 

 

M $428.00 

 

L $428.00 

 

XL $428.00 

Small 

$441.00 

 

M $441.00 

 

L $441.00 

 

XL $441.00 

Small $455.00 

 

M $455.00 

 

L $455.00 

 

XL $455.00 

Small $469.00 

 

M $469.00 

 

L $469.00 

 

XL $469.00 

Level II Body Armor - Less 

than .85 lbs/sq ft. Less than 

.25 in thick and meet or 

exceed the minimum 

specifications for Level II 

Armor as detailed in NIJ 

Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – 

Body Armor Classification. 

Must meet all specifications 

as listed in Appendix A – 

Level II Body Armor NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Small 

$490.00 

 

M $490.00 

 

L $490.00 

 

XL $490.00 

Small 

$505.00 

 

M $505.00 

 

L $505.00 

 

XL $505.00 

Small $520.00 

 

M $520.00 

 

L $520.00 

 

XL $520.00 

Small $536.00 

 

M $536.00 

 

L $536.00 

 

XL $536.00 

Level II Body Armor - Less 

than .80 lbs/sq ft. Less than 

.25 in thick and meet or 

exceed the minimum 

specifications for Level II 

Armor as detailed in NIJ 

Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – 

Body Armor Classification. 

Small $550.00 

 

M $550.00 

 

L $550.00 

 

XL $550.00 

Small $550.00 

 

M $550.00 

 

L $550.00 

 

XL $550.00 NO BID NO BID 

Small 

$625.00 

 

M $625.00 

 

L $625.00 

 

XL $625.00 

Small 

$645.00 

 

M $645.00 

 

L $645.00 

 

XL $645.00 

Small $665.00 

 

M $665.00 

 

L $665.00 

 

XL $665.00 

Small $685.00 

 

M $685.00 

 

L $685.00 

 

XL $685.00 



                                                  
SUMMARY SHEET Date:  June 21, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing            Bid: 17-27 Body Armor / Court Security & Patrol 
 

Unofficial Results 

Must meet all specifications 

as listed in Appendix A – 

Level II Body Armor 

Option I –  

Two concealable carriers in 

navy blue. $61.50 $61.50 NO BID NO BID $120.00 $126.00 $133.00 $140.00 

Option 2  with External 

Carrier– 

One external carrier, uniform 

shirt style, in Navy Blue with 

sown on embroidered badge 

(to be supplied by MCSO to 

vendor), custom fit to panels. 

External Carrier can come 

with  a set (a set being 2 

pockets) of either “Chicago 

pockets” or “Molle 

attachments” on the lower 

half at the Deputy’s choice. 

(Pictures are available to 

serve as exemplars of what 

each carrier should look like) 

Small $149.95 

 

M $149.95 

 

L $149.95 

 

XL $149.95 

Small $149.95 

 

M $149.95 

 

L $149.95 

 

XL $149.95 NO BID NO BID 

Small 

$160.00 

 

M $160.00 

 

L $160.00 

 

XL $160.00 

Small 

$165.00 

 

M $165.00 

 

L $165.00 

 

XL $165.00 

Small $170.00 

 

M $170.00 

 

L $170.00 

 

XL $170.00 

Small $175.00 

 

M $175.00 

 

L $175.00 

 

XL $175.00 

Option 2 –  

One concealable navy carrier $61.50 $61.50 NO BID NO BID $60.00 $63.00 $66.50 $70.00 

  



                                                  
SUMMARY SHEET Date:  June 21, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing            Bid: 17-27 Body Armor / Court Security & Patrol 
 

Unofficial Results 

         

Patrol Deputies / Court Security (Female)       

Level II Body Armor - Less 

than .90 lbs/sq ft. Less than 

.25 in thick and meet or 

exceed the minimum 

specifications for Level II 

Armor as detailed in NIJ 

Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – 

Body Armor Classification. 

Must meet all specifications 

as listed in Appendix A – 

Level II Body Armor 

Small $539.00 

 

M $539.00 

 

L $539.00 

 

XL $539.00 

Small $539.00 

 

M $539.00 

 

L $539.00 

 

XL $539.00 NO BID NO BID 

Small 

$428.00 

 

M $428.00 

 

L $428.00 

 

XL $428.00 

Small 

$441.00 

 

M $441.00 

 

L $441.00 

 

XL $441.00 

Small $455.00 

 

M $455.00 

 

L $455.00 

 

XL $455.00 

Small $469.00 

 

M $469.00 

 

L $469.00 

 

XL $469.00 

Level II Body Armor - Less 

than .85 lbs/sq ft. Less than 

.25 in thick and meet or 

exceed the minimum 

specifications for Level II 

Armor as detailed in NIJ 

Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – 

Body Armor Classification. 

Must meet all specifications 

as listed in Appendix A – 

Level II Body Armor 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Small 

$490.00 

 

M $490.00 

 

L $490.00 

 

XL $490.00 

Small 

$505.00 

 

M $505.00 

 

L $505.00 

 

XL $505.00 

Small $520.00 

 

M $520.00 

 

L $520.00 

 

XL $520.00 

Small $536.00 

 

M $536.00 

 

L $536.00 

 

XL $536.00 

Level II Body Armor - Less 

than .80 lbs/sq ft. Less than 

.25 in thick and meet or 

exceed the minimum 

specifications for Level II 

Armor as detailed in NIJ 

Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – 

Body Armor Classification. 

Must meet all specifications 

as listed in Appendix A – 

Level II Body Armor 

Small $550.00 

 

M $550.00 

 

L $550.00 

 

XL $550.00 

Small $550.00 

 

M $550.00 

 

L $550.00 

 

XL $550.00 NO BID NO BID 

Small 

$625.00 

 

M $625.00 

 

L $625.00 

 

XL $625.00 

Small 

$645.00 

 

M $645.00 

 

L $645.00 

 

XL $645.00 

Small $665.00 

 

M $665.00 

 

L $665.00 

 

XL $665.00 

Small $685.00 

 

M $685.00 

 

L $685.00 

 

XL $685.00 

 

        



                                                  
SUMMARY SHEET Date:  June 21, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing            Bid: 17-27 Body Armor / Court Security & Patrol 
 

Unofficial Results 

Option I –  

Two concealable carriers in 

navy blue 

Small $61.50 

 

M $61.50 

 

L $61.50 

 

XL $61.50 

Small $61.50 

 

M $61.50 

 

L $61.50 

 

XL $61.50 NO BID NO BID 

Small 

$120.00 

 

M $120.00 

 

L $120.00 

 

XL $120.00 

Small 

$126.00 

 

M $126.00 

 

L $126.00 

 

XL $126.00 

Small $133.00 

 

M $133.00 

 

L $133.00 

 

XL $133.00 

Small $140.00 

 

M $140.00 

 

L $140.00 

 

XL $140.00 

Option 2  with External 

Carrier– 

One external carrier, uniform 

shirt style, in Navy Blue with 

sown on embroidered badge 

(to be supplied by MCSO to 

vendor), custom fit to panels. 

External Carrier can come 

with a set (a set being 2 

pockets) of either “Chicago 

pockets” or “Molle 

attachments” on the lower 

half at the Deputy’s choice. 

(Pictures are available to 

serve as exemplars of what 

each carrier should look like) 

Small $149.95 

 

M $149.95 

 

L $149.95 

 

XL $149.95 

Small $149.95 

 

M $149.95 

 

L $149.95 

 

XL $149.95 NO BID NO BID 

Small 

$160.00 

 

M $160.00 

 

L $160.00 

 

XL $160.00 

Small 

$165.00 

 

M $165.00 

 

L $165.00 

 

XL $165.00 

Small $170.00 

 

M $170.00 

 

L $170.00 

 

XL $170.00 

Small $175.00 

 

M $175.00 

 

L $175.00 

 

XL $175.00 

Option 2 –  

One concealable navy carrier. 

Small $61.50 

 

M $61.50 

 

L $61.50 

 

XL $61.50 

Small $61.50 

 

M $61.50 

 

L $61.50 

 

XL $61.50 NO BID NO BID 

Small $60.00 

 

M $60.00 

 

L $60.00 

 

XL $60.00 

Small $63.00 

 

M $63.00 

 

L $63.00 

 

XL $63.00 

Small $66.50 

 

M $66.50 

 

L $66.50 

 

XL $66.50 

Small $70.00 

 

M $70.00 

 

L $70.00 

 

XL $70.00 

         

 % % % % % % % % 

Exceptions? NO  SEE BID; bid Safariland 2.0 Armor 

 

 

 

 



                                                  
SUMMARY SHEET Date:  June 21, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing            Bid: 17-27 Body Armor / Court Security & Patrol 
 

Unofficial Results 

 

 VENDOR  

NAME 

CITY/STATE BOB BARKER COMPANY INC 

FUQUAY-VARINA NC 
 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE YES  

MANDATORY PAGES YES  

SAMPLES INCLUDED? YES  

 

Yr I 

12/1/17-

11/30/18 

Yr II 

(optional) 

12/1/18-

11/30/19 

Yr III 

(optional) 

12/1/19-

11/30/20 

Yr IV (optional) 

12/1/20-11/30/21 
    

Patrol Deputies / Court Security (Male)       

Level II Body Armor - Less 

than .90 lbs/sq ft. Less than 

.25 in thick and meet or 

exceed the minimum 

specifications for Level II 

Armor as detailed in NIJ 

Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – 

Body Armor Classification. 

Must meet all specifications 

as listed in Appendix A – 

Level II Body Armor 

Small $617.99 

 

M $617.99 

 

L $617.99 

 

XL $617.99 

Small $630.35 

 

M $630.35 

 

L $630.35 

 

XL $630.35 

Small $636.53 

 

M $636.53 

 

L $636.53 

 

XL $636.53 

Small $636.53 

 

M $636.53 

 

L $636.53 

 

XL $636.53     

Level II Body Armor - Less 

than .85 lbs/sq ft. Less than 

.25 in thick and meet or 

exceed the minimum 

specifications for Level II 

Armor as detailed in NIJ 

Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – 

Body Armor Classification. 

Must meet all specifications 

as listed in Appendix A – 

Level II Body Armor 

Small $517.99 

 

M $517.99 

 

L $517.99 

 

XL $517.99 

Small $528.35 

 

M $528.35 

 

L $528.35 

 

XL $528.35 

Small $533.53 

 

M $533.53 

 

L $533.53 

 

XL $533.53 

Small $533.53 

 

M $533.53 

 

L $533.53 

 

XL $533.53     

Level II Body Armor - Less 

than .80 lbs/sq ft. Less than 

.25 in thick and meet or 

exceed the minimum 

specifications for Level II 

Armor as detailed in NIJ 

Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – 

Small $517.99 

 

M $517.99 

 

L $517.99 

 

XL $517.99 

Small $528.35 

 

M $528.35 

 

L $528.35 

 

XL $528.35 

Small $533.53 

 

M $533.53 

 

L $533.53 

 

XL $533.53 

Small $533.53 

 

M $533.53 

 

L $533.53 

 

XL $533.53     



                                                  
SUMMARY SHEET Date:  June 21, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing            Bid: 17-27 Body Armor / Court Security & Patrol 
 

Unofficial Results 

Body Armor Classification. 

Must meet all specifications 

as listed in Appendix A – 

Level II Body Armor 

Option I –  

Two concealable carriers in 

navy blue. $657.99 $671.15 $677.73 $677.73     

Option 2  with External 

Carrier– 

One external carrier, uniform 

shirt style, in Navy Blue with 

sown on embroidered badge 

(to be supplied by MCSO to 

vendor), custom fit to panels. 

External Carrier can come 

with  a set (a set being 2 

pockets) of either “Chicago 

pockets” or “Molle 

attachments” on the lower 

half at the Deputy’s choice. 

(Pictures are available to 

serve as exemplars of what 

each carrier should look like) 

Small $98.20 

 

M $98.20 

 

L $98.20 

 

XL $98.20 

Small $100.16 

 

M $100.16 

 

L $100.16 

 

XL $100.16 

Small $101.15 

 

M $101.15 

 

L $101.15 

 

XL $101.15 

Small $101.15 

 

M $101.15 

 

L $101.15 

 

XL $101.15     

Option 2 –  

One concealable navy carrier $78.20 $79.76 $80.55 $80.55     

  



                                                  
SUMMARY SHEET Date:  June 21, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing            Bid: 17-27 Body Armor / Court Security & Patrol 
 

Unofficial Results 

         

Patrol Deputies / Court Security (Female)       

Level II Body Armor - Less 

than .90 lbs/sq ft. Less than 

.25 in thick and meet or 

exceed the minimum 

specifications for Level II 

Armor as detailed in NIJ 

Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – 

Body Armor Classification. 

Must meet all specifications 

as listed in Appendix A – 

Level II Body Armor 

Small $617.99 

 

M $617.99 

 

L $617.99 

 

XL $617.99 

Small $630.35 

 

M $630.35 

 

L $630.35 

 

XL $630.35 

Small $636.53 

 

M $636.53 

 

L $636.53 

 

XL $636.53 

Small $636.53 

 

M $636.53 

 

L $636.53 

 

XL $636.53     

Level II Body Armor - Less 

than .85 lbs/sq ft. Less than 

.25 in thick and meet or 

exceed the minimum 

specifications for Level II 

Armor as detailed in NIJ 

Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – 

Body Armor Classification. 

Must meet all specifications 

as listed in Appendix A – 

Level II Body Armor 

Small $517.99 

 

M $517.99 

 

L $517.99 

 

XL $517.99 

Small $528.35 

 

M $528.35 

 

L $528.35 

 

XL $528.35 

Small $533.53 

 

M $533.53 

 

L $533.53 

 

XL $533.53 

Small $533.53 

 

M $533.53 

 

L $533.53 

 

XL $533.53     

Level II Body Armor - Less 

than .80 lbs/sq ft. Less than 

.25 in thick and meet or 

exceed the minimum 

specifications for Level II 

Armor as detailed in NIJ 

Standard 0101.06 Section 2 – 

Body Armor Classification. 

Must meet all specifications 

as listed in Appendix A – 

Level II Body Armor 

Small $517.99 

 

M $517.99 

 

L $517.99 

 

XL $517.99 

Small $528.35 

 

M $528.35 

 

L $528.35 

 

XL $528.35 

Small $533.53 

 

M $533.53 

 

L $533.53 

 

XL $533.53 

Small $533.53 

 

M $533.53 

 

L $533.53 

 

XL $533.53     

 

        



                                                  
SUMMARY SHEET Date:  June 21, 2017 

County of McHenry Purchasing            Bid: 17-27 Body Armor / Court Security & Patrol 
 

Unofficial Results 

Option I –  

Two concealable carriers in 

navy blue 

Small $657.99 

 

M $657.99 

 

L $657.99 

 

XL $657.99 

Small $671.15 

 

M $671.15 

 

L $671.15 

 

XL $671.15 

Small $677.73 

 

M $677.73 

 

L $677.73 

 

XL $677.73 

Small $677.73 

 

M $677.73 

 

L $677.73 

 

XL $677.73     

Option 2  with External 

Carrier– 

One external carrier, uniform 

shirt style, in Navy Blue with 

sown on embroidered badge 

(to be supplied by MCSO to 

vendor), custom fit to panels. 

External Carrier can come 

with a set (a set being 2 

pockets) of either “Chicago 

pockets” or “Molle 

attachments” on the lower 

half at the Deputy’s choice. 

(Pictures are available to 

serve as exemplars of what 

each carrier should look like) 

Small $98.20 

 

M $98.20 

 

L $98.20 

 

XL $98.20 

Small $100.16 

 

M $100.16 

 

L $100.16 

 

XL $100.16 

Small $101.15 

 

M $101.15 

 

L $101.15 

 

XL $101.15 

Small $101.15 

 

M $101.15 

 

L $101.15 

 

XL $101.15     

Option 2 –  

One concealable navy carrier. 

Small: $78.20 

 

M $78.20 

 

L $78.20 

 

XL $78.20 

Small: $79.76 

 

M $79.76 

 

L $79.76 

 

XL $79.76 

Small: $80.55 

 

M $80.55 

 

L $80.55 

 

XL $80.55 

Small: $80.55 

 

M $80.55 

 

L $80.55 

 

XL $80.55     

TOTAL         

Exceptions? none  

Sent to 16 potential bidders. Submittals received from 5. 
 

 

 

 


