
                                                  

SUMMARY SHEET Date: 11/16/16 

County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 16-87 Misc Supplies for VH 
 

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS 

 VENDOR VENDOR 

Vendor 
City/State 

DIRECT SUPPLY 
MILWAUKEE WI 

MEDLINE 
NORTHFIELD IL 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE YES YES 

Mandatory Pages? YES YES 

Exceptions?   

 Base Year Year II Optional Year III Optional 
Year IV 
Optional 

Base Year Year II Optional Year III Optional 
Year IV 
Optional 

Wheel Lock Extension 6" 
Steel Black Tip (1 Pair) 

$14.29    $11.50 $11.73 $11.96 $12.20 

Wheelchair Cushions - 
Support Pro Zero 
Elevation Flat Cushion 
16"W x 16"D 

$48.99    $38.26 $39.03 $39.81 $40.61 

Express Comfort Foam 
Cushion - 2" Thick 18"W 
x 16"D 

$24.99    $11.99 $12.23 $12.47 $12.72 

Wheelchair Footrest Bag 
- 16"W x 22"L 

$20.99    $8.39 $8.56 $8.73 $8.90 

Wheel 22" Urethane with 
Black Andozied Handrim 
for Sx5RC 

$141.60    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Trex2 – Wheelchair $254.99    $97.20 $99.10 $101.08 $103.10 

Black Hand rim Toggle 
Wheel Lock Silver Vein 
Pull to Lock Wheel Black 
Vinyl 20" Composite 
Back Height 16" Hemi 

No Bid    $7.72 $7.87 $8.03 $8.19 

Replacement Attendant 
Pad - Bed 10" x 30" - 
Straight Cord 

$35.99    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Replacement USB Safe 
Trelease Cord for Smart 
Pads 

$8.79    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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Plastic Security Clips fr 
1/4 Call Cords – case 

$13.99    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Bedside Mat - Bi-Folding 
36"W x 68"L x 2"H 

$67.99    $78.10 $79.66 $81.25 $82.88 

Outlet Bacteria Filter for 
Invacare Platinum and 
Perfecto2 Oxygen 
Concentrators 

$4.89    $2.38 $2.43 $2.48 $2.53 

Humidifier Bottle 
Assembly for Invacare 
Oxygen Concentrators 

$4.19    $2.38 $2.43 $2.48 $2.53 

Cabinet Filter for 
Invacare Perfecto2 
Oxygen Concentrators – 
case 

$10.79    $4.39 $4.48 $4.57 $4.66 

Cabinet Filter for 
Invacare Platinum 
Oxygen Concentrators – 
case 

$7.89    $9.50 $9.69 $9.88 $10.08 

Compressor Inlet Filter 
for Invacare Platinum 
and Perfecto2 Oxygen 
Concentrators 

$14.99    $65.74 $67.05 $68.39 $69.76 

Dinnerware 10" Dinner 
Plates - Green Rim – Case 

$207.99    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Dinner Plate 10" 
Diameter Round Wide 
Rim Fully Tempered 
Microwave safe Glass - 
Arcoroc Opal Brush 
Orang White with Orange 
Rim – case 

$277.33    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Reacher 32" $10.39    $6.44 $6.57 $6.70 $6.83 

Lateral Stabilizer 
Armrest Bolster - 
Polyester Cover – Case 

$57.99    $28.59 $26.16 $29.74 $30.33 
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Replacement Pump for 
Panacea Air APL 
Mattress 

$258.22    $70.40 $71.81 $73.25 $74.72 

Linen Cart - Medium - 
Cover - Handles - 2 
Shelves - Mesh Fabric - 
Forest Green 

$224.99    $247.90 $252.86 $257.92 $263.08 

NYO Arm Skin Sleeve - Lg 
- XLg - Med – Pair 

$9.99    $6.26 $6.39 $6.52 $6.65 

Replacement Blade 
Assembly for a Blixer 3 - 
Series D 

$174.99    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Lid Assembly with Seal 
for Blixer 3 - Series D 
Only 

$157.99    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

V-Trode 2" Square Self-
Adhesive Electrodes 

$46.99    $17.91 $18.27 $18.64 $19.01 

2" x 103ft W/R Bulk Roll 
Kinesio Tex Gold Tape – 
Black 

$85.99    $1,349.00 $1,375.98 $1,403.50 $1,431.57 

Braun PRO 6000 
Tympanic Thermometer 
w/ Wall Mount Cradle 

$240.99    $14.18 $14.46 $14.76 $15.06 

TOTALS     $2,314.73 $2,360.99 $2,408.21 $2,456.44 

Date of delivery after 
receipt of purchase order. 

  

Savings   

Sent to 11 potential bidders. Submittals received from 2. 


