McHENRY COUNTY PURCHASING

SUMMARY SHEET

DATE:
BID:

NOVEMBER 5,2015

15-102 MED & NURSE SUPPLIES

. PROFESSIONAL
1% Choice HENRY SCHEIN INTERBORO MAXMED MEDLINE MOORE MEDICAL MEDICAL
Location YES YES YES YES YES
Mandatory Pages YES YES YES YES YES
Original Signature YES NON - RESPONSIVE YES YES YES NON - RESPONSIVE YES
initialed at Bottom YES YES YES YES YES
Samples YES YES YES YES YES
BASE YEAR
Cannot be calculated Select Itemns Bid On
GRAND TOTAL as we'll sell some: No BID See Submittal 3,735.72 1,702.50
[PER BOXI products In eaches
Cannot be calculated Select Items Bid On
GRAND TOTAL as we’ll sell some No BID See Submittal 6,956.58 6,395.10
[PER CASE] products in eaches
OPTYRII
Select ltems Bld On
GR[’;;EBTSI]AL No BID No BID see Submital 3,735.72 1,702.50
Select ltems Bid On ‘
G'{*:;DC;‘;E?L No BID NoBID See Sobnittal 6,956.58 6,395.10
OPTYRII
Select items Bid On
GF}?ERD ;SLAL NoBID No BID See Submittal 3,735.72 1,702.50
Select (tems Bid On
G ?:;DCLCS)Z?L No BID No BID See Submittal 6,956.58 6,395.10
BASE YEAR
TOTAL rziﬁa;zoez )GLOVES 25.06 32.30 No BID 37.137 31.30
OPTYRI
TOTAL iiﬁ&;&z )GLOVES 25.06 37.16 No BID 37.137 31.30
OPTYRIN
TOTAL PRICE FOR GLOVES 25 06 07N No BID 37.137 31.30
ar N/A N/A N/A N/A 32,188.311 - N/A 24,386.70
SAVINGS Select Items 0 Select Items Select Items Select ltems 0 7,801.61

Sent to 14 vendors. Received 7 responses.
** BID is multiple awardee BID.




