County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

SUMMARY SHEET

Date: 11/12/2015 @ 2:00

Bid/RFP: Bid 15-104 Provide Body Armor for Sheriff Dept

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
VENDOR 15T RESPONDERS GALLS KPS
CITY/STATE ELGIN IL LEXINGTON KY JEFFERSONVILLE IN
ORIGINAL SIGNATURE YES YES YES
MANDATORY PAGES YES YES YES
SAMPLES PROVIDED YES YES YES
Base 1%t Option | 2" Option Base 1%t Option | 2" Option Base 1%t Option | 2" Option
Year Year Year Year Year Year Year Year Year
12/01/15- 12/01/16- 12/01/17- 12/01/15- 12/01/16- 12/01/17- 12/01/15 - 12/01/16- 12/01/17-
11/30/16 11/30/17 11/30/18 11/30/16 11/30/17 11/30/18 11/30/16 11/30/17 11/30/18
Patrol Deputies / Court Security (Male) — All quantities are 1
Level Il Body Armor - Less than Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
.90 Ibs/sqft. Less than .25 in thick $425.00 $438.00 $450.00 $425.00 $425.00 $425.00 $551.00 TBD TBD
and meet or exceed the minimum || Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
specifications for Level Il Armor $425.00 $438.00 $450.00 $425.00 $425.00 $425.00 $551.00 TBD TBD
as detailed in NIJ Standard Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
0101.06 Section 2 —Body Armor $425.00 $438.00 $450.00 $425.00 $425.00 $425.00 $551.00 TBD TBD
Classification. Must meet all Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
specifications as listed in $425.00 $438.00 $450.00 $425.00 $425.00 $425.00 $551.00 TBD TBD
Appendix A — Level Il Body Armor
Level Il Body Armor - Less than Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
.85 lbs/sqft. Less than .25 in thick $509.00 $524.00 $539.00 $585.00 $585.00 $585.00
and meet or exceed the minimum || Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
specifications for Level Il Armor $509.00 $524.00 $539.00 $585.00 $585.00 $585.00
as detailed in NIJ Standard Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large No Bid No Bid No Bid
0101.06 Section 2 — Body Armor $509.00 $524.00 $539.00 $585.00 $585.00 $585.00
Classification. Must meet all Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
specifications as listed in $509.00 $524.00 $539.00 $585.00 $585.00 $585.00
Appendix A — Level Il Body Armor
Level Il Body Armor - Less than Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
.80 Ibs/sqft. Less than .25 in thick $509.00 $524.00 $539.00 $635.00 $635.00 $635.00
and meet or exceed the minimum || Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
specifications for Level Il Armor $509.00 $524.00 $539.00 $635.00 $635.00 $635.00
as detailed in NIJ Standard Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large No Bid No Bid No Bid
0101.06 Section 2 — Body Armor $509.00 $524.00 $539.00 $635.00 $635.00 $635.00
Classification. Must meet all Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
specifications as listed in $509.00 $524.00 $539.00 $635.00 $635.00 $635.00
Appendix A — Level Il Body Armor

UNOFFICAL RESULTS




County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

SUMMARY SHEET

Date: 11/12/2015 @ 2:00

Bid/RFP: Bid 15-104 Provide Body Armor for Sheriff Dept

Option | = Two concealable $525.00 $525.00 $525.00
carriers in navy blue. $164.00 $164.00 $164.00 $685.00 $685.00 $685.00 $57.00 TBD TBD
$735.00 $735.00 $735.00
Option 2 with External Carrier—
One external carrier, uniform
shirt style, in Navy Blue with
sown on embroidered badge (to
be supplied by MCSO to vendor),
m fi nels. External
(é:srtr?er catntzo‘::e?/vsith "t(?hic‘:\go »590.00 »590.00 »590.00
y ” $165.00 $173.00 $182.00 $735.00 $735.00 $735.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
pockets” or “Molle attachments $795.00 $795.00 $795.00
on the lower half at the Deputy’s ’ ’ ’
choice. (Pictures are available to
serve as exemplars of what each
carrier should look like)
Saprtr'i:: 2~ One concealable navy || g, o, $82.00 $82.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $57.00 TBD 8D
Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
$1,443.00 $1,486.00 $1,528.00 $1,645.00 $1,645.00 $1,645.00 $551.00 TBD TBD
Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
TOTAL Body Armor Only $_1,443.00 $.1,486.00 $.1,528.00 $_1,645.00 $.1,645.00 $.1,645.00 $§51.00 T?D TBD
Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
$1,443.00 $1,486.00 $1,528.00 $1,645.00 $1,645.00 $1,645.00 $551.00 TBD TBD
Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
$1,443.00 $1,486.00 $1,528.00 $1,645.00 $1,645.00 $1,645.00 $551.00 TBD TBD
Patrol Deputies / Court Security (Female) — All quantities are 1
Level Il Body Armor - Less than Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
.90 Ibs/sqft. Less than .25 in thick | $478.00 $491.00 $506.00 $425.00 $425.00 $425.00 $551.00 TBD TBD
and meet or exceed the minimum || Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
specifications for Level Il Armor $478.00 $491.00 $506.00 $425.00 $425.00 $425.00 $551.00 TBD TBD
as detailed in NIJ Standard Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
0101.06 Section 2 —Body Armor $478.00 $491.00 $506.00 $425.00 $425.00 $425.00 $551.00 TBD TBD
Classification. Must meet all Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
specifications as listed in $4.78.00 $491.00 $506.00 $425.00 $425.00 $425.00 $551.00 TBD TBD
Appendix A — Level || Body Armor
Level Il Body Armor - Less than Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
.85 lbs/sqft. Less than .25 in thick | $600.00 $619.00 $636.00 $585.00 $585.00 $585.00
and meet or exceed the minimum || Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
specifications for Level Il Armor $600.00 $619.00 $636.00 $585.00 $585.00 $585.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
as detailed in NIJ Standard Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
0101.06 Section 2 — Body Armor $600.00 $619.00 $636.00 $585.00 $585.00 $585.00
Classification. Must meet all Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large

UNOFFICAL RESULTS




County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

SUMMARY SHEET

Date: 11/12/2015 @ 2:00

Bid/RFP: Bid 15-104 Provide Body Armor for Sheriff Dept

specifications as listed in $600.00 $619.00 $636.00 $585.00 $585.00 $585.00
Appendix A — Level Il Body Armor
Level Il Body Armor - Less than Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
.80 lbs/sqft. Less than .25 in thick | $833.00 $858.00 $884.00 $635.00 $635.00 $635.00
and meet or exceed the minimum || Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
specifications for Level Il Armor $833.00 $858.00 $884.00 $635.00 $635.00 $635.00
as detailed in NIJ Standard Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large No Bid No Bid No Bid
0101.06 Section 2 — Body Armor $833.00 $858.00 $884.00 $635.00 $635.00 $635.00
Classification. Must meet all Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
specifications as listed in $833.00 $858.00 $884.00 $635.00 $635.00 $635.00
Appendix A — Level Il Body Armor
Option | — Two concealable $525.00 $525.00 $525.00
carriers in navy blue. $234.00 $234.00 $234.00 $685.00 $685.00 $685.00 $114.00 TBD TBD
$735.00 $735.00 $735.00
Option 2 with External Carrier—
One external carrier, uniform
shirt style, in Navy Blue with
sown on embroidered badge (to
li M vendor
Ejsizipﬁi(tjobZanglss?;?tefnacllo g 2590.00 2590.00 2590.00 . . .
Carrier can come with “Chicago $165.00 $173.00 $182.00 $735.00 $735.00 $735.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
o ” $795.00 $795.00 $795.00
pockets” or “Molle attachments
on the lower half at the Deputy’s
choice. (Pictures are available to
serve as exemplars of what each
carrier should look like)
Option 2 — One concealable navy
carrier. $117.00 $117.00 $117.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $57.00 TBD TBD
Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
$1,911.00 $1,968.00 $2,026.00 $1,645.00 $1,645.00 $1,645.00 $551.00 TBD TBD
Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
TOTAL Body Armor Only $.1,911.00 $.1,968.00 $?,026.00 $.1,645.00 $.1,645.00 $.1,645.00 $.551.00 T?D T.BD
Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
$1,911.00 $1,968.00 $2,026.00 $1,645.00 $1,645.00 $1,645.00 $551.00 TBD TBD
Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
$1,911.00 $1,968.00 $2,026.00 $1,645.00 $1,645.00 $1,645.00 $551.00 TBD TBD
Correctional Officers / Transport Officers (Male) — All quantities are 1
Level Il Body Armor as specified in || Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
Section 1 of Appendix A. Must || $674.00 $697.00 $721.00 S S S $551.00 TBD TBD
meet or exceed the minimum || Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
specifications for Level Il armoras || $674.00 $697.00 $721.00 S S S $551.00 TBD TBD
detailed in NIJ Standard 0101.06 |[ Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large

UNOFFICAL RESULTS




County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

SUMMARY SHEET

Date: 11/12/2015 @ 2:00

Bid/RFP: Bid 15-104 Provide Body Armor for Sheriff Dept

Section 2 —Body Armor || $674.00 $697.00 $721.00 S S S $551.00 TBD TBD
Classification. Provide full torso || Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
coverage, with front to back || $674.00 $697.00 $721.00 S S S $551.00 TBD TBD
overlap of ballistic panels. Trauma *$590.00 *$590.00 *$590.00
plate to be included. External $735.00 $735.00 $735.00
Uniform style carrier — Black $795.00 $795.00 $795.00
Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
$674.00 $697.00 $721.00 $551.00 TBD TBD
Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
$674.00 $697.00 $721.00 . . . $551.00 TBD TBD
TOTAL Body Armor Only Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large *See Bid *See Bid *See Bid Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
$674.00 $697.00 $721.00 $551.00 TBD TBD
Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
$674.00 $697.00 $721.00 $551.00 TBD TBD
Correctional Officers / Transport Officers (Female) — All quantities are 1
Level Il Body Armor as specified in Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
Section 1 of Appendix A. Must $765.00 $792.00 $818.00 S S S $551.00 TBD TBD
meet or exceed the minimum Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
specifications for Level Il armor as || $765.00 $792.00 $818.00 S S S $551.00 TBD TBD
detailed in NIJ Standard 0101.06 Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
Section 2 — Body Armor $765.00 $792.00 $818.00 S S S $551.00 TBD TBD
Classification. Provide full torso Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
coverage, with front to back $765.00 $792.00 $818.00 S S S $551.00 TBD TBD
overlap of ballistic panels. *$590.00 *$590.00 *$590.00
Trauma plate to be included. $735.00 $735.00 $735.00
External Uniform style carrier - $795.00 $795.00 $795.00
Black
Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
$765.00 $792.00 $818.00 $551.00 TBD TBD
Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
TOTALBody Armor Only || 275 3792.00 5818.00 *See Bid *See Bid *See Bid »551.00 T80 180
Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
$765.00 $792.00 $818.00 $551.00 TBD TBD
Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
$765.00 $792.00 $818.00 $551.00 TBD TBD
SWAT (Male) — All quantities are 1
SAPI CUT PLATE CARRIER — Must Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
include and meet or exceed all $525.00 $525.00 $525.00
specifications listed in Appendix A Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
under SWAT Plate / Armor Carrier || No Bid No Bid No Bid $525.00 $525.00 $525.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
$525.00 $525.00 $525.00
Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large

UNOFFICAL RESULTS




County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

SUMMARY SHEET

Date: 11/12/2015 @ 2:00

Bid/RFP: Bid 15-104 Provide Body Armor for Sheriff Dept

$525.00 $525.00 $525.00
CUMMBERBUND BALLISTIC Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
PANELS INSERTS — Must include $176.00 $176.00 $176.00
and meet or exceed all Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
specifications listed in Appendix A ) ) . $176.00 $176.00 $176.00 . . .
under SWAT Plate / Armor Carrier No Bid No Bid No Bid Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large No Bid No Bid No Bid
$176.00 $176.00 $176.00
Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
$176.00 $176.00 $176.00
BALLISTIC PLATES — Must include Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
and meet or exceed all $447.00 $447.00 $447.00
specifications listed in Appendix A Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
under SWAT Plate / Armor Carrier No Bid No Bid No Bid $_447.00 $.447.00 $.447.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
$447.00 $447.00 $447.00
Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
$447.00 $447.00 $447.00
POUCHES - Must include and M4 Mag-$110.00 M4 Mag-$110.00 M4 Mag-$110.00
meet or exceed all specifications . . . One Grid-$67.00 |One Grid-$67.00 [One Grid-$67.00 . . .
listed in Appendix A under SWAT No Bid No Bid No Bid Portable-$49.00 |Portable-$49.00 |Portable-$49.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Plate / Armor Carrier SelfSid-$75.00 SelfSid-$75.00 SelfSid-$75.00
Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
S S S $223.00 $223.00 $223.00 S S S
Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
S S S $223.00 $223.00 $223.00 S S S
TOTAL Body Armor Only Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
S S S $223.00 $223.00 $223.00 S S S
Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
S S S $223.00 $223.00 $223.00 S S S
SWAT (Female) — All quantities are 1
SAPI CUT PLATE CARRIER — Must Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
include and meet or exceed all $525.00 $525.00 $525.00
specifications listed in Appendix A Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
under SWAT Plate / Armor Carrier No Bid No Bid No Bid $§25.00 $§25.00 5.525.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
$525.00 $525.00 $525.00
Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
$525.00 $525.00 $525.00

UNOFFICAL RESULTS




County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

SUMMARY SHEET

Date: 11/12/2015 @ 2:00

Bid/RFP: Bid 15-104 Provide Body Armor for Sheriff Dept

CUMMBERBUND BALLISTIC Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
PANELS INSERTS — Must include $176.00 $176.00 $176.00
and meet or exceed all Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
specifications listed in Appendix A . . . $176.00 $176.00 $176.00 . . .
under SWAT Plate / Armor Carrier No Bid No Bid No Bid Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large No Bid No Bid No Bid
$176.00 $176.00 $176.00
Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
$176.00 $176.00 $176.00
BALLISTIC PLATES — Must include Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
and meet or exceed all $447.00 $447.00 $447.00
specifications listed in Appendix A Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
under SWAT Plate / Armor Carrier || No Bid No Bid No Bid $447.00 $447.00 $447.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
$447.00 $447.00 $447.00
Size: X-Large $ Size: X-Large $ Size: X-Large $
POUCHES - Must include and M4 Mag-$110.00 M4 Mag-$110.00 M4 Mag-$110.00
meet or exceed all specifications . . . One Grid-$67.00 |One Grid-$67.00 |One Grid-$67.00 . . .
listed in Appendix A under SWAT || N© Bid No Bid No Bid Portable-349.00 |Portable-$49.00 |Portable-629.00 | '\© B No Bid No Bid
Plate / Armor Carrier SelfSid-$75.00 SelfSid-$75.00 SelfSid-$75.00
Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
S S S $223.00 $223.00 $223.00 S S S
Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
S S S $223.00 $223.00 $223.00 S S S
TOTAL Body Armor Only Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
S S S $223.00 $223.00 $223.00 S S S
Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
S S S $223.00 $223.00 $223.00 S S S
Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
$ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $
Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
GRAND TOTAL $. S. S. $. s. S. S. s. S.
Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
$ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $
Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
$ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $

Sent to 10 potential bidders. Submittals received from 5.

UNOFFICAL RESULTS




County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

SUMMARY SHEET

Date: 11/12/2015 @ 2:00

Bid/RFP: Bid 15-104 Provide Body Armor for Sheriff Dept

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
VENDOR RAY O’'HERRON STREICHER’S INC
CITY/STATE DANVILLE IL PLYMOUTH MN
ORIGINAL SIGNATURE YES YES
MANDATORY PAGES YES YES
SAMPLES PROVIDED YES YES
Base 1%t Option | 2" Option Base 1%t Option | 2" Option Base 1%t Option 2"d Option
Year Year Year Year Year Year Year Year Year
12/01/15 - 12/01/16- 12/01/17- 12/01/15- 12/01/16- 12/01/17- 12/01/15 - 12/01/16- 12/01/17-
11/30/16 11/30/17 11/30/18 11/30/16 11/30/17 11/30/18 11/30/16 11/30/17 11/30/18

Patrol Deputies / Court Security (Male) — All quantities are 1
Level Il Body Armor - Less than .90 Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
Ibs/sqft. Less than .25 in thick and $573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $565.00 $575.00 $590.00
meet or exceed the minimum Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
specifications for Level Il Armor as $573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $565.00 $575.00 $590.00
detailed in NIJ Standard 0101.06 Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
Section 2 — Body Armor $573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $565.00 $575.00 $590.00
Classification. Must meet all Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
specifications as listed in Appendix $573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $565.00 $575.00 $590.00
A — Level Il Body Armor
Level Il Body Armor - Less than .85 Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
Ibs/sqft. Less than .25 in thick and $665.00 $675.00 $690.00
meet or exceed the minimum Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
specifications for Level Il Armor as $665.00 $675.00 $690.00
detailed in NIJ Standard 0101.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
Section 2 — Body Armor $665.00 $675.00 $690.00
Classification. Must meet all Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
specifications as listed in Appendix $665.00 $675.00 $690.00
A — Level Il Body Armor
Level Il Body Armor - Less than .80 Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
Ibs/sqgft. Less than .25 in thick and $825.00 $835.00 $850.00
meet or exceed the minimum Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
specifications for Level Il Armor as $825.00 $835.00 $850.00
detailed in NIJ Standard 0101.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
Section 2 — Body Armor $825.00 $835.00 $850.00
Classification. Must meet all Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
specifications as listed in Appendix $825.00 $835.00 $850.00
A —Level Il Body Armor
Option | — Two concealable carriers

UNOFFICAL RESULTS




County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

SUMMARY SHEET

Date: 11/12/2015 @ 2:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-104 Provide Body Armor for Sheriff Dept

Option 2 with External Carrier—
One external carrier, uniform shirt
style, in Navy Blue with sown on
embroidered badge (to be supplied

by MCSO to vendor), custom fit to $147.00 $147.00 $147.00
panels. External Carrier can come Chicago Chicago Chicago
with “Chicago pockets” or “Molle $101.33 $103.92 $106.58
attachments” on the lower half at $160.00 $160.00 $160.00
the Deputy’s choice. (Pictures are Molle Molle Molle
available to serve as exemplars of
what each carrier should look like)
Option 2 — One concealable navy
carrier. $531.00 $531.00 $531.00 $69.37 $71.10 $72.92
Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
$573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $2,055.00 $2,085.00 $2,130.00
Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
$573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $2,055.00 $2,085.00 $2,130.00
TOTAL Body Armor Only Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
$573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $2,055.00 $2,085.00 $2,130.00
Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
$573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $2,055.00 $2,085.00 $2,130.00
Patrol Deputies / Court Security (Female) — All quantities are 1
Level Il Body Armor - Less than .90 | Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
Ibs/sqgft. Less than .25 in thick and || $573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $565.00 $575.00 $590.00
meet or exceed the minimum | Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
specifications for Level Il Armor as || $573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $565.00 $575.00 $590.00
detailed in NIJ Standard 0101.06 |[ Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
Section 2 — Body Armor || $573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $565.00 $575.00 $590.00
Classification. Must meet all |[ Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
specifications as listed in Appendix || $573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $565.00 $575.00 $590.00
A — Level Il Body Armor
Level Il Body Armor - Less than .85 Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
Ibs/sqft. Less than .25 in thick and $665.00 $675.00 $690.00
meet or exceed the minimum Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
specifications for Level Il Armor as $665.00 $675.00 $690.00
detailed in NIJ Standard 0101.06 |[ No Bid No Bid No Bid Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
Section 2 — Body Armor $665.00 $675.00 $690.00
Classification. Must meet all Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
specifications as listed in Appendix $665.00 $675.00 $690.00

A — Level Il Body Armor
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plate to be included. External
Uniform style carrier — Black

Level Il Body Armor - Less than .80 Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
Ibs/sqft. Less than .25 in thick and $825.00 $835.00 $850.00
meet or exceed the minimum Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
specifications for Level Il Armor as $825.00 $835.00 $850.00
detailed in NIJ Standard 0101.06 |[ No Bid No Bid No Bid Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
Section 2 — Body Armor $825.00 $835.00 $850.00
Classification. Must meet all Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
specifications as listed in Appendix $825.00 $835.00 $850.00
A — Level Il Body Armor
Option | — Two concealable carriers
in navy blue. $573.00 $573.00 $573.00 569.33 $71.10 $72.92
Option 2 with External Carrier—
One external carrier, uniform shirt
style, in Navy Blue with sown on
embroidered badge (to be supplied || $147.00 $147.00 $147.00
by MCSO to vendor), custom fit to || Chicago Chicago Chicago
panels. External Carrier can come $101.33 $103.92 $106.58
with “Chicago pockets” or “Molle || $160.00 $160.00 $160.00
attachments” on the lower half at || Molle Molle Molle
the Deputy’s choice. (Pictures are
available to serve as exemplars of
what each carrier should look like)
Dar;tr'f;? 2~ One concealable navy $531.00 $531.00 $531.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
$573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $2,055.00 $2,085.00 $2,130.00
Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
$573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $2,055.00 $2,085.00 $2,130.00
TOTAL Body Armor Only Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
$573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $2,055.00 $2,085.00 $2,130.00
Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
$573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $2,055.00 $2,085.00 $2,130.00
Correctional Officers / Transport Officers (Male) — All quantities are 1
Level Il Body Armor as specified in Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
Section 1 of Appendix A. Must meet $573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $666.33 $678.92 $696.58
or exceed the minimum specifications || Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
for Level Il armor as detailed in NIJ $573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $666.33 $678.92 $696.58
Standard 0101.06 Section 2 — Body Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
Armor Classification. Provide full $573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $666.33 $678.92 $696.58
torso coverage, with front to back Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
overlap of ballistic panels. Trauma $573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $666.33 $678.92 $696.58
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Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
$573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $666.33 $678.92 $696.58
Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
$573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $666.33 $678.92 $696.58
TOTAL Body Armor Only Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
$573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $666.33 $678.92 $696.58
Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
$573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $666.33 $678.92 $696.58
Correctional Officers / Transport Officers (Female) — All quantities are 1
Level Il Body Armor as specified in Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
Section 1 of Appendix A. Must meet $573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $666.33 $678.92 $696.58
or exceed the minimum Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
specifications for Level Il armor as $573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $666.33 $678.92 $696.58
detailed in NIJ Standard 0101.06 Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
Section 2 — Body Armor $573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $666.33 $678.92 $696.58
Classification. Provide full torso Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
coverage, with front to back overlap | $573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $666.33 $678.92 $696.58
of ballistic panels. Trauma plate to
be included.. External Uniform style
carrier - Black
Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
$573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $666.33 $678.92 $696.58
Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
$573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $666.33 $678.92 $696.58
TOTAL Body Armor Only Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
$573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $666.33 $678.92 $696.58
Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
$573.00 $573.00 $596.00 $666.33 $678.92 $696.58
SWAT (Male) — All quantities are 1
SAPI CUT PLATE CARRIER — Must
include and meet or exceed all . . ) . . .
specifications listed in Appendix A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
under SWAT Plate / Armor Carrier
CUMMBERBUND BALLISTIC PANELS
INSERTS — Must include and meet or
exceed all specifications listed in || No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Appendix A under SWAT Plate /
Armor Carrier
BALLISTIC PLATES — Must include
and meet or exceed all | g4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

specifications listed in Appendix A
under SWAT Plate / Armor Carrier
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POUCHES - Must include and meet
or exceed all specifications listed in

Appendix A under SWAT Plate / No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Armor Carrier
TOTAL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SWAT (Female) — All quantities are 1
SAPI CUT PLATE CARRIER — Must
include and meet or exceed all | - g; No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
specifications listed in Appendix A
under SWAT Plate / Armor Carrier
CUMMBERBUND BALLISTIC PANELS
INSERTS — Must include and meet or
exceed all specifications listed in || No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Appendix A under SWAT Plate /
Armor Carrier
BALLISTIC PLATES — Must include
_andmeetorexceedall | \ g No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
specifications listed in Appendix A
under SWAT Plate / Armor Carrier
POUCHES - Must include and meet
or e:;iz‘:];:LT?J‘;'QZ?ZWZT"?E‘:G'? No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Armor Carrier
Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
S S $ S S S
Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
TOTAL S. S. $. S. s. s.
Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
$ $ $ $ S S
Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
$ $ $ $ $ $
Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small Size: Small
$ $ $ $ $ $
Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium Size Medium
S S S S S S
GRAND TOTAL Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large Size: Large
$ $ $ $ $ $
Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large Size: X-Large
$ $ $ $ $ $

Sent to 10 potential bidders. Submittals received from 5.
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