SUMMARY SHEET Date: 11/24/15
County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 15-108 VH Linen Re-Bid
VENDOR VENDOR
Vendor CALDERON TEXTILES
City/State INDIANAPOLIS IN HP PRODUCTS
ORIGINAL SIGNATURE YES Non Responsive/Non Responsible
Mandatory Pages? YES *with exceptions No Samples Resceived for Bid 15-108
Samples Provided? YES
BASE YEAR Option Year I1 Option Year III BASE YEAR Option Year I1 Option Year III
MALHI:?ASEARI:&LNTTP?::\:\-IIL\?SEES 12/1/15 - 12/1/16 - 12/1/17 - 12/1/15- 12/1/16 - 12/1/17 -
11/30/16 11/30/17 11/30/18 11/30/16 11/30/17 11/30/18
Pillowcase T/180 White —55 Ctn/45 Poly $1.1875 * $1.1875 * $1.1875 *
Ambassador *Equivalent *Equivalent *Equivalent
Patient Gown Overlap Ties — Blue Snowflake
On White — Drill $3.833 $3.833 $3.833
*Need to be 55 cotton/45 poly cap sleeve
Underpad Pebble Beach — Twill Bonded —All 1 $64.50 * $64.50 * $64.50 *

Ply
*poly cotton face 10 oz. soaker

*8 0z soaker

*8 0z soaker

*8 0z soaker

. . $35.00 * $35.00 * $35.00 *
Wheelchair Pad F —Brush
o ‘;ggr;"zloatﬁ enix ~Brushed *Not FOB *Not FOB *Not FOB
P destination destination destination
Clothing Protector White — Terry Ex Tie Closure
*12 oz. Perry 100% Cotton »31.00 »31.00 »31.00
R $10.85 * $10.85 * $10.85 *
Hand T | Ever-Dri White — 86/14 Cot/Pol
and fowel tver-on e / ot/Poly *Equivalent *Equivalent *Equivalent
- $3.85 * $3.85 * $3.85 *
Washcloth Ever-Dri White — 86/14 Cot/Pol
ashcloth Ever-brl e / ot/Poly *Equivalent *Equivalent *Equivalent

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS




SUMMARY SHEET Date: 11/24/15
County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 15-108 VH Linen Re-Bid
Bar Mop— White Ribbed S4.76 $S4.76 $4.76
Blankets — Microloft or Vellux (twin) 100% $151.20 * $151.20 * $151.20 *
polyester microfiber/microloft *Equivalent *Equivalent *Equivalent
o . $67.50 * $67.50 * $67.50 *
Flat Sheets —100% Cotton Unbleached (twin) *Micro Fiber *Micro Fiber *Micro Fiber
o $61.00 * $61.00 * $61.00 *
Draw Sheet Sateen —100% Cotton Unbleached *Micro Fiber *Micro Fiber *Micro Fiber
. . L, | $13.50 * $13.50 * $13.50 *
Bath Towel White — 86/14 Blend “Ambassador *Equivalent *Equivalent *Equivalent
Bath Towel Rose — 86/14 Blend $74.40 $74.40 $74.40
Stretch Sheet—
55/45 Cotton/Poly 19 Oz $56.00 $56.00 $56.00
*need to have deep stretch pockets because
we have multiple size beds
E!li(;:/ Nylon Wipeable — Fluid Resistant Lt $4.90 $4.90 $4.90

Sent to 8 potential bidders. Submittals received from 5.

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS




SUMMARY SHEET Date: 11/24/15
County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 15-108 VH Linen Re-Bid
VENDOR VENDOR
Vendor MATERIAL IMPORTS MEDLINE
City/State LITTLE FAIRY NJ MUNDELEIN IL
ORIGINAL SIGNATURE YES YES
Mandatory Pages? YES YES
Samples Provided? YES YES
BASE YEAR Option Year I1 Option Year III BASE YEAR Option Year I1 Option Year III
MA.:(H:I?A:ISEARII\:lfL’:‘rTP?::\kllelngES 12/1/15 - 12/1/16 - 12/1/17 - 12/1/15- 12/1/16 - 12/1/17 -
11/30/16 11/30/17 11/30/18 11/30/16 11/30/17 11/30/18

Pillowcase T/180 White —55 Ctn/45 Poly $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00
Ambassador
Patient Gown Overlap Ties — Blue Snowflake
On White — Drill $2.99 $2.99 $2.99 $2.92 $2.92 $2.92
*Need to be 55 cotton/45 poly cap sleeve
Underpad Pebble Beach — Twill Bonded —All 1
Ply $54.99 $54.99 $54.99 $51.84 $51.84 $51.84
*poly cotton face 10 oz. soaker
Wheelchair Pad Fenix ~Brushed No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.60 $30.60 $30.60
Top/Boradcloth
Clothing Protector White — Terry Ex Tie Closure
%12 oz. Perry 100% Cotton 19.99 19.99 19.99 $28.20 $28.20 $28.20
Hand Towel Ever-Dri White — 86/14 Cot/Poly $6.79 $6.79 $6.79 $8.90 $8.90 $8.90
Washcloth Ever-Dri White — 86/14 Cot/Poly $2.99 $2.99 $2.99 $2.88 $2.88 $2.88

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS




SUMMARY SHEET Date: 11/24/15
County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 15-108 VH Linen Re-Bid

Bar Mop— White Ribbed $3.69 $3.69 $3.69 $4.84 $4.84 $4.84
o . 0

Blankets — Microloft or Vellux (twin) 100% No Bid No Bid No Bid $81.60 $81.60 $81.60

polyester microfiber/microloft

Flat Sheets —100% Cotton Unbleached (twin) No Bid No Bid No Bid $46.00 $46.00 $46.00

Draw Sheet Sateen —100% Cotton Unbleached | No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.88 $44.88 $44.88

Bath Towel White — 86/14 Blend “Ambassador” || $12.79 $12.79 $12.79 $14.98 $14.98 $14.98

Bath Towel Rose — 86/14 Blend No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.32 $28.32 $28.32

Stretch Sheet—

55/45 Cotton/Poly 19 0z $37.99 $37.99 $37.99 $47.52 $47.52 $47.52

*need to have deep stretch pockets because

we have multiple size beds

E!'i‘;:’ Nylon Wipeable ~Fluid Resistant Lt No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.10 $4.10 $4.10

Sent to 8 potential bidders. Submittals received from 5.

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS



SUMMARY SHEET Date: 11/24/15
County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 15-108 VH Linen Re-Bid
VENDOR VENDOR
Vendor PARADISE PILLOW PHOENIX TEXTILE
City/State PHILIDELPHIA PA O’FALLON MO
ORIGINAL SIGNATURE Non Responsive/Non Responsible VES
Mandatory Pages? No Samples Resceived for Bid 15-108 YES
Samples Provided? YES
BASE YEAR Option Year I1 Option Year III BASE YEAR Option Year I1 Option Year III
MA.:-(HI-II?A:ISEARII\:SLNTIIP?::\II;IIL\?:SEES 12/1/15 - 12/1/16 - 12/1/17 - 12/1/15- 12/1/16 - 12/1/17 -
11/30/16 11/30/17 11/30/18 11/30/16 11/30/17 11/30/18

Pillowcase T/180 White —55 Ctn/45 Poly $1.103
Ambassador Only in dozen N/A N/A
Patient Gown Overlap Ties — Blue Snowflake $3.496
On White — Drill On.I in dozen N/A N/A
*Need to be 55 cotton/45 poly cap sleeve y
Underpad Pebble Beach — Twill Bonded —All 1
Ply $77.93 N/A N/A
*poly cotton face 10 oz. soaker
Wheelchair Pad Fenix — Brushed
Top/Boradcloth $41.33 N/A N/A
Clothing Protector White — Terry Ex Tie Closure
*12 oz. Perry 100% Cotton »28.74 N/A N/A
Hand Towel Ever-Dri White — 86/14 Cot/Poly $12.99 N/A N/A
Washcloth Ever-Dri White — 86/14 Cot/Poly $3.25 N/A N/A

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS




SUMMARY SHEET Date: 11/24/15
County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 15-108 VH Linen Re-Bid

Bar Mop— White Ribbed $5.33 N/A N/A
Blankets — Microloft or Vellux (twin) 100%

polyester microfiber/microloft »154.20 N/A N/A
Flat Sheets —100% Cotton Unbleached (twin) $58.95 N/A N/A
Draw Sheet Sateen — 100% Cotton Unbleached $83.00 N/A N/A
Bath Towel White — 86/14 Blend “Ambassador” $16.98 N/A N/A
Bath Towel Rose — 86/14 Blend $54.95 N/A N/A
Stretch Sheet—

55/45 Cotton/Poly 19 Oz $68.54 N/A N/A
*need to have deep stretch pockets because

we have multiple size beds

E!li(;:/ Nylon Wipeable — Fluid Resistant Lt $4.25 N/A N/A

Sent to 8 potential bidders. Submittals received from 5.

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS



SUMMARY SHEET Date: 11/24/15
County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 15-108 VH Linen Re-Bid
VENDOR VENDOR
Vendor PROFESSIONAL MEDICAL
City/State NEW LENOX IL
ORIGINAL SIGNATURE YES
Mandatory Pages? YES
Samples Provided? YES
BASE YEAR Option Year I1 Option Year III BASE YEAR Option Year I1 Option Year III
MA.:(HI:?ASEARII\:SLNTTP?::\:\-IEL\?:SEES 12/1/15 - 12/1/16 - 12/1/17 - 12/1/15- 12/1/16 - 12/1/17 -
11/30/16 11/30/17 11/30/18 11/30/16 11/30/17 11/30/18
Pillowcase T/180 White —55 Ctn/45 Poly $1.08
: $ $ $ $
Ambassador Only in dozen
Patient Gown Overlap Ties — Blue Snowflake $2.083
On White — Drill onlv in dozen $ $ $ S
*Need to be 55 cotton/45 poly cap sleeve 4
Underpad Pebble Beach — Twill Bonded —All 1
Ply $75.00 $ S $ $
*poly cotton face 10 oz. soaker
Wheelchair Pad Fenix — Brushed
Top/Boradcloth 23750 > > > >
Clothing Protector White — Terry Ex Tie Closure
*12 oz. Perry 100% Cotton 227.95 > ? > ?
Hand Towel Ever-Dri White — 86/14 Cot/Poly $8.25 S S S S
Washcloth Ever-Dri White — 86/14 Cot/Poly $3.50 S S S S

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS




SUMMARY SHEET Date: 11/24/15
County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 15-108 VH Linen Re-Bid

Bar Mop— White Ribbed $5.25 $ $ S S S
o . %

Blankets Mlcro!oft or Yellux (twin) 100% No Bid S S $ $ $

polyester microfiber/microloft

Flat Sheets — 100% Cotton Unbleached (twin) $No Bid S S S S S

Draw Sheet Sateen — 100% Cotton Unbleached | No Bid S S S S S

Bath Towel White — 86/14 Blend “Ambassador” | $18.66 $ $ S S S

Bath Towel Rose — 86/14 Blend No Bid S $ S S S

Stretch Sheet—

55/45 Cotton/Poly 19 Oz $55.00 $ $ $ $ $

*need to have deep stretch pockets because

we have multiple size beds

Pillow Nylon Wipeable — Fluid Resistant Lt

Beige y P $4.15 $ $ $ $ $

Sent to 8 potential bidders. Submittals received from 5.

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS



