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SUMMARY SHEET
County Of McHenry Purchasing

Date: October 21, 2015

Bid: 15-98 Custodial Supplies

FACILITIES
COST OF MEASUREMENT CABAY & CO. INC. ELKH?)?\EKT GEI“I\:I‘{:AL & HP PRODUCTS CORP.
SOLDINQTY 1 MCHENRY, IL ELKHORN, IL ALSIP, IL
ORIGINAL SIGNATURE YES YES YES
Mandatory Pages? YES YES YES
BASE
Facilities Management NO BID 487.269 360.4386
Option Year Il 593.8711 372.9903
oty NO BID
Facilities Management
- Option Year Ill NO BID 520.6972 405.4902
Facilities Management
1,601.837 1,138.91
Partially Bid Partially Bid
' TOTAL: NO BID Bid on most products out
{QTY 1 of each product) of all submittals.
Pricing per item is
competitive

Sent to 24 potential bidders. Submittals received from 3.

**k NOTE: THIS IS AN “ANY OR ALL” BID. This ensures we can get the best pricing out of all bids submitted per product. In-turn vendors were welcome to bid on any or
all products. Entire BID.was based off of QTY 1 for each item in order to compare competitively.

*¥* Entire BID was based off of QTY 1 for each item in order to compare competitively.




A > Ay SUMMARY SHEET

} Date; October Zi, 2015
County Of McHenry Purchasing

Bid: 15-98 Custodial Supplies

ANIMAL CONTROL
COST OF MEASUREMENT CABAY & CO. INC. ELKH(I):?KTG‘E]I:“A:;CAL & HP PRODUCTS CORP.
SOLDINQTY 1 MCHENRY, IL ELKHORN, IL ALSIP, IL
ORIGINAL SIGNATURE YES YES YES
'Mandatory Pages? YES YES YES
BASE
Facilities Management 768.46 71.213 NOBID
) fJ.ptlon Year I 768.46 74.08 NO BID
Facilities Management
'?Ptlop Year 11l 768.46 76.226 NO BID
Facilities Management
2,305.38 221.519
TOTAL: {Bid on all items) {Did not bid on all items pricing NO BID
{QTY 1 of each product} per item is lower)

Sent to 24 potential bidders. Submittals received from 3.

**% NOTE: THIS IS AN “ANY OR ALL” BID. This ensures we can get the best pricing out of all bids submitted per product. In-turn veadors were welcome to bid on any or
all products. Entire BID was based off of QTY 1 for each item in order to compare competltlvely

*** Entire BID was based off of QTY 1 for each item in order to compare competitively.




AN VAW, SUMMARY SHEET

Date: October 21, 2015

County Of McHenry Purchasing Bid: 15-98 Custodial Supplies
por VENDOR
COST OF MEASUREMENT CABAY & CO. INC. ELKH?,::?KT ;“l\:l(l;CAL & HP PRODUCTS CORP.
SOLDINQTY 1 MCHENRY, IL ELKHORN, IL ALSIP, IL
ORIGINAL SIGNATURE _ YES YES YES
Mandatory Pages? YES YES YES
BASE
Facilities Management 45.00 993,11 - 176.76
45.00
Option Year X 408.85 199.895
Facilities Management
Option Year Il 45.00 420.85 218.04
Facilities Management
TOTAL: 135.00 1,222.81 594.695
{QTY 1 of each product)

Sent to 24 potential bidders. Submittals received from 3.

*¥% NOTE: THIS IS AN “ANY OR ALL” BID. This ensures we can get the best pricing out of all bids submitted per product. In-turn vendors were welcome to bid on any or
all products. Entire BID was based off of QTY 1 for each item in order to compare competitively.

*¥* Entire BID was based off of QTY 1 for each item in order to compare competitively.




\«,\\H N al ™ ] P
S L Can SUMMARY SHEET

Z (/7 Date: October 21, 2015
,///// S County Of McHenry Purchasing - Bid: 15-98 Custodial Supplies
DENTAL » ENDO
COST OF MEASUREMENT CABAY & CO. INC. ELKH?T:S (:I\I\:II;AL & HP PRODUCTS CORP.
SOLD IN QTY 1. MCHENRY, IL ELKHORN, IL ALSIP, IL
ORIGINAL SIGNATURE YES YES YES
Mandatory Pages? YES YES YES
BASE
Facilities Management NO BID 352.12 NO BID
’ F)Ptuon Year Il NO BID 366.2 NO BID
Facilities Management
.(.Ji.otlon Year lll NO BID 376.47 NO BID
Facilities Management
TOTAL: NO BID 1,094.79 NO BID
{QTY 1 of each product)

Sent to 24 potential bidders. Submittals received from 3.

**x NOTE: THIS IS AN “ANY OR ALL” BID, This ensures we can get the best pricing out of all bids submitted per product. In-turn vendors were welcome to bid on any or
all products. Entire BID was based off of QTY 1 for each item in order to compare competitively.

*** Entire BID was based off of QTY 1 for each item in order to compare competitively.




