
                                                  

SUMMARY SHEET Date: 10/14/15 

County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 15-96 Assorted Tires for DOT 
 

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS 

Vendor 
City/State 

JACKS TIRE SALES AND SERVICE 
SOUTH BELOIT, IL 

POMPS TIRE SERVICE 
MACHESNEY PARK, IL 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE YES YES 

MANDATORY PAGES INCLUDED? YES YES 

Assorted Tires for the Division of 
Transportation 

Year I 
12/1/15 – 11/30/16 

Year II (Optional) 
12/1/16 – 11/30/17 

Year I 
12/1/15 – 11/30/16 

Year II (Optional) 
12/1/16 – 11/30/17 

SECTION I Unit Price Each Unit Price Each Unit Price Each Unit Price Each 

Cars: Goodyear Eagle RSA 

P225/60R16 $93.98 $96.80 $93.98 NO BID 

P225/55R17 $163.05 $168.00 $163.05 NO BID 

P255/65R17 $123.66 $128.00 $123.66 NO BID 

Trucks under 1Ton: Goodyear Wrangler SRA 

P235/70R15 $88.40 $90.00 $88.40 NO BID 

P235/75R15 $88.73 $90.75 $111.36 NO BID 

LT225/75R16 $131.01 $135.00 $131.01 NO BID 

P245/70R16 $101.60 $104.65 $106.11 NO BID 

LT245/75R16 $141.12 $145.36 $141.12 NO BID 

P255/70R16 $110.79 $114.12 $110.79 NO BID 

P235/70R17 $135.56 $139.63 $135.56 NO BID 

LT265/70R17 $166.69 $171.70 $166.69 NO BID 

P265/70R17 $119.37 $123.00 $119.37 NO BID 

LT265/70R17 $166.69 $171.70 $166.69 NO BID 

P245/60R18 $138.32 $142.47 $138.32 NO BID 

LT275/70R18 $182.78 $188.26 $182.78 NO BID 

Small Trailers:  No Special Make 

ST205/75R15 $59.00 $63.00 $68.06 NO BID 

ST235/80R16 $82.00 $86.00 $82.52 NO BID 

ST235/75R17.5 $182.00 $192.00 $200.77 NO BID 

Installation $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 NO BID 



                                                  

SUMMARY SHEET Date: 10/14/15 

County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 15-96 Assorted Tires for DOT 
 

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS 

Valve Stems $3.00 $3.00 $3.50 NO BID 

Disposal of old tires $3.00 $3.00 $3.50 NO BID 

State Tire Fee $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 NO BID 

Delivery Fee $N/A $N/A $-------- NO BID 

Other Costs $N/A $N/A $------- NO BID 

SECTION II 

Large Trucks 

225/70R19.5 Goodyear G622RSD ULT $285.00 $295.00 $325.41 NO BID 

225/70R19.5 Goodyear G647RSS $275.00 $285.00 $321.15 NO BID 

245/70R19.5 Goodyear G647RSS $300.00 $315.00 $340.42 NO BID 

8R19.5 Goodyear G647RSS $275.00 $285.00 $293.73 NO BID 

11R22.5 Goodyear G661HSA $432.08 $432.08 $432.08 NO BID 

12R22.5 Goodyear G661HSA $496.89 $496.89 $496.89 NO BID 

11R22.5 Michelin XDE M/S 16 Ply  $464.00 $470.00 $464.00 NO BID 

385/65R22.5 Michelin XZY3 $716.00 $725.00 $716.00 NO BID 

Large Trailers 

8.25x15 Low Pro - No Special Make $163.20 $168.00 $148.65 NO BID 

Large Construction Equipment 

15X19.5 Solideal Hauler SKZ $440.00 $450.00 $434.13 NO BID 

14R24 Michelin X Sno Plus $1,344.78 $1,438.08 $1,344.78 NO BID 

17.5R25 Michelin XHA $1,467.54 $1,570.00 $1,467.54 NO BID 

20.5R25 Michelin XHA2 $2,235.72 $2,395.00 $2,235.72 NO BID 

23.5X25 Firestone Super Rock Grip  $1,440.18 $1,560.00 $1,440.18 NO BID 

Tractors 

10x16 4 Rib Front - No Special Make $157.00 $165.00 $172.74 NO BID 

11L15 F3 Front - No Special Make $167.00 $177.00 $187.74 NO BID 

11.2x24 Firestone Super All Traction II 
23deg  

$275.00 $307.00 $306.04 NO BID 

16.9x30 Firestone Super All Traction 
23 deg TLR1 

$708.00 $570.00 $569.85 NO BID 



                                                  

SUMMARY SHEET Date: 10/14/15 

County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 15-96 Assorted Tires for DOT 
 

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS 

16.9x38 Firestone super All Traction 
23deg TTR1 

$989.00 $1,121.07 $1,121.07 NO BID 

12.4R24 Goodyear/Titan Dyna Torque 
TL 

$625.00 $677.50 $581.09 NO BID 

18.4R30 Goodyear/Titan Dyna Torque 
TL 

$985.00 $1,040.00 $1,054.46 NO BID 

380/85R28 (14.9R28) Radial All 
Traction FWD TLR1 

$766.00 $866.00 $1,120.08 NO BID 

480/80R38 (18.4R38) Radial All 
traction 23deg TLR1 

$1,123.00 $1,270.07 $1,370.07 NO BID 

Installation $50.00 $50.00 $45.00 / LT 15.00 NO BID 

Valve Stems $15.00 $15.00 $19.95 / LT 5.00 NO BID 

Disposal of old tires $25.00 $25.00 $25.00 / LT 5.00 NO BID 

State Tire Fee $N/A $N/A $2.50 NO BID 

Delivery Fee $N/A $N/A $ ------- NO BID 

Other Costs $N/A $N/A $ ------ NO BID 

On Site Repair/Installation? $85.00 / HR $85.00 / HR $ 100.00 NO BID 

Additional Fees? $N/A $N/A $ ------ NO BID 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



                                                  

SUMMARY SHEET Date: 10/14/15 

County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 15-96 Assorted Tires for DOT 
 

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS 

Vendor 
City/State 

TREAD ROC 
MCHESNEY PARK, IL 

 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE YES  

MANDATORY PAGES INCLUDED? YES  

Assorted Tires for the Division of 
Transportation 

Year I 
12/1/15 – 11/30/16 

Year II (Optional) 
12/1/16 – 11/30/17 

Year I 
12/1/15 – 11/30/16 

Year II (Optional) 
12/1/16 – 11/30/17 

SECTION I Unit Price Each Unit Price Each Unit Price Each Unit Price Each 

Cars: Goodyear Eagle RSA 

P225/60R16 $ 92.31 NO BID $ $ 

P225/55R17 $115.89 NO BID $ $ 

P255/65R17 $105.62 NO BID $ $ 

Trucks under 1Ton: Goodyear Wrangler SRA 

P235/70R15 $91.76 NO BID $ $ 

P235/75R15 $100.91 NO BID $ $ 

LT225/75R16 $111.53 NO BID $ $ 

P245/70R16 $97.71 NO BID $ $ 

LT245/75R16 $128.84 NO BID $ $ 

P255/70R16 $114.11 NO BID $ $ 

P235/70R17 $101.92 NO BID $ $ 

LT265/70R17 $140.11 NO BID $ $ 

P265/70R17 $112.82 NO BID $ $ 

LT265/70R17 $140.11 NO BID $ $ 

P245/60R18 $91.03 NO BID $ $ 

LT275/70R18 $144.86 NO BID $ $ 

Small Trailers:  No Special Make 

ST205/75R15 $53.95 NO BID $ $ 

ST235/80R16 $81.95 NO BID $ $ 

ST235/75R17.5 $143.95 NO BID $ $ 

Installation $ SEE PROPOSAL NO BID $ $ 



                                                  

SUMMARY SHEET Date: 10/14/15 

County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 15-96 Assorted Tires for DOT 
 

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS 

Valve Stems $ SEE PROPOSAL NO BID $ $ 

Disposal of old tires $ SEE PROPOSAL NO BID $ $ 

State Tire Fee $ SEE PROPOSAL NO BID $ $ 

Delivery Fee $ SEE PROPOSAL NO BID $ $ 

Other Costs $ SEE PROPOSAL NO BID $ $ 

SECTION II 

Large Trucks 

225/70R19.5 Goodyear G622RSD ULT $231.38 NO BID $ $ 

225/70R19.5 Goodyear G647RSS $214.43 NO BID $ $ 

245/70R19.5 Goodyear G647RSS $228.51 NO BID $ $ 

8R19.5 Goodyear G647RSS $218.22 NO BID $ $ 

11R22.5 Goodyear G661HSA $284.16 NO BID $ $ 

12R22.5 Goodyear G661HSA $343.23 NO BID $ $ 

11R22.5 Michelin XDE M/S 16 Ply  $295.49 NO BID $ $ 

385/65R22.5 Michelin XZY3 $455.16 NO BID $ $ 

Large Trailers 

8.25x15 Low Pro - No Special Make $188.44 NO BID $ $ 

Large Construction Equipment 

15X19.5 Solideal Hauler SKZ $399.85 NO BID $ $ 

14R24 Michelin X Sno Plus $1,344.78 NO BID $ $ 

17.5R25 Michelin XHA $1,467.54 NO BID $ $ 

20.5R25 Michelin XHA2 $2,235.72 NO BID $ $ 

23.5X25 Firestone Super Rock Grip  $1,086.75 NO BID $ $ 

Tractors 

10x16 4 Rib Front - No Special Make $165.50 NO BID $ $ 

11L15 F3 Front - No Special Make $134.48 NO BID $ $ 

11.2x24 Firestone Super All Traction II 
23deg  

$219.85 NO BID $ $ 



                                                  

SUMMARY SHEET Date: 10/14/15 

County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 15-96 Assorted Tires for DOT 
 

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS 

16.9x30 Firestone Super All Traction 
23 deg TLR1 

$459.62 NO BID $ $ 

16.9x38 Firestone super All Traction 
23deg TTR1 

$997.78 NO BID $ $ 

12.4R24 Goodyear/Titan Dyna Torque 
TL 

$340.40 NO BID $ $ 

18.4R30 Goodyear/Titan Dyna Torque 
TL 

$1,147.38 NO BID $ $ 

380/85R28 (14.9R28) Radial All 
Traction FWD TLR1 

$740.25 NO BID $ $ 

480/80R38 (18.4R38) Radial All 
traction 23deg TLR1 

$226.30 NO BID $ $ 

Installation $ SEE PROPOSAL NO BID $ $ 

Valve Stems $ SEE PROPOSAL NO BID $ $ 

Disposal of old tires $ SEE PROPOSAL NO BID $ $ 

State Tire Fee $ SEE PROPOSAL NO BID $ $ 

Delivery Fee $ SEE PROPOSAL NO BID $ $ 

Other Costs $ SEE PROPOSAL NO BID $ $ 

On Site Repair/Installation? $ SEE PROPOSAL NO BID $ $ 

Additional Fees? $ SEE PROPOSAL NO BID $ $ 

Sent to 4 potential bidders. Submittals received from 3. 
 
 
 


