

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

Elbeco Tex Trop S/S Shirt White-Style #3310N	35.00	35.00	35.00	35.00	35.00	35.00
5.11 Tact. TDU Ripstop L/S Shirt (Dark Navy W/Embroidery) Style# 72002	47.08	47.08	47.08	47.08	47.08	47.08
5.11 Tact. TDU Ripstop S/S Shirt (Dark Navy W/Embroidery) Style# 72001	45.00	45.00	45.00	45.00	45.00	45.00
UFX Light Blue or White Elbeco S/S Pocket Polo W/Embroidery Style# K5103	45.00	45.00	45.00	45.00	45.00	45.00
UFX Tact. Knit S/S Polo Shirt Elbeco, Dark Navy, Black, Green, White W/Embroidery Style# K5131	38.00	38.00	38.00	38.00	38.00	38.00
UFX Tact. Knit L/S Polo Shirt Elbeco, Dark Navy, Black, Green, White W/Embroidery Style# K5144	49.00	49.00	49.00	49.00	49.00	49.00
Mock Turtleneck L/S Shirt (Dark Navy) W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold)	30.00	30.00	30.00	30.00	30.00	30.00
Mock Turtleneck Dickie (Dark Navy) W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold)	7.00	7.00	7.00	7.00	7.00	7.00
Mock Underarmour T-Neck (Dark Navy) L/S Shirt W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold) Style# 1244393	42.00	42.00	42.00	42.00	42.00	42.00
Propper Tac. U Combat L/S Shirt Olive Green QTR Zip Style# F541738330L2	52.00	52.00	52.00	52.00	52.00	52.00
5.11 Tactical Firefighter QTR Zip Job Shirt Black W/Embroidered Dispatch Logo Style# 72314	52.00	52.00	52.00	52.00	52.00	52.00
Mock Turtleneck (Dark Navy) W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold)	30.00	30.00	30.00	30.00	30.00	30.00
Mock Underarmour T-Neck (Dark Navy) L/S Shirt W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold) Style# 1244393	42.00	42.00	42.00	42.00	42.00	42.00
Propper Tac. U Combat L/S Shirt Olive Green QTR Zip Style# F541738330L2	52.00	52.00	52.00	52.00	52.00	52.00
5.11 Tactical Firefighter QTR Zip Job Shirt Black W/Embroidered Dispatch Logo Style# 72314	52.00	52.00	52.00	52.00	52.00	52.00

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

5.11 Tactical TAK-AK2 Gloves- Style #59341- Black(or equivalent)	37.99	37.99	37.99	37.99	37.99	37.99
Blackhawk S.O.L.A.G. Gloves W/Kevlar- Style #8114SMBK(or equivalent)	60.99	60.99	60.99	60.99	60.99	60.99
Handcuffs & Handcuff Cases						
Smith and Wesson (or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Model 100 Chain Linked Handcuffs- SKU #350103- Nickel	20.69	20.69	20.69	20.69	20.69	20.69
Smith and Wesson (or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Blue Steel Finish Chain Linked Handcuffs- SKU #350101- Blue	20.38	20.38	20.38	20.38	20.38	20.38
Smith and Wesson (or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Model 300P Hinged Nickel Handcuff- SKU #350138- Nickel	35.99	35.99	35.99	35.99	35.99	35.99
Smith and Wesson(or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Blue Hinged Handcuffs- SKU #350095 - Blue	35.99	35.99	35.99	35.99	35.99	35.99
Smith and Wesson(or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Universal Chain Linked Handcuffs- SKU #C864 -Nickel	31.99	31.99	31.99	31.99	31.99	31.99
Smith and Wesson(or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Universal Hinged Handcuffs- SKU #350133 – Nickel	47.99	47.99	47.99	47.99	47.99	47.99
Zak Tools Black Pocket Handcuff Key- Style #ZT14	17.25	17.25	17.25	17.25	17.25	17.25
ASP Handcuff Key- Style #56901	15.50	15.50	15.50	15.050	15.50	15.50
Don Hume Handcuff Case W/ Flap- Style #C303 - Basket Weave- Both Brass and Nickel Snaps	36.00	36.00	36.00	36.00	36.00	36.00
Don Hume Open Top Leather Basketweave Handcuff Case Style# C305-M	35.00	35.00	35.00	35.00	35.00	35.00
Gould and Goodrich K-Force Handcuff Case W/Snap- Style #K840 – Plain- Brass and Nickel Snaps	21.24	21.24	21.24	21.24	21.24	21.24
Gould and Goodrich Leather Open Top Cuff Case- Style # B85W- Basket Weave	21.00	21.00	21.00	21.00	21.00	21.00

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

UFX Light Blue or White Elbeco S/S Pocket Polo W/Embroidery Style# K5103	46.35	46.35	46.35	46.35	46.35	46.35
UFX Tact. Knit S/S Polo Shirt Elbeco, Dark Navy, Black, Green, White W/Embroidery Style# K5131	39.14	39.14	39.14	39.14	39.14	39.14
UFX Tact. Knit L/S Polo Shirt Elbeco, Dark Navy, Black, Green, White W/Embroidery Style# K5144	50.47	50.47	50.47	50.47	50.47	50.47
Mock Turtleneck L/S Shirt (Dark Navy) W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold)	30.90	30.90	30.90	30.90	30.90	30.90
Mock Turtleneck Dickie (Dark Navy) W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold)	7.21	7.21	7.21	7.21	7.21	7.21
Mock Underarmour T-Neck (Dark Navy) L/S Shirt W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold) Style# 1244393	43.26	43.26	43.26	43.26	43.26	43.26
Propper Tac. U Combat L/S Shirt Olive Green QTR Zip Style# F541738330L2	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56
5.11 Tactical Firefighter QTR Zip Job Shirt Black W/Embroidered Dispatch Logo Style# 72314	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56
Mock Turtleneck (Dark Navy) W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold)	30.90	30.90	30.90	30.90	30.90	30.90
Mock Underarmour T-Neck (Dark Navy) L/S Shirt W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold) Style# 1244393	43.26	43.26	43.26	43.26	43.26	43.26
Propper Tac. U Combat L/S Shirt Olive Green QTR Zip Style# F541738330L2	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56
5.11 Tactical Firefighter QTR Zip Job Shirt Black W/Embroidered Dispatch Logo Style# 72314	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56
<u>Pants</u>						
Tru-Spec 24-7 Series Men's Tactical Pants- Style #1073- Black & Khaki 65/35- Poly/Cotton RipStop	43.26	43.26	43.26	43.26	43.26	43.26

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

Tru-Spec 24-7 Series Ladies Tactical Pants- Style #1095- Black & Khaki 65/35- Poly/Cotton RipStop	36.05	36.05	36.05	36.05	36.05	36.05
Tru-Spec 24-7 Series Men's Ascent Pants- Style #1036- Black & Khaki 65/35- Poly/Cotton RipStop	60.77	60.77	60.77	60.77	60.77	60.77
Tru-Spec Tactical Response Uniform (TRU) Pants- Style #1289- Black- 65/35 Poly/Cotton Ripstop	38.31	38.31	38.31	38.31	38.31	38.31
5.11 Taclite Pro Pants- Style #74273- TDU Khaki, Coyote	43.24	43.24	43.24	43.24	43.24	43.24
5.11 Tactical Pants- Style #74251- Khaki, Coyote	43.24	43.24	43.24	43.24	43.24	43.24
5.11 women's Taclite Propants Khaki Style# 64360	43.24	43.24	43.24	43.24	43.24	43.24
Men's Elbeco Duty Max Hidden Pocket Pants (Dark Navy) 75/25 Blend Style# E224RN	61.80	61.80	61.80	61.80	61.80	61.80
women's Elbeco Duty Max Hidden Pocket Pants (Dark Navy) 75/25 Blend Style# E9224LC	61.80	61.80	61.80	61.80	61.80	61.80
Men's 100% Polyester Pants (Dark Navy) 4 Pocket Fechheimer Style# 28200	37.55	37.55	37.55	37.55	37.55	37.55
women's 100% Polyester Pants (Dark Navy) 4 Pocket Fechheimer Style# 38233	37.55	37.55	37.55	37.55	37.55	37.55
women's TRU SPEC 24/7 Ripstop Pants Khaki Style# 1095002	36.05	36.05	36.05	36.05	36.05	36.05
Men's TRU SPEC 24/7 Ripstop Pants Khaki Style# 1061083	34.75	34.75	34.75	34.75	34.75	34.75
Men's TRU SPEC BDU Style EMS Pants (Dark Navy) Style# 1120082	38.62	38.62	38.62	38.62	38.62	38.62
Men's TRU SPEC 24/7 Poly/Cotton Ripstop Short (Dark Navy or Navy) Style#4267002	31.93	31.93	31.93	31.93	31.93	31.93
Propper Tact. Pants Olive Green 65% Poly. 35% Cotton Ripstop Style# F525250001	32.96	32.96	32.96	32.96	32.96	32.96
Sweaters						
PSC Uniform Apparel Full Zip Cardigan Sweater- Style #4012- Black	55.62	55.62	55.62	55.62	55.62	55.62

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

PSC Uniform Apparel V-Neck Ribbed Commando Sweater-Style #8082- Black	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56
PSC Uniform Apparel Crew Neck Ribbed Commando Sweater-Style #8083- Black	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56
Cobmex V-Neck Large Ribbed Wooly Pully Sweater (Navy) W/Patches, Badge Holder & N'Plate Eyelets Style# 8081	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56
Cobmex V-Neck Sweater (Navy) W/Patches , Badge Holder & N'Plate Eyelets Style	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56
Cobmex Zipper Front Crew Cardigan Sweater (Navy) W/Patches, Badge Holder & N'Plate Eyelets Style# 5088	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56	53.56
Jackets						
5.11 Tactical 5 in 1 Jacket- Style #48017- Black & Dark Navy with patched Shell and liner	195.72	195.72	195.72	195.72	195.72	195.72
Spiewak Water Proof Duty Jacket- Style #S310G- Black	96.25	96.25	96.25	96.25	96.25	96.25
Spiewak Duty Jacket (Waterproof) Dark Navy Style# S310G	96.25	96.25	96.25	96.25	96.25	96.25
Propper Tac. U Coat Olive Green Style# F542438330	38.11	38.11	38.11	38.11	38.11	38.11
5.11 Tact. Fleece W/Patches and Badge Holder (Dark Navy) Style# 48038	81.11	81.11	81.11	81.11	81.11	81.11
Fleece Jacket 100% Polyester (Black) W/Embroidered Dispatcher Logo	36.03	36.03	36.03	36.03	36.03	36.03
Gloves & Glove Pouches						
Resistant Glove W/Kevlar Lining- - Black	27.79	27.79	27.79	27.79	27.79	27.79
Street Guard Glove W/Kevlar- - Black	33.97	33.97	33.97	33.97	33.97	33.97
Leather Basketweave Glove Pouch	22.08	22.08	22.08	22.08	22.08	22.08
Specialist Glove- - Black	33.97	33.97	33.97	33.97	33.97	33.97
Sub Zero Duty Glove- Style #DZ-9-Black	33.21	33.21	33.21	33.21	33.21	33.21
5.11 Tactical TAK-AK2 Gloves-Style #59341- Black(or equivalent)	39.12	39.12	39.12	39.12	39.12	39.12

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

Blackhawk S.O.L.A.G. Gloves W/Kevlar- Style #8114SMBK(or equivalent)	62.81	62.81	62.81	62.81	62.81	62.80
Handcuffs & Handcuff Cases						
Smith and Wesson (or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Model 100 Chain Linked Handcuffs- SKU #350103- Nickel	21.31	21.31	21.31	21.31	21.31	21.31
Smith and Wesson (or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Blue Steel Finish Chain Linked Handcuffs- SKU #350101- Blue	20.99	20.99	20.99	20.99	20.99	20.99
Smith and Wesson (or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Model 300P Hinged Nickel Handcuff- SKU #350138- Nickel	37.06	37.06	37.06	37.06	37.06	37.06
Smith and Wesson(or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Blue Hinged Handcuffs- SKU #350095 - Blue	37.06	37.06	37.06	37.06	37.06	37.06
Smith and Wesson(or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Universal Chain Linked Handcuffs- SKU #C864 -Nickel	32.94	32.94	32.94	32.94	32.94	32.94
Smith and Wesson(or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Universal Hinged Handcuffs- SKU #350133 – Nickel	49.42	49.42	49.42	49.42	49.42	49.42
Zak Tools Black Pocket Handcuff Key- Style #ZT14	7.46	7.46	7.46	7.46	7.46	7.46
ASP Handcuff Key- Style #56901	15.96	15.96	15.96	15.96	15.96	15.96
Don Hume Handcuff Case W/ Flap- Style #C303 - Basket Weave- Both Brass and Nickel Snaps	37.08	37.08	37.08	37.08	37.08	37.08
Don Hume Open Top Leather Basketweave Handcuff Case Style# C305-M	36.05	36.05	36.05	36.05	36.05	36.05
Gould and Goodrich K-Force Handcuff Case W/Snap- Style #K840 – Plain- Brass and Nickel Snaps	21.87	21.87	21.87	21.87	21.87	21.87
Gould and Goodrich Leather Open Top Cuff Case- Style # B85W- Basket Weave	21.63	21.63	21.63	21.63	21.63	21.63

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

Don Hume Double Snap Keepers- Style #S502-1 - Basket Weave- Both Nickel and Brass(or equivalent)	11.84	11.84	11.84	11.84	11.84	11.84
<u>Flashlight, Flashlight Case & Accessories</u>						
Streamlight (or equivalent) Strion Rechargeable Compact Flashlight- Style #74001	92.92	92.92	92.92	92.92	92.92	92.92
Streamlight (or equivalent) TLR-1 HL Tact. Gun Mounted Weapon Light Style# 69260	126.67	126.67	126.67	126.67	126.67	126.67
StreamLight Stinger(or equivalent) DS LED Flashlight With Fast Charge Style# 75814	118.45 DC 139.05 ACDC	118.45 DC 139.05 ACDC	118.45 DC 139.05 ACDC	118.45 DC 139.05 ACDC	118.45 DC 139.05 ACDC	118.45 DC 139.05 ACDC
Streamlight Strion (or equivalent)Rechargeable C4 LED Flashlight Style# 54910	87.75 DC 98.36 ACDC	87.75 DC 98.36 ACDC	87.75 DC 98.36 ACDC	87.75 DC 98.36 ACDC	87.75 DC 98.36 ACDC	87.75 DC 98.36 ACDC
Streamlight (or equivalent)TLR-1S LED Gun Light With Strobe Function Style# 320	107.10	107.10	107.10	107.10	107.10	107.10
Blackhawk XIPHOS NT Gun Mounted Flashlight Style# 75206 (or equivalent)	149.35	149.35	149.35	149.35	149.35	149.35
Leather Basketweave Double Ring Flashlight Holder Style# S505-D	10.70	10.70	10.70	10.70	10.70	10.70
Leather Closed Top Holder for Streamlight Strion Flashlight- Style #K672-5W- Basket Weave	23.94	23.94	23.94	23.94	23.94	23.94
Replacement Xenon Bulb for Strion Rechargeable Flashlight- Style #74914	6.95	6.95	6.95	6.95	6.95	6.95
Replacement Battery Stick for Strion Rechargeable Flashlight- Style #74175	30.88	30.88	30.88	30.88	30.88	30.88
<u>Safety Range Glasses & Ear Protection</u>						
UVEX Genesis XC Eyewear Protection- Style # S3300 (Clear Lens), S3301 (Gray Lens), S3309 (Amber Lens)- Black Frame(or equivalent)	19.05	19.05	19.05	19.05	19.05	19.05
Howard Leight Lightning L3 Hearing Protection- SKU #1010924- Black(or equivalent)	27.79	27.79	27.79	27.79	27.79	27.79

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

UFX Light Blue or White Elbeco S/S Pocket Polo W/Embroidery Style# K5103	\$47.74	\$47.74	\$47.74	\$47.74	\$47.74	\$47.74
UFX Tact. Knit S/S Polo Shirt Elbeco, Dark Navy, Black, Green, White W/Embroidery Style# K5131	\$40.31	\$40.31	\$40.31	\$40.31	\$40.31	\$40.31
UFX Tact. Knit L/S Polo Shirt Elbeco, Dark Navy, Black, Green, White W/Embroidery Style# K5144	\$51.98	\$51.98	\$51.98	\$51.98	\$51.98	\$51.98
Mock Turtleneck L/S Shirt (Dark Navy) W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold)	\$31.82	\$31.82	\$31.82	\$31.82	\$31.82	\$31.82
Mock Turtleneck Dickie (Dark Navy) W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold)	\$7.42	\$7.42	\$7.42	\$7.42	\$7.42	\$7.42
Mock Underarmour T-Neck (Dark Navy) L/S Shirt W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold) Style# 1244393	\$44.55	\$44.55	\$44.55	\$44.55	\$44.55	\$44.55
Propper Tac. U Combat L/S Shirt Olive Green QTR Zip Style# F541738330L2	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16
5.11 Tactical Firefighter QTR Zip Job Shirt Black W/Embroidered Dispatch Logo Style# 72314	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16
Mock Turtleneck (Dark Navy) W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold)	\$31.82	\$31.82	\$31.82	\$31.82	\$31.82	\$31.82
Mock Underarmour T-Neck (Dark Navy) L/S Shirt W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold) Style# 1244393	\$44.55	\$44.55	\$44.55	\$44.55	\$44.55	\$44.55
Propper Tac. U Combat L/S Shirt Olive Green QTR Zip Style# F541738330L2	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16
5.11 Tactical Firefighter QTR Zip Job Shirt Black W/Embroidered Dispatch Logo Style# 72314	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16
<u>Pants</u>						
Tru-Spec 24-7 Series Men's Tactical Pants- Style #1073- Black & Khaki 65/35- Poly/Cotton RipStop	\$44.55	\$44.55	\$44.55	\$44.55	\$44.55	\$44.55

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

Tru-Spec 24-7 Series Ladies Tactical Pants- Style #1095- Black & Khaki 65/35- Poly/Cotton RipStop	\$37.13	\$37.13	\$37.13	\$37.13	\$37.13	\$37.13
Tru-Spec 24-7 Series Men's Ascent Pants- Style #1036- Black & Khaki 65/35- Poly/Cotton RipStop	\$62.59	\$62.59	\$62.59	\$62.59	\$62.59	\$62.59
Tru-Spec Tactical Response Uniform (TRU) Pants- Style #1289- Black- 65/35 Poly/Cotton Ripstop	\$39.46	\$39.46	\$39.46	\$39.46	\$39.46	\$39.46
5.11 Taclite Pro Pants- Style #74273- TDU Khaki, Coyote	\$44.54	\$44.54	\$44.54	\$44.54	\$44.54	\$44.54
5.11 Tactical Pants- Style #74251- Khaki, Coyote	\$44.54	\$44.54	\$44.54	\$44.54	\$44.54	\$44.54
5.11 women's Taclite Propants Khaki Style# 64360	\$44.54	\$44.54	\$44.54	\$44.54	\$44.54	\$44.54
Men's Elbeco Duty Max Hidden Pocket Pants (Dark Navy) 75/25 Blend Style# E224RN	\$63.65	\$63.65	\$63.65	\$63.65	\$63.65	\$63.65
women's Elbeco Duty Max Hidden Pocket Pants (Dark Navy) 75/25 Blend Style# E9224LC	\$63.65	\$63.65	\$63.65	\$63.65	\$63.65	\$63.65
Men's 100% Polyester Pants (Dark Navy) 4 Pocket Fechheimer Style# 28200	\$38.68	\$63.65	\$63.65	\$63.65	\$63.65	\$63.65
women's 100% Polyester Pants (Dark Navy) 4 Pocket Fechheimer Style# 38233	\$38.68	\$38.68	\$38.68	\$38.68	\$38.68	\$38.68
women's TRU SPEC 24/7 Ripstop Pants Khaki Style# 1095002	\$37.13	\$37.13	\$37.13	\$37.13	\$37.13	\$37.13
Men's TRU SPEC 24/7 Ripstop Pants Khaki Style# 1061083	\$35.79	\$35.79	\$35.79	\$35.79	\$35.79	\$35.79
Men's TRU SPEC BDU Style EMS Pants (Dark Navy) Style# 1120082	\$39.78	\$39.78	\$39.78	\$39.78	\$39.78	\$39.78
Men's TRU SPEC 24/7 Poly/Cotton Ripstop Short (Dark Navy or Navy) Style#4267002	\$32.88	\$32.88	\$32.88	\$32.88	\$32.88	\$32.88
Propper Tact. Pants Olive Green 65% Poly. 35% Cotton Ripstop Style# F525250001	\$33.94	\$33.94	\$33.94	\$33.94	\$33.94	\$33.94
<u>Sweaters</u>						
PSC Uniform Apparel Full Zip Cardigan Sweater- Style #4012- Black	\$57.28	\$57.28	\$57.28	\$57.28	\$57.28	\$57.28

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

PSC Uniform Apparel V-Neck Ribbed Commando Sweater-Style #8082- Black	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16
PSC Uniform Apparel Crew Neck Ribbed Commando Sweater-Style #8083- Black	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16
Cobmex V-Neck Large Ribbed Wooly Pully Sweater (Navy) W/Patches, Badge Holder & N'Plate Eyelets Style# 8081	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16
Cobmex V-Neck Sweater (Navy) W/Patches , Badge Holder & N'Plate Eyelets Style	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16
Cobmex Zipper Front Crew Cardigan Sweater (Navy) W/Patches, Badge Holder & N'Plate Eyelets Style# 5088	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16	\$55.16
<u>Jackets</u>						
5.11 Tactical 5 in 1 Jacket- Style #48017- Black & Dark Navy with patched Shell and liner	\$201.59	\$201.59	\$201.59	\$201.59	\$201.59	\$201.59
Spiewak Water Proof Duty Jacket- Style #S310G- Black	\$99.14	\$99.14	\$99.14	\$99.14	\$99.14	\$99.14
Spiewak Duty Jacket (Waterproof) Dark Navy Style# S310G	\$99.14	\$99.14	\$99.14	\$99.14	\$99.14	\$99.14
Propper Tac. U Coat Olive Green Style# F542438330	\$39.25	\$39.25	\$39.25	\$39.25	\$39.25	\$39.25
5.11 Tact. Fleece W/Patches and Badge Holder (Dark Navy) Style# 48038	\$83.54	\$83.54	\$83.54	\$83.54	\$83.54	\$83.54
Fleece Jacket 100% Polyester (Black) W/Embroidered Dispatcher Logo	\$37.12	\$37.12	\$37.12	\$37.12	\$37.12	\$37.12
<u>Gloves & Glove Pouches</u>						
Resistant Glove W/Kevlar Lining- - Black	\$28.63	\$28.63	\$28.63	\$28.63	\$28.63	\$28.63
Street Guard Glove W/Kevlar- - Black	\$34.99	\$34.99	\$34.99	\$34.99	\$34.99	\$34.99
Leather Basketweave Glove Pouch	\$22.74	\$22.74	\$22.74	\$22.74	\$22.74	\$22.74
Specialist Glove- - Black	\$34.99	\$34.99	\$34.99	\$34.99	\$34.99	\$34.99
Sub Zero Duty Glove- Style #DZ-9- Black	\$34.21	\$34.21	\$34.21	\$34.21	\$34.21	\$34.21
5.11 Tactical TAK-AK2 Gloves- Style #59341- Black(or equivalent)	\$40.30	\$40.30	\$40.30	\$40.30	\$40.30	\$40.30

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

Blackhawk S.O.L.A.G. Gloves W/Kevlar- Style #8114SMBK(or equivalent)	\$64.70	\$64.70	\$64.70	\$64.70	\$64.70	\$64.70
Handcuffs & Handcuff Cases						
Smith and Wesson (or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Model 100 Chain Linked Handcuffs- SKU #350103- Nickel	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95
Smith and Wesson (or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Blue Steel Finish Chain Linked Handcuffs- SKU #350101- Blue	\$21.62	\$21.62	\$21.62	\$21.62	\$21.62	\$21.62
Smith and Wesson (or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Model 300P Hinged Nickel Handcuff- SKU #350138- Nickel	\$38.18	\$38.18	\$38.18	\$38.18	\$38.18	\$38.18
Smith and Wesson(or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Blue Hinged Handcuffs- SKU #350095 - Blue	\$38.18	\$38.18	\$38.18	\$38.18	\$38.18	\$38.18
Smith and Wesson(or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Universal Chain Linked Handcuffs- SKU #C864 -Nickel	\$33.93	\$33.93	\$33.93	\$33.93	\$33.93	\$33.93
Smith and Wesson(or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Universal Hinged Handcuffs- SKU #350133 – Nickel	\$50.91	\$50.91	\$50.91	\$50.91	\$50.91	\$50.91
Zak Tools Black Pocket Handcuff Key- Style #ZT14	\$7.69	\$7.69	\$7.69	\$7.69	\$7.69	\$7.69
ASP Handcuff Key- Style #56901	\$16.44	\$16.44	\$16.44	\$16.44	\$16.44	\$16.44
Don Hume Handcuff Case W/ Flap- Style #C303 - Basket Weave- Both Brass and Nickel Snaps	\$38.19	\$38.19	\$38.19	\$38.19	\$38.19	\$38.19
Don Hume Open Top Leather Basketweave Handcuff Case Style# C305-M	\$37.13	\$37.13	\$37.13	\$37.13	\$37.13	\$37.13
Gould and Goodrich K-Force Handcuff Case W/Snap- Style #K840 – Plain- Brass and Nickel Snaps	\$22.53	\$22.53	\$22.53	\$22.53	\$22.53	\$22.53
Gould and Goodrich Leather Open Top Cuff Case- Style # B85W- Basket Weave	\$22.27	\$22.27	\$22.27	\$22.27	\$22.27	\$22.27

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

Don Hume Double Snap Keepers- Style #S502-1 - Basket Weave- Both Nickel and Brass(or equivalent)	\$12.20	\$12.20	\$12.20	\$12.20	\$12.20	\$12.20
<u>Flashlight, Flashlight Case & Accessories</u>						
Streamlight (or equivalent) Strion Rechargeable Compact Flashlight- Style #74001	\$95.71	\$95.71	\$95.71	\$95.71	\$95.71	\$95.71
Streamlight (or equivalent) TLR-1 HL Tact. Gun Mounted Weapon Light Style# 69260	\$130.48	\$130.48	\$130.48	\$130.48	\$130.48	\$130.48
StreamLight Stinger(or equivalent) DS LED Flashlight With Fast Charge Style# 75814	\$122.00 ac \$143.22 ac/dc	\$122.00 ac \$143.22 ac/dc	\$122.00 ac \$143.22 ac/dc	\$122.00 ac \$143.22 ac/dc	\$122.00 ac \$143.22 ac/dc	\$122.00 ac \$143.22 ac/dc
Streamlight Strion (or equivalent)Rechargeable C4 LED Flashlight Style# 54910	\$90.38 ac \$101.31 ac/dc	\$90.38 ac \$101.31 ac/dc	\$90.38 ac \$101.31 ac/dc	\$90.38 ac \$101.31 ac/dc	\$90.38 ac \$101.31 ac/dc	\$90.38 ac \$101.31 ac/dc
Streamlight (or equivalent)TLR-1S LED Gun Light With Strobe Function Style# 320	\$110.32	\$110.32	\$110.32	\$110.32	\$110.32	\$110.32
Blackhawk XIPHOS NT Gun Mounted Flashlight Style# 75206 (or equivalent)	\$153.83	\$153.83	\$153.83	\$153.83	\$153.83	\$153.83
Leather Basketweave Double Ring Flashlight Holder Style# S505-D	\$11.02	\$11.02	\$11.02	\$11.02	\$11.02	\$11.02
Leather Closed Top Holder for Streamlight Strion Flashlight- Style #K672-5W- Basket Weave	\$24.66	\$24.66	\$24.66	\$24.66	\$24.66	\$24.66
Replacement Xenon Bulb for Strion Rechargeable Flashlight- Style #74914	\$7.16	\$7.16	\$7.16	\$7.16	\$7.16	\$7.16
Replacement Battery Stick for Strion Rechargeable Flashlight- Style #74175	\$31.81	\$31.81	\$31.81	\$31.81	\$31.81	\$31.81
<u>Safety Range Glasses & Ear Protection</u>						
UVEX Genesis XC Eyewear Protection- Style # S3300 (Clear Lens), S3301 (Gray Lens), S3309 (Amber Lens)- Black Frame(or equivalent)	\$19.62	\$19.62	\$19.62	\$19.62	\$19.62	\$19.62
Howard Leight Lightning L3 Hearing Protection- SKU #1010924- Black(or equivalent)	\$28.63	\$28.63	\$28.63	\$28.63	\$28.63	\$28.63

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

Campaign Cords (Silver and Gold)	\$9.32	\$9.32	\$9.32	\$9.32	\$9.32	\$9.32
Swivel Chin Strap	\$7.69	\$7.69	\$7.69	\$7.69	\$7.69	\$7.69
Clear Hat Cover For S-42	\$7.15	\$7.15	\$7.15	\$7.15	\$7.15	\$7.15
Mouton Fur Hat (Dark Navy)	\$21.21	\$21.21	\$21.21	\$21.21	\$21.21	\$21.21
Breakaway Velcro Tie 100% Polyester (Dark Navy) Short, Regular, Long, X-Long	\$4.77	\$4.77	\$4.77	\$4.77	\$4.77	\$4.77
ASP Expandable Baton 21" Style# 82105	\$42.43	\$42.43	\$42.43	\$42.43	\$42.43	\$42.43
ASP Rotating Sidebreak Scabbard for 21" Expandable Baton Style# 82107	\$31.81	\$31.81	\$31.81	\$31.81	\$31.81	\$31.81
Tourniquet North American Rescue C.A.T. Combat Style# 30-000(or equivalent)	\$28.64	\$28.64	\$28.64	\$28.64	\$28.64	\$28.64
Tourniquet Holder North American Belt Holder Style# 80-0268(or equivalent)	\$51.50	\$51.50	\$51.50	\$51.50	\$51.50	\$51.50
<u>Volunteer Program</u>						
Elbeco Response Uf/x Performance Tactical Polo, Royal Blue SW672	\$39.25	\$39.25	\$39.25	\$39.25	\$39.25	\$39.25
Elbeco Response Women's Uf/x Performance Tactical Polo, Royal Blue ST120	\$39.25	\$39.25	\$39.25	\$39.25	\$39.25	\$39.25
<i>Polo Shirt Customization:</i> MCSO patch embroidered on left chest with text "VOLUNTEER" embroidered above the patch.	Included	Included	Included	Included	Included	Included
TRU SPEC 24 7 Ripstop Pants, Khaki TR549	\$33.94	\$33.94	\$33.94	\$33.94	\$33.94	\$33.94
Women's Tru Spec 24 7 Ripstop Pants TR625	\$33.94	\$33.94	\$33.94	\$33.94	\$33.94	\$33.94
5.11 Tactical TDU Belt with 1 1/2" Plastic Buckle, Tan NP569	\$12.73	\$12.73	\$12.73	\$12.73	\$12.73	\$12.73
Gerber Eclipse SX Lime Jacket with Warrior Softshell JX029	\$184.59	\$184.59	\$184.59	\$184.59	\$184.59	\$184.59
<i>Jacket Customization:</i> SHERIFF VOLUNTEER silkscreened/ printed on back of shell. MCSO patch embroidered on left chest with text "VOLUNTEER" embroidered above the patch on the liner.	Included	Included	Included	Included	Included	Included
TOTAL	\$6,644.88	\$6,644.88	\$6,644.88	\$6,644.88	\$6,644.88	\$6,644.88
GRAND TPTAL	\$19,358.21	\$19,358.21	\$19,358.21	\$19,358.21	\$19,358.21	\$19,358.21

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

Elbeco Tex Trop S/S Shirt White-Style #3310N	\$40.95	\$40.95	\$40.95	\$40.95	\$40.95	\$47.95
5.11 Tact. TDU Ripstop L/S Shirt (Dark Navy W/Embroidery) Style# 72002	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$54.95
5.11 Tact. TDU Ripstop S/S Shirt (Dark Navy W/Embroidery) Style# 72001	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$54.95
UFX Light Blue or White Elbeco S/S Pocket Polo W/Embroidery Style# K5103	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$52.95
UFX Tact. Knit S/S Polo Shirt Elbeco, Dark Navy, Black, Green, White W/Embroidery Style# K5131	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$47.95
UFX Tact. Knit L/S Polo Shirt Elbeco, Dark Navy, Black, Green, White W/Embroidery Style# K5144	\$37.95	\$37.95	\$37.95	\$37.95	\$37.95	\$42.95
Mock Turtleneck L/S Shirt (Dark Navy) W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold)	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$24.95
Mock Turtleneck Dickie (Dark Navy) W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold)	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$24.95
Mock Underarmour T-Neck (Dark Navy) L/S Shirt W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold) Style# 1244393	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$54.95
Propper Tac. U Combat L/S Shirt Olive Green QTR Zip Style# F541738330L2	\$68.95	\$68.95	\$68.95	\$68.95	\$68.95	\$73.95
5.11 Tactical Firefighter QTR Zip Job Shirt Black W/Embroidered Dispatch Logo Style# 72314	\$65.95	\$65.95	\$65.95	\$65.95	\$65.95	\$72.95
Mock Turtleneck (Dark Navy) W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold)	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$24.95
Mock Underarmour T-Neck (Dark Navy) L/S Shirt W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold) Style# 1244393	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$54.95
Propper Tac. U Combat L/S Shirt Olive Green QTR Zip Style# F541738330L2	\$68.95	\$68.95	\$68.95	\$68.95	\$68.95	\$73.95
5.11 Tactical Firefighter QTR Zip Job Shirt Black W/Embroidered Dispatch Logo Style# 72314	\$65.95	\$65.95	\$65.95	\$65.95	\$65.95	\$72.95

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

5.11 Tactical TAK-AK2 Gloves- Style #59341- Black(or equivalent)	\$42.95	\$42.95	\$42.95	\$42.95	\$42.95	\$42.95
Blackhawk S.O.L.A.G. Gloves W/Kevlar- Style #8114SMBK(or equivalent)	\$59.95	\$59.95	\$59.95	\$59.95	\$59.95	\$59.95
Handcuffs & Handcuff Cases						
Smith and Wesson (or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Model 100 Chain Linked Handcuffs- SKU #350103- Nickel	\$29.95	\$29.95	\$29.95	\$29.95	\$29.95	\$29.95
Smith and Wesson (or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Blue Steel Finish Chain Linked Handcuffs- SKU #350101- Blue	\$29.95	\$29.95	\$29.95	\$29.95	\$29.95	\$29.95
Smith and Wesson (or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Model 300P Hinged Nickel Handcuff- SKU #350138- Nickel	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95
Smith and Wesson(or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Blue Hinged Handcuffs- SKU #350095 - Blue	\$35.95	\$35.95	\$35.95	\$35.95	\$35.95	\$35.95
Smith and Wesson(or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Universal Chain Linked Handcuffs- SKU #C864 -Nickel	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95
Smith and Wesson(or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Universal Hinged Handcuffs- SKU #350133 – Nickel	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95
Zak Tools Black Pocket Handcuff Key- Style #ZT14	\$10.95	\$10.95	\$10.95	\$10.95	\$10.95	\$10.95
ASP Handcuff Key- Style #56901	\$19.95	\$19.95	\$19.95	\$19.95	\$19.95	\$19.95
Don Hume Handcuff Case W/ Flap- Style #C303 - Basket Weave- Both Brass and Nickel Snaps	\$25.95	\$25.95	\$25.95	\$25.95	\$25.95	\$25.95
Don Hume Open Top Leather Basketweave Handcuff Case Style# C305-M	\$23.95	\$23.95	\$23.95	\$23.95	\$23.95	\$23.95
Gould and Goodrich K-Force Handcuff Case W/Snap- Style #K840 – Plain- Brass and Nickel Snaps	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95
Gould and Goodrich Leather Open Top Cuff Case- Style # B85W- Basket Weave	\$26.95	\$26.95	\$26.95	\$26.95	\$26.95	\$26.95

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

Don Hume Double Snap Keepers- Style #S502-1 - Basket Weave- Both Nickel and Brass(or equivalent)	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$6.50
<u>Flashlight, Flashlight Case & Accessories</u>						
Streamlight (or equivalent) Strion Rechargeable Compact Flashlight- Style #74001	\$105.95	\$105.95	\$105.95	\$105.95	\$105.95	\$105.95
Streamlight (or equivalent) TLR-1 HL Tact. Gun Mounted Weapon Light Style# 69260	\$137.95	\$137.95	\$137.95	\$137.95	\$137.95	\$137.95
StreamLight Stinger(or equivalent) DS LED Flashlight With Fast Charge Style# 75814	\$126.95	\$126.95	\$126.95	\$126.95	\$126.95	\$126.95
Streamlight Strion (or equivalent)Rechargeable C4 LED Flashlight Style# 54910	\$9.95	\$9.95	\$9.95	\$9.95	\$9.95	\$9.95
Streamlight (or equivalent)TLR-1S LED Gun Light With Strobe Function Style# 320	\$135.95	\$135.95	\$135.95	\$135.95	\$135.95	\$135.95
Blackhawk XIPHOS NT Gun Mounted Flashlight Style# 75206 (or equivalent)	\$145.95	\$145.95	\$145.95	\$145.95	\$145.95	\$145.95
Leather Basketweave Double Ring Flashlight Holder Style# S505-D	\$14.95	\$14.95	\$14.95	\$14.95	\$14.95	\$14.95
Leather Closed Top Holder for Streamlight Strion Flashlight- Style #K672-5W- Basket Weave	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95
Replacement Xenon Bulb for Strion Rechargeable Flashlight- Style #74914	\$9.95	\$9.95	\$9.95	\$9.95	\$9.95	\$9.95
Replacement Battery Stick for Strion Rechargeable Flashlight- Style #74175	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95
<u>Safety Range Glasses & Ear Protection</u>						
UVEX Genesis XC Eyewear Protection- Style # S3300 (Clear Lens), S3301 (Gray Lens), S3309 (Amber Lens)- Black Frame(or equivalent)	\$15.95	\$15.95	\$15.95	\$15.95	\$15.95	\$15.95
Howard Leight Lightning L3 Hearing Protection- SKU #1010924- Black(or equivalent)	\$29.95	\$29.95	\$29.95	\$29.95	\$29.95	\$29.95

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

Campaign Cords (Silver and Gold)	\$8.95	\$8.95	\$8.95	\$8.95	\$8.95	\$8.95
Swivel Chin Strap	\$7.95	\$7.95	\$7.95	\$7.95	\$7.95	\$7.95
Clear Hat Cover For S-42	\$9.95	\$9.95	\$9.95	\$9.95	\$9.95	\$9.95
Mouton Fur Hat (Dark Navy)	\$29.95	\$29.95	\$29.95	\$29.95	\$29.95	\$29.95
Breakaway Velcro Tie 100% Polyester (Dark Navy) Short, Regular, Long, X-Long	\$5.95	\$5.95	\$5.95	\$5.95	\$5.95	\$5.95
ASP Expandable Baton 21" Style# 82105	\$85.95	\$85.95	\$85.95	\$85.95	\$85.95	\$85.95
ASP Rotating Sidebreak Scabbard for 21" Expandable Baton Style# 82107	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95
Tourniquet North American Rescue C.A.T. Combat Style# 30-000(or equivalent)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Tourniquet Holder North American Belt Holder Style# 80-0268(or equivalent)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<u>Volunteer Program</u>						
Elbeco Response Uf/x Performance Tactical Polo, Royal Blue SW672	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$42.95
Elbeco Response Women's Uf/x Performance Tactical Polo, Royal Blue ST120	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$42.95
<i>Polo Shirt Customization:</i> MCSO patch embroidered on left chest with text "VOLUNTEER" embroidered above the patch.	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$12.00
TRU SPEC 24 7 Ripstop Pants, Khaki TR549	\$44.95	\$44.95	\$44.95	\$44.95	\$44.95	\$49.95
Women's Tru Spec 24 7 Ripstop Pants TR625	\$44.95	\$44.95	\$44.95	\$44.95	\$44.95	\$49.95
5.11 Tactical TDU Belt with 1 1/2" Plastic Buckle, Tan NP569	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$25.95
Gerber Eclipse SX Lime Jacket with Warrior Softshell JX029	\$215.95	\$215.95	\$215.95	\$215.95	\$215.95	\$225.95
<i>Jacket Customization:</i> SHERIFF VOLUNTEER silkscreened/ printed on back of shell. MCSO patch embroidered on left chest with text "VOLUNTEER" embroidered above the patch on the liner.	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$20.00
TOTAL	\$7,038.89	\$7,038.89	\$7,038.89	\$7,038.89	\$7,038.89	\$7,396.89

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

UFX Light Blue or White Elbeco S/S Pocket Polo W/Embroidery Style# K5103	\$48.95	\$48.95	\$48.95	\$48.95	\$48.95	\$55.95
UFX Tact. Knit S/S Polo Shirt Elbeco, Dark Navy, Black, Green, White W/Embroidery Style# K5131	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$50.95
UFX Tact. Knit L/S Polo Shirt Elbeco, Dark Navy, Black, Green, White W/Embroidery Style# K5144	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$45.95
Mock Turtleneck L/S Shirt (Dark Navy) W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold)	\$23.95	\$23.95	\$23.95	\$23.95	\$23.95	\$26.95
Mock Turtleneck Dickie (Dark Navy) W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold)	\$23.95	\$23.95	\$23.95	\$23.95	\$23.95	\$26.95
Mock Underarmour T-Neck (Dark Navy) L/S Shirt W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold) Style# 1244393	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$57.95
Propper Tac. U Combat L/S Shirt Olive Green QTR Zip Style# F541738330L2	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$77.95
5.11 Tactical Firefighter QTR Zip Job Shirt Black W/Embroidered Dispatch Logo Style# 72314	\$69.95	\$69.95	\$69.95	\$69.95	\$69.95	\$76.95
Mock Turtleneck (Dark Navy) W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold)	\$23.95	\$23.95	\$23.95	\$23.95	\$23.95	\$26.95
Mock Underarmour T-Neck (Dark Navy) L/S Shirt W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold) Style# 1244393	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$57.95
Propper Tac. U Combat L/S Shirt Olive Green QTR Zip Style# F541738330L2	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$77.95
5.11 Tactical Firefighter QTR Zip Job Shirt Black W/Embroidered Dispatch Logo Style# 72314	\$69.95	\$69.95	\$69.95	\$69.95	\$69.95	\$76.95
Pants						
Tru-Spec 24-7 Series Men's Tactical Pants- Style #1073- Black & Khaki 65/35- Poly/Cotton RipStop	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$57.95

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

Tru-Spec 24-7 Series Ladies Tactical Pants- Style #1095- Black & Khaki 65/35- Poly/Cotton RipStop	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$57.95
Tru-Spec 24-7 Series Men's Ascent Pants- Style #1036- Black & Khaki 65/35- Poly/Cotton RipStop	\$62.95	\$62.95	\$62.95	\$62.95	\$62.95	\$69.95
Tru-Spec Tactical Response Uniform (TRU) Pants- Style #1289- Black- 65/35 Poly/Cotton Ripstop	\$44.95	\$44.95	\$44.95	\$44.95	\$44.95	\$48.95
5.11 Taclite Pro Pants- Style #74273- TDU Khaki, Coyote	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$57.95
5.11 Tactical Pants- Style #74251- Khaki, Coyote	\$53.95	\$53.95	\$53.95	\$53.95	\$53.95	\$58.95
5.11 women's Taclite Propants Khaki Style# 64360	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$57.95
Men's Elbeco Duty Max Hidden Pocket Pants (Dark Navy) 75/25 Blend Style# E224RN	\$69.95	\$69.95	\$69.95	\$69.95	\$69.95	\$74.95
women's Elbeco Duty Max Hidden Pocket Pants (Dark Navy) 75/25 Blend Style# E9224LC	\$69.95	\$69.95	\$69.95	\$69.95	\$69.95	\$74.95
Men's 100% Polyester Pants (Dark Navy) 4 Pocket Fechheimer Style# 28200	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$48.95
women's 100% Polyester Pants (Dark Navy) 4 Pocket Fechheimer Style# 38233	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$48.95
women's TRU SPEC 24/7 Ripstop Pants Khaki Style# 1095002	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$57.95
Men's TRU SPEC 24/7 Ripstop Pants Khaki Style# 1061083	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$57.95
Men's TRU SPEC BDU Style EMS Pants (Dark Navy) Style# 1120082	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$57.95
Men's TRU SPEC 24/7 Poly/Cotton Ripstop Short (Dark Navy or Navy) Style#4267002	\$36.95	\$36.95	\$36.95	\$36.95	\$36.95	\$41.95
Propper Tact. Pants Olive Green 65% Poly. 35% Cotton Ripstop Style# F525250001	\$36.95	\$36.95	\$36.95	\$36.95	\$36.95	\$41.95
Sweaters						
PSC Uniform Apparel Full Zip Cardigan Sweater- Style #4012- Black	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$48.95

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

PSC Uniform Apparel V-Neck Ribbed Commando Sweater-Style #8082- Black	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$55.95
PSC Uniform Apparel Crew Neck Ribbed Commando Sweater-Style #8083- Black	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$48.95
Cobmex V-Neck Large Ribbed Wooly Pully Sweater (Navy) W/Patches, Badge Holder & N'Plate Eyelets Style# 8081	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$48.95
Cobmex V-Neck Sweater (Navy) W/Patches , Badge Holder & N'Plate Eyelets Style	\$48.95	\$48.95	\$48.95	\$48.95	\$48.95	\$55.95
Cobmex Zipper Front Crew Cardigan Sweater (Navy) W/Patches, Badge Holder & N'Plate Eyelets Style# 5088	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$48.95
Jackets						
5.11 Tactical 5 in 1 Jacket- Style #48017- Black & Dark Navy with patched Shell and liner	\$226.95	\$226.95	\$226.95	\$226.95	\$226.95	\$237.95
Spiewak Water Proof Duty Jacket- Style #S310G- Black	\$163.95	\$163.95	\$163.95	\$163.95	\$163.95	\$167.95
Spiewak Duty Jacket (Waterproof) Dark Navy Style# S310G	\$163.95	\$163.95	\$163.95	\$163.95	\$163.95	\$167.95
Propper Tac. U Coat Olive Green Style# F542438330	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$55.95
5.11 Tact. Fleece W/Patches and Badge Holder (Dark Navy) Style# 48038	\$104.95	\$104.95	\$104.95	\$104.95	\$104.95	\$116.95
Fleece Jacket 100% Polyester (Black) W/Embroidered Dispatcher Logo	\$125.99	\$125.99	\$125.99	\$125.99	\$125.99	\$136.95
Gloves & Glove Pouches						
Resistant Glove W/Kevlar Lining- - Black	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95
Street Guard Glove W/Kevlar- - Black	\$34.95	\$34.95	\$34.95	\$34.95	\$34.95	\$34.95
Leather Basketweave Glove Pouch	\$12.95	\$12.95	\$12.95	\$12.95	\$12.95	\$12.95
Specialist Glove- - Black	\$31.95	\$31.95	\$31.95	\$31.95	\$31.95	\$31.95
Sub Zero Duty Glove- Style #DZ-9-Black	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95
5.11 Tactical TAK-AK2 Gloves-Style #59341- Black(or equivalent)	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95	\$45.95

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

Blackhawk S.O.L.A.G. Gloves W/Kevlar- Style #8114SMBK(or equivalent)	\$62.95	\$62.95	\$62.95	\$62.95	\$62.95	\$62.95
Handcuffs & Handcuff Cases						
Smith and Wesson (or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Model 100 Chain Linked Handcuffs- SKU #350103- Nickel	\$31.95	\$31.95	\$31.95	\$31.95	\$31.95	\$31.95
Smith and Wesson (or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Blue Steel Finish Chain Linked Handcuffs- SKU #350101- Blue	\$31.95	\$31.95	\$31.95	\$31.95	\$31.95	\$31.95
Smith and Wesson (or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Model 300P Hinged Nickel Handcuff- SKU #350138- Nickel	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95
Smith and Wesson(or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Blue Hinged Handcuffs- SKU #350095 - Blue	\$37.95	\$37.95	\$37.95	\$37.95	\$37.95	\$37.95
Smith and Wesson(or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Universal Chain Linked Handcuffs- SKU #C864 -Nickel	\$34.95	\$34.95	\$34.95	\$34.95	\$34.95	\$34.95
Smith and Wesson(or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Universal Hinged Handcuffs- SKU #350133 – Nickel	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$52.95	\$52.95
Zak Tools Black Pocket Handcuff Key- Style #ZT14	\$11.95	\$11.95	\$11.95	\$11.95	\$11.95	\$11.95
ASP Handcuff Key- Style #56901	\$20.95	\$20.95	\$20.95	\$20.95	\$20.95	\$20.95
Don Hume Handcuff Case W/ Flap- Style #C303 - Basket Weave- Both Brass and Nickel Snaps	\$27.95	\$27.95	\$27.95	\$27.95	\$27.95	\$27.95
Don Hume Open Top Leather Basketweave Handcuff Case Style# C305-M	\$25.95	\$25.95	\$25.95	\$25.95	\$25.95	\$25.95
Gould and Goodrich K-Force Handcuff Case W/Snap- Style #K840 – Plain- Brass and Nickel Snaps	\$23.95	\$23.95	\$23.95	\$23.95	\$23.95	\$23.95
Gould and Goodrich Leather Open Top Cuff Case- Style # B85W- Basket Weave	\$28.95	\$28.95	\$28.95	\$28.95	\$28.95	\$28.95

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

Don Hume Double Snap Keepers- Style #S502-1 - Basket Weave- Both Nickel and Brass(or equivalent)	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$7.00
<u>Flashlight, Flashlight Case & Accessories</u>						
Streamlight (or equivalent) Strion Rechargeable Compact Flashlight- Style #74001	\$111.95	\$111.95	\$111.95	\$111.95	\$111.95	\$111.95
Streamlight (or equivalent) TLR-1 HL Tact. Gun Mounted Weapon Light Style# 69260	\$144.95	\$144.95	\$144.95	\$144.95	\$144.95	\$144.95
StreamLight Stinger(or equivalent) DS LED Flashlight With Fast Charge Style# 75814	\$133.95	\$133.95	\$133.95	\$133.95	\$133.95	\$133.95
Streamlight Strion (or equivalent)Rechargeable C4 LED Flashlight Style# 54910	\$10.50	\$10.50	\$10.50	\$10.50	\$10.50	\$10.50
Streamlight (or equivalent)TLR-1S LED Gun Light With Strobe Function Style# 320	\$142.95	\$142.95	\$142.95	\$142.95	\$142.95	\$142.95
Blackhawk XIPHOS NT Gun Mounted Flashlight Style# 75206 (or equivalent)	\$153.95	\$153.95	\$153.95	\$153.95	\$153.95	\$153.95
Leather Basketweave Double Ring Flashlight Holder Style# S505-D	\$15.95	\$15.95	\$15.95	\$15.95	\$15.95	\$15.95
Leather Closed Top Holder for Streamlight Strion Flashlight- Style #K672-5W- Basket Weave	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95
Replacement Xenon Bulb for Strion Rechargeable Flashlight- Style #74914	\$10.95	\$10.95	\$10.95	\$10.95	\$10.95	\$10.95
Replacement Battery Stick for Strion Rechargeable Flashlight- Style #74175	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95
<u>Safety Range Glasses & Ear Protection</u>						
UVEX Genesis XC Eyewear Protection- Style # S3300 (Clear Lens), S3301 (Gray Lens), S3309 (Amber Lens)- Black Frame(or equivalent)	\$16.95	\$16.95	\$16.95	\$16.95	\$16.95	\$16.95
Howard Leight Lightning L3 Hearing Protection- SKU #1010924- Black(or equivalent)	\$31.95	\$31.95	\$31.95	\$31.95	\$31.95	\$31.95

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

Campaign Cords (Silver and Gold)	\$9.50	\$9.50	\$9.50	\$9.50	\$9.50	\$9.50
Swivel Chin Strap	\$8.50	\$8.50	\$8.50	\$8.50	\$8.50	\$8.50
Clear Hat Cover For S-42	\$10.50	\$10.50	\$10.50	\$10.50	\$10.50	\$10.50
Mouton Fur Hat (Dark Navy)	\$31.95	\$31.95	\$31.95	\$31.95	\$31.95	\$31.95
Breakaway Velcro Tie 100% Polyester (Dark Navy) Short, Regular, Long, X-Long	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$6.50
ASP Expandable Baton 21" Style# 82105	\$90.95	\$90.95	\$90.95	\$90.95	\$90.95	\$90.95
ASP Rotating Sidebreak Scabbard for 21" Expandable Baton Style# 82107	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95
Tourniquet North American Rescue C.A.T. Combat Style# 30-000(or equivalent)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Tourniquet Holder North American Belt Holder Style# 80-0268(or equivalent)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<u>Volunteer Program</u>						
Elbeco Response Uf/x Performance Tactical Polo, Royal Blue SW672	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$45.95
Elbeco Response Women's Uf/x Performance Tactical Polo, Royal Blue ST120	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$45.95
<i>Polo Shirt Customization:</i> MCSO patch embroidered on left chest with text "VOLUNTEER" embroidered above the patch.	\$14.00	\$14.00	\$14.00	\$14.00	\$14.00	\$14.00
TRU SPEC 24 7 Ripstop Pants, Khaki TR549	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$52.95
Women's Tru Spec 24 7 Ripstop Pants TR625	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$52.95
5.11 Tactical TDU Belt with 1 1/2" Plastic Buckle, Tan NP569	\$46.95	\$46.95	\$46.95	\$46.95	\$46.95	\$52.95
Gerber Eclipse SX Lime Jacket with Warrior Softshell JX029	\$226.95	\$226.95	\$226.95	\$226.95	\$226.95	\$237.95
<i>Jacket Customization:</i> SHERIFF VOLUNTEER silkscreened/ printed on back of shell. MCSO patch embroidered on left chest with text "VOLUNTEER" embroidered above the patch on the liner.	\$22.00	\$22.00	\$22.00	\$22.00	\$22.00	\$22.00
TOTAL	\$7,538.24	\$7,538.24	\$7,538.24	\$7,538.24	\$7,538.24	\$7,925.65

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

UFX Light Blue or White Elbeco S/S Pocket Polo W/Embroidery Style# K5103	\$50.95	\$50.95	\$50.95	\$50.95	\$50.95	\$58.95
UFX Tact. Knit S/S Polo Shirt Elbeco, Dark Navy, Black, Green, White W/Embroidery Style# K5131	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$52.95
UFX Tact. Knit L/S Polo Shirt Elbeco, Dark Navy, Black, Green, White W/Embroidery Style# K5144	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$41.95	\$47.95
Mock Turtleneck L/S Shirt (Dark Navy) W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold)	\$24.95	\$24.95	\$24.95	\$24.95	\$24.95	\$27.95
Mock Turtleneck Dickie (Dark Navy) W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold)	\$24.95	\$24.95	\$24.95	\$24.95	\$24.95	\$27.95
Mock Underarmour T-Neck (Dark Navy) L/S Shirt W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold) Style# 1244393	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$60.95
Propper Tac. U Combat L/S Shirt Olive Green QTR Zip Style# F541738330L2	\$75.95	\$75.95	\$75.95	\$75.95	\$75.95	\$81.95
5.11 Tactical Firefighter QTR Zip Job Shirt Black W/Embroidered Dispatch Logo Style# 72314	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$80.95
Mock Turtleneck (Dark Navy) W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold)	\$24.95	\$24.95	\$24.95	\$24.95	\$24.95	\$27.95
Mock Underarmour T-Neck (Dark Navy) L/S Shirt W/MCSO Embroidered (Silver or Gold) Style# 1244393	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$60.95
Propper Tac. U Combat L/S Shirt Olive Green QTR Zip Style# F541738330L2	\$75.95	\$75.95	\$75.95	\$75.95	\$75.95	\$81.95
5.11 Tactical Firefighter QTR Zip Job Shirt Black W/Embroidered Dispatch Logo Style# 72314	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$80.95
Pants						
Tru-Spec 24-7 Series Men's Tactical Pants- Style #1073- Black & Khaki 65/35- Poly/Cotton RipStop	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$60.95

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

Tru-Spec 24-7 Series Ladies Tactical Pants- Style #1095- Black & Khaki 65/35- Poly/Cotton RipStop	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$60.95
Tru-Spec 24-7 Series Men's Ascent Pants- Style #1036- Black & Khaki 65/35- Poly/Cotton RipStop	\$65.95	\$65.95	\$65.95	\$65.95	\$65.95	\$72.95
Tru-Spec Tactical Response Uniform (TRU) Pants- Style #1289- Black- 65/35 Poly/Cotton Ripstop	\$46.95	\$46.95	\$46.95	\$46.95	\$46.95	\$50.95
5.11 Taclite Pro Pants- Style #74273- TDU Khaki, Coyote	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$60.95
5.11 Tactical Pants- Style #74251- Khaki, Coyote	\$56.95	\$56.95	\$56.95	\$56.95	\$56.95	\$61.95
5.11 women's Taclite Propants Khaki Style# 64360	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$60.95
Men's Elbeco Duty Max Hidden Pocket Pants (Dark Navy) 75/25 Blend Style# E224RN	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$80.95
women's Elbeco Duty Max Hidden Pocket Pants (Dark Navy) 75/25 Blend Style# E9224LC	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$72.95	\$80.95
Men's 100% Polyester Pants (Dark Navy) 4 Pocket Fechheimer Style# 28200	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$50.95
women's 100% Polyester Pants (Dark Navy) 4 Pocket Fechheimer Style# 38233	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$50.95
women's TRU SPEC 24/7 Ripstop Pants Khaki Style# 1095002	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$60.95
Men's TRU SPEC 24/7 Ripstop Pants Khaki Style# 1061083	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$60.95
Men's TRU SPEC BDU Style EMS Pants (Dark Navy) Style# 1120082	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$60.95
Men's TRU SPEC 24/7 Poly/Cotton Ripstop Short (Dark Navy or Navy) Style#4267002	\$38.95	\$38.95	\$38.95	\$38.95	\$38.95	\$43.95
Propper Tact. Pants Olive Green 65% Poly. 35% Cotton Ripstop Style# F525250001	\$38.95	\$38.95	\$38.95	\$38.95	\$38.95	\$43.95
Sweaters						
PSC Uniform Apparel Full Zip Cardigan Sweater- Style #4012- Black	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$50.95

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

PSC Uniform Apparel V-Neck Ribbed Commando Sweater-Style #8082- Black	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$58.95
PSC Uniform Apparel Crew Neck Ribbed Commando Sweater-Style #8083- Black	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$50.95
Cobmex V-Neck Large Ribbed Wooly Pully Sweater (Navy) W/Patches, Badge Holder & N'Plate Eyelets Style# 8081	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$50.95
Cobmex V-Neck Sweater (Navy) W/Patches , Badge Holder & N'Plate Eyelets Style	\$50.95	\$50.95	\$50.95	\$50.95	\$50.95	\$58.95
Cobmex Zipper Front Crew Cardigan Sweater (Navy) W/Patches, Badge Holder & N'Plate Eyelets Style# 5088	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$50.95
Jackets						
5.11 Tactical 5 in 1 Jacket- Style #48017- Black & Dark Navy with patched Shell and liner	\$237.95	\$237.95	\$237.95	\$237.95	\$237.95	\$248.95
Spiewak Water Proof Duty Jacket- Style #S310G- Black	\$171.95	\$171.95	\$171.95	\$171.95	\$171.95	\$175.95
Spiewak Duty Jacket (Waterproof) Dark Navy Style# S310G	\$171.95	\$171.95	\$171.95	\$171.95	\$171.95	\$175.95
Propper Tac. U Coat Olive Green Style# F542438330	\$51.95	\$51.95	\$51.95	\$51.95	\$51.95	\$58.95
5.11 Tact. Fleece W/Patches and Badge Holder (Dark Navy) Style# 48038	\$109.95	\$109.95	\$109.95	\$109.95	\$109.95	\$122.95
Fleece Jacket 100% Polyester (Black) W/Embroidered Dispatcher Logo	\$131.95	\$131.95	\$131.95	\$131.95	\$131.95	\$142.99
Gloves & Glove Pouches						
Resistant Glove W/Kevlar Lining- - Black	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95
Street Guard Glove W/Kevlar- - Black	\$36.95	\$36.95	\$36.95	\$36.95	\$36.95	\$36.95
Leather Basketweave Glove Pouch	\$13.95	\$13.95	\$13.95	\$13.95	\$13.95	\$13.95
Specialist Glove- - Black	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95
Sub Zero Duty Glove- Style #DZ-9-Black	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95
5.11 Tactical TAK-AK2 Gloves-Style #59341- Black(or equivalent)	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95	\$47.95

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

Blackhawk S.O.L.A.G. Gloves W/Kevlar- Style #8114SMBK(or equivalent)	\$65.95	\$65.95	\$65.95	\$65.95	\$65.95	\$65.95
Handcuffs & Handcuff Cases						
Smith and Wesson (or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Model 100 Chain Linked Handcuffs- SKU #350103- Nickel	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95
Smith and Wesson (or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Blue Steel Finish Chain Linked Handcuffs- SKU #350101- Blue	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95
Smith and Wesson (or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Model 300P Hinged Nickel Handcuff- SKU #350138- Nickel	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95
Smith and Wesson(or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Blue Hinged Handcuffs- SKU #350095 - Blue	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95	\$39.95
Smith and Wesson(or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Universal Chain Linked Handcuffs- SKU #C864 -Nickel	\$36.95	\$36.95	\$36.95	\$36.95	\$36.95	\$36.95
Smith and Wesson(or equivalent Peerless or Hiatt Brand) Universal Hinged Handcuffs- SKU #350133 – Nickel	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$54.95	\$54.95
Zak Tools Black Pocket Handcuff Key- Style #ZT14	\$12.95	\$12.95	\$12.95	\$12.95	\$12.95	\$12.95
ASP Handcuff Key- Style #56901	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95	\$21.95
Don Hume Handcuff Case W/ Flap- Style #C303 - Basket Weave- Both Brass and Nickel Snaps	\$28.95	\$28.95	\$28.95	\$28.95	\$28.95	\$28.95
Don Hume Open Top Leather Basketweave Handcuff Case Style# C305-M	\$26.95	\$26.95	\$26.95	\$26.95	\$26.95	\$26.95
Gould and Goodrich K-Force Handcuff Case W/Snap- Style #K840 – Plain- Brass and Nickel Snaps	\$24.95	\$24.95	\$24.95	\$24.95	\$24.95	\$24.95
Gould and Goodrich Leather Open Top Cuff Case- Style # B85W- Basket Weave	\$29.95	\$29.95	\$29.95	\$29.95	\$29.95	\$29.95

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

Don Hume Double Snap Keepers- Style #S502-1 - Basket Weave- Both Nickel and Brass(or equivalent)	\$7.95	\$7.95	\$7.95	\$7.95	\$7.95	\$7.95
<u>Flashlight, Flashlight Case & Accessories</u>						
Streamlight (or equivalent) Strion Rechargeable Compact Flashlight- Style #74001	\$116.95	\$116.95	\$116.95	\$116.95	\$116.95	\$116.95
Streamlight (or equivalent) TLR-1 HL Tact. Gun Mounted Weapon Light Style# 69260	\$151.95	\$151.95	\$151.95	\$151.95	\$151.95	\$151.95
StreamLight Stinger(or equivalent) DS LED Flashlight With Fast Charge Style# 75814	\$139.95	\$139.95	\$139.95	\$139.95	\$139.95	\$139.95
Streamlight Strion (or equivalent)Rechargeable C4 LED Flashlight Style# 54910	\$12.95	\$12.95	\$12.95	\$12.95	\$12.95	\$12.95
Streamlight (or equivalent)TLR-1S LED Gun Light With Strobe Function Style# 320	\$149.95	\$149.95	\$149.95	\$149.95	\$149.95	\$149.95
Blackhawk XIPHOS NT Gun Mounted Flashlight Style# 75206 (or equivalent)	\$160.95	\$160.95	\$160.95	\$160.95	\$160.95	\$160.95
Leather Basketweave Double Ring Flashlight Holder Style# S505-D	\$16.95	\$16.95	\$16.95	\$16.95	\$16.95	\$16.95
Leather Closed Top Holder for Streamlight Strion Flashlight- Style #K672-5W- Basket Weave	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95
Replacement Xenon Bulb for Strion Rechargeable Flashlight- Style #74914	\$10.95	\$10.95	\$10.95	\$10.95	\$10.95	\$10.95
Replacement Battery Stick for Strion Rechargeable Flashlight- Style #74175	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95
<u>Safety Range Glasses & Ear Protection</u>						
UVEX Genesis XC Eyewear Protection- Style # S3300 (Clear Lens), S3301 (Gray Lens), S3309 (Amber Lens)- Black Frame(or equivalent)	\$17.95	\$17.95	\$17.95	\$17.95	\$17.95	\$17.95
Howard Leight Lightning L3 Hearing Protection- SKU #1010924- Black(or equivalent)	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00
Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers

Campaign Cords (Silver and Gold)	\$9.95	\$9.95	\$9.95	\$9.95	\$9.95	\$9.95
Swivel Chin Strap	\$8.95	\$8.95	\$8.95	\$8.95	\$8.95	\$8.95
Clear Hat Cover For S-42	\$10.95	\$10.95	\$10.95	\$10.95	\$10.95	\$10.95
Mouton Fur Hat (Dark Navy)	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$32.95
Breakaway Velcro Tie 100% Polyester (Dark Navy) Short, Regular, Long, X-Long	\$6.95	\$6.95	\$6.95	\$6.95	\$6.95	\$6.95
ASP Expandable Baton 21" Style# 82105	\$94.95	\$94.95	\$94.95	\$94.95	\$94.95	\$94.95
ASP Rotating Sidebreak Scabbard for 21" Expandable Baton Style# 82107	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95
Tourniquet North American Rescue C.A.T. Combat Style# 30-000(or equivalent)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Tourniquet Holder North American Belt Holder Style# 80-0268(or equivalent)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<u>Volunteer Program</u>						
Elbeco Response Uf/x Performance Tactical Polo, Royal Blue SW672	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$47.95
Elbeco Response Women's Uf/x Performance Tactical Polo, Royal Blue ST120	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$47.95
<i>Polo Shirt Customization:</i> MCSO patch embroidered on left chest with text "VOLUNTEER" embroidered above the patch.	\$14.00	\$14.00	\$14.00	\$14.00	\$14.00	\$14.00
TRU SPEC 24 7 Ripstop Pants, Khaki TR549	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$54.95
Women's Tru Spec 24 7 Ripstop Pants TR625	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$54.95
5.11 Tactical TDU Belt with 1 1/2" Plastic Buckle, Tan NP569	\$24.95	\$24.95	\$24.95	\$24.95	\$24.95	\$28.95
Gerber Eclipse SX Lime Jacket with Warrior Softshell JX029	\$237.95	\$237.95	\$237.95	\$237.95	\$237.95	\$248.95
<i>Jacket Customization:</i> SHERIFF VOLUNTEER silkscreened/ printed on back of shell. MCSO patch embroidered on left chest with text "VOLUNTEER" embroidered above the patch on the liner.	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$20.00
TOTAL	\$7,853.30	\$7,853.30	\$7,853.30	\$7,853.30	\$7,853.30	\$8,254.34
GRAN TOTAL	\$22,430.43	\$22,430.43	\$22,430.43	\$22,430.43	\$22,430.43	\$23,576.88

SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 07/10/2015 @ 1:00

Bid/RFP: Bid 15-58 Uniforms Plus Accessories
for Deputy Sheriffs, Officers, & Volunteer Officers