**Date:** 7/09/2015

**Bid/RFP:** Bid 15-59 Provide County Sheriff's Squad Car

		VENDOR			VENDOR			VENDOR			
Vendor LUND IND City/State NORTHBROOK IL			POLICE DEPARTMENT SYSTEM TINLEY PARK IL			RAY O'HERRON DANVILLE IL					
ORIGINAL SIGNATURE	ORIGINAL SIGNATURE YES  MANDATORY PAGES YES				YES			YES			
MANDATORY PAGES					YES			YES			
	Base Term	Option Year 2	Option Year 3	Base Term	Option Year 2	Option Year 3	Base Term	Option Year 2	Option Year 3		
Code 3 Light Bar (21TR plus multi-color) Part # 21247MC Unit Cost \$ Total \$	\$1,264.00 \$16,432.00	\$1,264.00 \$16,432.00	\$1,264.00 \$16,432.00	\$1,275.00 \$16,575.00	\$1,310.00 \$17,030.00	\$1,340.00 \$17,420.00	\$2,049.00 \$26,637.00	\$2,131.00 \$27,703.00	\$2,216.00 \$28,808.00		
Setina PB400 Aluminum Push Bumper for Dodge Charger, Item # BK0532CGR11SSSCA – Qty. 13 Unit Cost \$ Total \$	+35/pc for Freight for quantities under 13 \$225.00 \$2,925.00	+35/pc for Freight for quantities under 13 \$231.00 \$3,003.00	+35/pc for Freight for quantities under 13 \$238.00 \$3,094.00	\$249.30 \$3,240.90	\$254.40 \$3,307.20	\$262.40 \$3,411.20	\$227.00 \$2,951.00	\$236.00 \$3,068.00	\$245.00 \$3,185.00		
Setina # 6S Single Prisoner Transport – Coated Policy Window – For use with Setina Full Transport Seat Dodge Charger. Item # 1K0573CGR11PSCA – Qty. 13 Unit Cost \$ Total \$	+120/ea for freight for quantities under 13 \$664.00 \$8,632.00	+120/ea for freight for quantities under 13 \$684.00 \$8,892.00	+120/ea for freight for quantities under 13 \$704.00 \$9,152.00	\$775.00 \$10,075.00	\$792.00 \$10,296.00	\$798.00 \$10,374.00	\$668.00 \$8,684.00	\$695.00 \$9,035.00	\$723.00 \$9,399.00		
Code 3 Siren deluxe remote, 200w output w/programmable push button and side switch controls. Item # Z3 – Qty.  13 Unit Cost \$	\$585.00	\$585.00	\$585.00	\$652.00	\$669.00	\$715.00	\$689.00	\$716.00	\$745.00		
Total \$	\$7,605.00	\$7,605.00	\$7,605.00	\$8,476.00	\$8,697.00	\$9,295.00	\$8,957.00	\$9,308.00	\$9,685.00		

**Date:** 7/09/2015

**Bid/RFP:** Bid 15-59 Provide County Sheriff's Squad Car

		-							
Havis 2001-2014 Dodge Charger Vehicle Specific 17" Console including the following fill plates: (x2) C-FP-20 (x1) C-EB25-XTL-1P (x1) C-EB35-CZ3-1P – Qty. 13  Unit Cost \$ Total \$	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$271.90 \$3,534.70	\$280.25 \$3,643.25	\$292.00 \$3,796.00	\$292.00 \$3,796.00	\$304.00 \$3,952.00	\$316.00 \$4,108.00
Havis Cup Holder, Item # C-				\$3,534.70	\$3,043.25	\$3,796.00	\$3,796.00	\$3,952.00	\$4,108.00
CUP2-1 - Qty. 13  Unit Cost \$  Total \$	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$28.50 \$370.50	\$29.85 \$388.05	\$31.45 \$408.85	\$28.50 \$370.50	\$30.00 \$390.00	\$31.00 \$403.00
Havis Armrest for top mount, large pad. Item # C- ARM-1-3 - Qty. 13 Unit Cost \$ Total \$	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$63.50 \$825.50	\$67.50 \$877.50	\$69.20 \$899.60	\$60.00 \$780.00	\$62.00 \$806.00	\$64.00 \$832.00
Havis delay timer, Item # CG-X - Qty. 13									
Unit Cost \$ Total \$	\$60.50 \$786.50	\$62.35 \$810.55	\$64.20 \$834.60	\$63.25 \$822.25	\$67.50 \$877.50	\$69.50 \$903.50	\$61.50 \$799.50	\$64.00 \$832.00	\$67.00 \$871.00
Code 3, 4 pack LED. Item # HB4PAK- Qty. 13									
Unit Cost \$ Total \$	\$95.00 \$1,235.00	\$95.00 \$1,235.00	\$95.00 \$1,235.00	\$126.46 \$1,643.98	\$129.25 \$1,680.25	\$132.45 \$1,721.85	\$116.00 \$1,508.00	\$121.00 \$1,573.00	\$126.00 \$1,638.00
Able 2 LED flasher stop/tail/turn for Charger, Item # 11.1005.STTBTL - Qty. 13  Unit Cost \$	\$30.75	\$31.67	\$32.62	\$32.57	\$34.10	\$35.25	\$27.00	\$28.00	\$29.00
Total \$	\$399.75	\$411.71	\$424.06	\$423.41	\$443.30	\$458.25	\$351.00	\$364.00	\$377.00

**Date:** 7/09/2015

Bid/RFP: Bid 15-59 Provide County Sheriff's Squad Car

Accessories

Federal Signal 100-Watt compact speaker with neodymium. Item # ES100C - Qty. 13	SID	SID	SID						
Unit Cost \$ Total \$	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$118.00 \$1,534.00	\$120.00 \$1,560.00	\$122.50 \$1,592.50	\$149.00 \$1,937.00	\$155.00 \$2,015.00	\$161.00 \$2,093.00
Federal Signal 2011 Taurus, Charger, and new Interceptor Sedan, Item # ESB-TAR11 - Qty. 13 Unit Cost \$ Total \$	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$21.49 \$279.37	\$23.20 \$301.60	\$24.75 \$321.75	\$23.00 \$299.00	\$24.00 \$312.00	\$25.00 \$325.00
TOTAL	\$38,015.25	\$38,389.26	\$38,776.66	\$47,800.61	\$49,101.65	\$50,602.50	\$57,070.00	\$59,358.00	\$61,724.00
Savings									

Sent to potential bidders. Submittals received from **4**.

**Date:** 7/09/2015

**Bid/RFP:** Bid 15-59 Provide County Sheriff's Squad Car

		VENDOR			VENDOR		VENDOR			
Vendor		ULTRASTROBE								
City/State		CRYSTAL LAKE IL								
ORIGINAL SIGNATURE		YES								
MANDATORY PAGES		YES								
	Base Term	Option Year 2	Option Year 3	Base Term	Option Year 2	Option Year 3	Base Term	Option Year 2	Option Year 3	
Code 3 Light Bar (21TR plus multi-color) Part # 21247MC										
Unit Cost \$	\$1,249.00	\$1,286.00	\$1,324.00							
Total \$	\$16,237.00	\$16,718.00	\$17,212.00							
Setina PB400 Aluminum Push Bumper for Dodge Charger, Item # BK0532CGR11SSSCA – Qty.										
13 Unit Cost \$ Total \$	\$234.95 \$3,054.35	\$241.99 \$3,145.87	\$249.95 \$3,249.35							
Setina # 6S Single Prisoner Transport – Coated Policy Window – For use with Setina Full Transport Seat Dodge Charger. Item # 1K0573CGR11PSCA – Qty. 13 Unit Cost \$ Total \$	\$662.95	\$682.95	\$703.95							
Code 3 Siren deluxe	\$8,618.35	\$8,878.35	\$9,151.35							
remote, 200w output w/programmable push button and side switch controls. Item # Z3 – Qty.										
13 Unit Cost \$ Total \$	\$611.00 \$7,943.00	\$629.95 \$8,189.35	\$648.95 \$8,436.35							

**Date:** 7/09/2015

**Bid/RFP:** Bid 15-59 Provide County Sheriff's Squad Car

·		•				
Havis 2001-2014 Dodge						
Charger Vehicle Specific						
17" Console including the						
following fill plates:						
(x2) C-FP-20						
(x1) C-EB25-XTL-1P						
(x1) C-EB35-CZ3-1P — Qty.						
13						
Unit Cost \$	\$265.95	\$273.95	\$282.95			
Total \$	\$3,457.35	\$3,561.35	\$3,678.35			
Havis Cup Holder, Item # C-						
CUP2-1 - Qty. 13						
Unit Cost \$						
Total \$	\$26.95	\$27.95	\$28.95			
	\$350.35	\$363.35	\$376.35			
Havis Armrest for top						
mount, large pad. Item # C-						
ARM-1-3 - Qty. 13						
Unit Cost \$	\$65.00	\$66.95	\$68.95			
Total \$	\$845.00	\$870.35	\$896.35			
Havis delay timer, Item #		,	,			
CG-X - Qty. 13						
Unit Cost \$		4				
•	\$59.95	\$61.95	\$63.95			
Total \$	\$779.35	\$805.35	\$831.35			
Code 3, 4 pack LED. Item #						
HB4PAK- Qty. 13						
Unit Cost \$	\$115.95	\$119.95	\$123.95			
Total \$	\$1,507.35	\$1,559.35	\$1,611.35			
Able 2 LED flasher		. ,	. ,			
stop/tail/turn for Charger,						
Item # 11.1005.STTBTL -						
Qty. 13						
Unit Cost \$	422.05	400.05	404.05			
11	\$29.95	\$30.95	\$31.95			
Total \$	\$389.35	\$402.35	\$415.35			

**Date:** 7/09/2015

Bid/RFP: Bid 15-59 Provide County Sheriff's Squad Car

Accessories

Federal Signal 100-Watt						
compact speaker with						
neodymium. Item # ES100C						
- Qty. 13						
Unit Cost \$	\$144.95	\$149.95	\$154.95			
Total \$	\$1,884.35	\$1,949.35	\$2,014.35			
Federal Signal 2011 Taurus,						
Charger, and new						
Interceptor Sedan, Item #						
ESB-TAR11 - Qty. 13						
Unit Cost \$	\$16.95	\$17.95	\$18.95			
Total \$	\$220.35	\$233.35	\$246.35			
TOTAL	\$45,286.15	\$46,676.37	\$48,118.85			
Savings						

Sent to potential bidders. Submittals received from **4**.