
                        

SUMMARY SHEET Date: 7/30/15 

County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 15-60 Laptops/Scanners/Label Writer 
 

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS 

 VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR 

Vendor 

City/State 

Aprisa Technology 

Roslyn NY 

Business Services 

Longboat Key FL 

CDI Computer 
Dealers 

Markham ON Canada 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE/Mandatory Pages YES YES YES 

ASUS K200MA (or equivalent*) LAPTOPS – Qty 630 

INTEL CELERON 4GB Memory 500GB HDD+3GB ASUS 
WEBSTORAGE (3YEARS) BLACK 11.6" Notebook WINDOWS 8.164 
BIT K200MA-DS01T(S) MANUF PART# KS00MA-DSO1T(S)  
SKU  VSU-102577246 

 
Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $315.98 
Total: $199,067.40 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $315.00 
Total: $198,450.00 

*If Equivalent, list Make & Model 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $298.00 
Total: $187,740.00 
Asus #k200ma-
ds01t(s) 

  

BARCODE SCANNERS & CABLES – Qty 630 
Symbol Digital Scanner Manufacturer Part # DS9707-SR20007ZZR 
DS 6707 SR Barcode Scanner Handheld Decoded  
#YYl1=DG8297 CAB=U01-S07ZAR 7ft USB Univ Style3 Cablestraight 
Dura Gray 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $292.00 
Total:183,960.00 

No Bid  

*If Equivalent, list Make & Model   

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $101.95 
Total: $64,228.50 
#ls20001r-ur 

DYMO 450 (or equivalent*) Label Writer Printers – Qty 630 

Label, mail, and file more efficiently with DYMO LabelTM software 
and DYMO Stamps® Customize and print address, shipping, file 
folder and barcode labels, plus name badges and more – all from 
your PC or Mac®* 
Print USPS®-approved DYMO Stamps® postage directly from your 
desktop – no monthly fee, contracts or commitments required** 
Print fast – up to 71 labels per minute*** *Compatible with 
Windows® 7 or later and Mac OS® X v10.8 or later. *Microsoft and 
Windows are either registered trademarks or trademarks of 
Microsoft Corporation in the United States and/or other countries. 
Mac and OS X are trademarks of Apple Inc., registered in the U.S. 
and other countries. **Internet connection required. DYMO 
Stamps® service provided by Endicia® a licensed USPS® PC 
Postage™ provider. No-monthly service fee requires DYMO 
Stamps® Internet Postage Labels. ***4-line address label; Package 
includes: LabelWriter® 450 Turbo Label Printer; Address Labels 
Starter Roll; DYMO Stamps® Starter Roll; Adapter; Power Cable; 
USB Cable; Quick Start Guide Cleaning Card; 
DYMO® LabelTM Software Installation CD. Warranty Information: 
2-Year Limited Warranty 

 
Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $73.98 
Total: $46,607.40 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $120.30 
Total: $75,789.00 

*If Equivalent, list Make & Model 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $68.00 
Total: $42,840.00 
Dymo #1752264 

  

  
Free Shipping 
 

Liftgate $43.50 

Number of days for delivery after receipt of purchase order. 15-30 Days 7-14 Days 15-20 Days 

TOTAL SECTION I 
$187,740.00 
(equivalent) 

$199,067.40 $198,450.00 

TOTAL SECTION II $183,960.00  
$64,228.50 
(equivalent) 

TOTAL SECTION III 
$42,840.00 
(equivalent) 

$46,607.40 $75,789.00 

Sent to 5 potential bidders. Submittals received from 17. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



                        

SUMMARY SHEET Date: 7/30/15 

County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 15-60 Laptops/Scanners/Label Writer 
 

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS 

 VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR 

Vendor 

City/State 

CDW 

Vernon Hills IL 

En Pointe Tech 

Gardena CA 

Logisoft Computer 

Fairport NY 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE/Mandatory Pages YES YES YES 

ASUS K200MA (or equivalent*) LAPTOPS – Qty 630 

INTEL CELERON 4GB Memory 500GB HDD+3GB ASUS 
WEBSTORAGE (3YEARS) BLACK 11.6" Notebook WINDOWS 8.164 
BIT K200MA-DS01T(S) MANUF PART# KS00MA-DSO1T(S)  
SKU  VSU-102577246 

   

*If Equivalent, list Make & Model 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $406.74 
Total: $256,246.20 
Asus z379564gb4gb 
T200ta-c1-bl 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $297.52 
Total: $187,437.60 
#k200ma-ds01t(s) 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $294.82 
Total: $185,736.60 
#k200ma-ds01t 

BARCODE SCANNERS & CABLES – Qty 630 
Symbol Digital Scanner Manufacturer Part # DS9707-SR20007ZZR 
DS 6707 SR Barcode Scanner Handheld Decoded  
#YYl1=DG8297 CAB=U01-S07ZAR 7ft USB Univ Style3 Cablestraight 
Dura Gray 

 No Bid 
Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $277.91 
Total: $175,083.30 

*If Equivalent, list Make & Model 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $220.13 
Total: $138,681.90 
Wasp 

  

DYMO 450 (or equivalent*) Label Writer Printers – Qty 630 

Label, mail, and file more efficiently with DYMO LabelTM software 
and DYMO Stamps® Customize and print address, shipping, file 
folder and barcode labels, plus name badges and more – all from 
your PC or Mac®* 
Print USPS®-approved DYMO Stamps® postage directly from your 
desktop – no monthly fee, contracts or commitments required** 
Print fast – up to 71 labels per minute*** *Compatible with 
Windows® 7 or later and Mac OS® X v10.8 or later. *Microsoft and 
Windows are either registered trademarks or trademarks of 
Microsoft Corporation in the United States and/or other countries. 
Mac and OS X are trademarks of Apple Inc., registered in the U.S. 
and other countries. **Internet connection required. DYMO 
Stamps® service provided by Endicia® a licensed USPS® PC 
Postage™ provider. No-monthly service fee requires DYMO 
Stamps® Internet Postage Labels. ***4-line address label; Package 
includes: LabelWriter® 450 Turbo Label Printer; Address Labels 
Starter Roll; DYMO Stamps® Starter Roll; Adapter; Power Cable; 
USB Cable; Quick Start Guide Cleaning Card; 
DYMO® LabelTM Software Installation CD. Warranty Information: 
2-Year Limited Warranty 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $59.18 
Total: $37,283.40 

 
Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $63.03 
Total: $39,708.90 

*If Equivalent, list Make & Model  
Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $114.06 
Total: $71,857.80 

 

    

Number of days for delivery after receipt of purchase order. 7-14 Days 15 days 2-5 Days 

TOTAL SECTION I 
$256,246.20 

(alternate Asus) 
$187,437.60 

$185,736.60 
(equivalent) 

TOTAL SECTION II 
$138,681.90 
(equivalent) 

 $175,083.30 

TOTAL SECTION III $37,283.40 
$71,857.80 
(equivalent) 

$39,708.90 

Sent to 5 potential bidders. Submittals received from 17. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



                        

SUMMARY SHEET Date: 7/30/15 

County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 15-60 Laptops/Scanners/Label Writer 
 

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS 

 VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR 

Vendor 

City/State 

MSA Systems 

San Jose CA 

OM Office Supply 

Mechanicsburg PA 

Peacock Systems 

Chino CA 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE/Mandatory Pages YES YES YES 

ASUS K200MA (or equivalent*) LAPTOPS – Qty 630 

INTEL CELERON 4GB Memory 500GB HDD+3GB ASUS 
WEBSTORAGE (3YEARS) BLACK 11.6" Notebook WINDOWS 8.164 
BIT K200MA-DS01T(S) MANUF PART# KS00MA-DSO1T(S)  
SKU  VSU-102577246 

No Bid 
Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $296.80 
Total: $186,984.00 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $293.00 
Total: $184,590.00 

*If Equivalent, list Make & Model    

BARCODE SCANNERS & CABLES – Qty 630 
Symbol Digital Scanner Manufacturer Part # DS9707-SR20007ZZR 
DS 6707 SR Barcode Scanner Handheld Decoded  
#YYl1=DG8297 CAB=U01-S07ZAR 7ft USB Univ Style3 Cablestraight 
Dura Gray 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $209.00 
Total: $131,670.00 
Pn-ds6707-
sr2000722r 
Cba-401-s072ar 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $258.10 
Total: $162,603.00 
Ds6707sr2000722r 
Ds6707sr 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $219.00 
Total: $137,970.00 

*If Equivalent, list Make & Model    

DYMO 450 (or equivalent*) Label Writer Printers – Qty 630 

Label, mail, and file more efficiently with DYMO LabelTM software 
and DYMO Stamps® Customize and print address, shipping, file 
folder and barcode labels, plus name badges and more – all from 
your PC or Mac®* 
Print USPS®-approved DYMO Stamps® postage directly from your 
desktop – no monthly fee, contracts or commitments required** 
Print fast – up to 71 labels per minute*** *Compatible with 
Windows® 7 or later and Mac OS® X v10.8 or later. *Microsoft and 
Windows are either registered trademarks or trademarks of 
Microsoft Corporation in the United States and/or other countries. 
Mac and OS X are trademarks of Apple Inc., registered in the U.S. 
and other countries. **Internet connection required. DYMO 
Stamps® service provided by Endicia® a licensed USPS® PC 
Postage™ provider. No-monthly service fee requires DYMO 
Stamps® Internet Postage Labels. ***4-line address label; Package 
includes: LabelWriter® 450 Turbo Label Printer; Address Labels 
Starter Roll; DYMO Stamps® Starter Roll; Adapter; Power Cable; 
USB Cable; Quick Start Guide Cleaning Card; 
DYMO® LabelTM Software Installation CD. Warranty Information: 
2-Year Limited Warranty 

No Bid  
Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $64.95 
Total: $40,918.50 

*If Equivalent, list Make & Model  

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $105.15 
Total: $66,244.50 
1752265 

 

    

Number of days for delivery after receipt of purchase order. 7-10 Days 12 Days 7-10 Days 

TOTAL SECTION I  $186,984.00 $184,590.00 

TOTAL SECTION II $131,670.00 $162,603.00 $137,970.00 

TOTAL SECTION III  
$66,244.50 
(equivalent) 

$40,918.50 

Sent to 5 potential bidders. Submittals received from 17. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



                        

SUMMARY SHEET Date: 7/30/15 

County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 15-60 Laptops/Scanners/Label Writer 
 

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS 

 VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR 

Vendor 

City/State 

Refub Factory 

Alexandria VA 

Saitech Inc 

Fremont CA 

Scan Technology 

Manchester TN 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE/Mandatory Pages YES YES YES 

ASUS K200MA (or equivalent*) LAPTOPS – Qty 630 

INTEL CELERON 4GB Memory 500GB HDD+3GB ASUS 
WEBSTORAGE (3YEARS) BLACK 11.6" Notebook WINDOWS 8.164 
BIT K200MA-DS01T(S) MANUF PART# KS00MA-DSO1T(S)  
SKU  VSU-102577246 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $322.00 
Total: $202,860.00 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $292.00 
Total: $183,960.00 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $308.00 
Total: $194,040.00 

*If Equivalent, list Make & Model    

BARCODE SCANNERS & CABLES – Qty 630 
Symbol Digital Scanner Manufacturer Part # DS9707-SR20007ZZR 
DS 6707 SR Barcode Scanner Handheld Decoded  
#YYl1=DG8297 CAB=U01-S07ZAR 7ft USB Univ Style3 Cablestraight 
Dura Gray 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $288.00 
Total: $181,440.00 

No Bid  

*If Equivalent, list Make & Model   

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $179.00 
Total: $112,770.00 
Voyager 1450g 

DYMO 450 (or equivalent*) Label Writer Printers – Qty 630 

Label, mail, and file more efficiently with DYMO LabelTM software 
and DYMO Stamps® Customize and print address, shipping, file 
folder and barcode labels, plus name badges and more – all from 
your PC or Mac®* 
Print USPS®-approved DYMO Stamps® postage directly from your 
desktop – no monthly fee, contracts or commitments required** 
Print fast – up to 71 labels per minute*** *Compatible with 
Windows® 7 or later and Mac OS® X v10.8 or later. *Microsoft and 
Windows are either registered trademarks or trademarks of 
Microsoft Corporation in the United States and/or other countries. 
Mac and OS X are trademarks of Apple Inc., registered in the U.S. 
and other countries. **Internet connection required. DYMO 
Stamps® service provided by Endicia® a licensed USPS® PC 
Postage™ provider. No-monthly service fee requires DYMO 
Stamps® Internet Postage Labels. ***4-line address label; Package 
includes: LabelWriter® 450 Turbo Label Printer; Address Labels 
Starter Roll; DYMO Stamps® Starter Roll; Adapter; Power Cable; 
USB Cable; Quick Start Guide Cleaning Card; 
DYMO® LabelTM Software Installation CD. Warranty Information: 
2-Year Limited Warranty 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $104.00 
Total: $65,520.00 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $63.73 
Total: $40,149.90 

 

*If Equivalent, list Make & Model   

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $73.00 
Total: $45,990.00 
Honeywell 1450g2d 

    

Number of days for delivery after receipt of purchase order. 14 Days 15 Days 30 Days 

TOTAL SECTION I $202,860.00 $183,960.00 $194,040.00 

TOTAL SECTION II $181,440.00  $112,770.00 

TOTAL SECTION III $65,520.00 $40,149.90 
$45,990.00 
(equivalent) 

Sent to 5 potential bidders. Submittals received from 17. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



                        

SUMMARY SHEET Date: 7/30/15 

County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 15-60 Laptops/Scanners/Label Writer 
 

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS 

 VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR 

Vendor 

City/State 

SDF Professional  

Greenville NC 

SHI International 

Somerset NJ 

SSI 

Northbrook IL 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE/Mandatory Pages YES YES YES 

ASUS K200MA (or equivalent*) LAPTOPS – Qty 630 

INTEL CELERON 4GB Memory 500GB HDD+3GB ASUS 
WEBSTORAGE (3YEARS) BLACK 11.6" Notebook WINDOWS 8.164 
BIT K200MA-DS01T(S) MANUF PART# KS00MA-DSO1T(S)  
SKU  VSU-102577246 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $289.00 
Total: $182,070.00 
K200ma-ds01t(s) 

 
Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $304.86 
Total: $192,061.80 

*If Equivalent, list Make & Model  

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $286.80 
Total: $180,684.00 
Acer Aspire V3-112P-
C2P6 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $386.99 
Total: $243,803.70 
HP215g1 

BARCODE SCANNERS & CABLES – Qty 630 
Symbol Digital Scanner Manufacturer Part # DS9707-SR20007ZZR 
DS 6707 SR Barcode Scanner Handheld Decoded  
#YYl1=DG8297 CAB=U01-S07ZAR 7ft USB Univ Style3 Cablestraight 
Dura Gray 

No Bid 
Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $261.90 
Total: $164,997.00 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $250.86 
Total: $158,041.80 

*If Equivalent, list Make & Model    

DYMO 450 (or equivalent*) Label Writer Printers – Qty 630 

Label, mail, and file more efficiently with DYMO LabelTM software 
and DYMO Stamps® Customize and print address, shipping, file 
folder and barcode labels, plus name badges and more – all from 
your PC or Mac®* 
Print USPS®-approved DYMO Stamps® postage directly from your 
desktop – no monthly fee, contracts or commitments required** 
Print fast – up to 71 labels per minute*** *Compatible with 
Windows® 7 or later and Mac OS® X v10.8 or later. *Microsoft and 
Windows are either registered trademarks or trademarks of 
Microsoft Corporation in the United States and/or other countries. 
Mac and OS X are trademarks of Apple Inc., registered in the U.S. 
and other countries. **Internet connection required. DYMO 
Stamps® service provided by Endicia® a licensed USPS® PC 
Postage™ provider. No-monthly service fee requires DYMO 
Stamps® Internet Postage Labels. ***4-line address label; Package 
includes: LabelWriter® 450 Turbo Label Printer; Address Labels 
Starter Roll; DYMO Stamps® Starter Roll; Adapter; Power Cable; 
USB Cable; Quick Start Guide Cleaning Card; 
DYMO® LabelTM Software Installation CD. Warranty Information: 
2-Year Limited Warranty 

  
Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $65.86 
Total: $41,491.80 

*If Equivalent, list Make & Model 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $66.00 
Total: $41,580.00 
Dymo 1752265 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $81.75 
Total: $51,502.50 
Brother QL-700 

 

    

Number of days for delivery after receipt of purchase order. 10-15 Days 15-20 Days 15 Days 

TOTAL SECTION I $182,070.00 
$180,684.00 
(equivalent) 

$192,061.80 

TOTAL SECTION II  $164,997.00 $158,041.80 

TOTAL SECTION III 
$41,580.00 
(equivalent) 

$51,502.50 $41,491.80 

Sent to 5 potential bidders. Submittals received from 17. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



                        

SUMMARY SHEET Date: 7/30/15 

County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 15-60 Laptops/Scanners/Label Writer 
 

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS 

 VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR 

Vendor 

City/State 

Think! 

(Printer Supplies Inc) 

Crystal Lake IL 

TigerDirect 

Naperville IL 
 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE/Mandatory Pages YES YES  

ASUS K200MA (or equivalent*) LAPTOPS – Qty 630 

INTEL CELERON 4GB Memory 500GB HDD+3GB ASUS 
WEBSTORAGE (3YEARS) BLACK 11.6" Notebook WINDOWS 8.164 
BIT K200MA-DS01T(S) MANUF PART# KS00MA-DSO1T(S)  
SKU  VSU-102577246 

No Bid 
Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $319.99 
Total: $201,593.70 

 

*If Equivalent, list Make & Model    

BARCODE SCANNERS & CABLES – Qty 630 
Symbol Digital Scanner Manufacturer Part # DS9707-SR20007ZZR 
DS 6707 SR Barcode Scanner Handheld Decoded  
#YYl1=DG8297 CAB=U01-S07ZAR 7ft USB Univ Style3 Cablestraight 
Dura Gray 

No Bid 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $195.84 
Total: $123,379.20 
Cables: 
$13.60/ea 
Total: $8,568.00 
TOTAL:131,947.20 

 

*If Equivalent, list Make & Model    

DYMO 450 (or equivalent*) Label Writer Printers – Qty 630 

Label, mail, and file more efficiently with DYMO LabelTM software 
and DYMO Stamps® Customize and print address, shipping, file 
folder and barcode labels, plus name badges and more – all from 
your PC or Mac®* 
Print USPS®-approved DYMO Stamps® postage directly from your 
desktop – no monthly fee, contracts or commitments required** 
Print fast – up to 71 labels per minute*** *Compatible with 
Windows® 7 or later and Mac OS® X v10.8 or later. *Microsoft and 
Windows are either registered trademarks or trademarks of 
Microsoft Corporation in the United States and/or other countries. 
Mac and OS X are trademarks of Apple Inc., registered in the U.S. 
and other countries. **Internet connection required. DYMO 
Stamps® service provided by Endicia® a licensed USPS® PC 
Postage™ provider. No-monthly service fee requires DYMO 
Stamps® Internet Postage Labels. ***4-line address label; Package 
includes: LabelWriter® 450 Turbo Label Printer; Address Labels 
Starter Roll; DYMO Stamps® Starter Roll; Adapter; Power Cable; 
USB Cable; Quick Start Guide Cleaning Card; 
DYMO® LabelTM Software Installation CD. Warranty Information: 
2-Year Limited Warranty 

 
Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $73.44 
Total: $46,267.20 

 

*If Equivalent, list Make & Model 

Qty: 630 
Price Ea: $61.69 
Total: $38,864.70 
DYM1752265 

  

    

Number of days for delivery after receipt of purchase order. 10-14 Days   

TOTAL SECTION I  $201,593.70  

TOTAL SECTION II  $131,947.20  

TOTAL SECTION III 
$38,864.70 
(equivalent) 

$46,267.20  

Sent to 5 potential bidders. Submittals received from 17. 


