
                                                  

SUMMARY SHEET Date: 03/19/15 

County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: 15-21 Aggregate Materials 
 

 

 VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR 

Vendor 
City/State 

MEYER MATERIAL 
MCHENRY IL 

VULCAN CONSTRUCTION 
NAPERVILLE IL 

WILLIAM CHARLES 
LOVES PARK IL 

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE YES YES YES 

MANDATORY PAGES INCLUDED? YES YES YES 

Section I    

CA-6 (CA-6 Roadstone; Grade 8 Limestone; Grade 9 
Crushed Gravel) 
*We do NOT use any Recycled Concrete CA-6 

$11.00/ton 
Algonquin Pit Only 

$22.50/ton $4.25/ton 

RR1 Rip Rap Stone (Small 1” – 2” stone) $ No Bid $30.00/ton $12.50/ton 

RR3 Rip Rap Stone (Large 3” – 6” stone) $ No Bid $44.00/ton $21.50/ton 

Torpedo Sand (Trench Backfill) $9.00/ton $ No Bid $4.25/ton 

Mason Sand $14.00/ton  $ No Bid $4.25/ton 

#6 Washed Stone (Pipe bedding stone) $12.00/ton McHenry Pit $ No Bid $12.50/ton 

Pea Gravel $6.00/ton $ No Bid $3.50/ton 

Section II    
CA-6 (CA-6 Roadstone; Grade 8 Limestone; Grade 9 
Crushed Gravel) 
*We do NOT use any Recycled Concrete CA-6 

$11.00/ton 
Algonquin Pit Only 

$22.50/ton $4.25/ton 

RR1 Rip Rap Stone (Small 1” – 2” stone) $ No Bid $30.00/ton $12.50/ton 

RR3 Rip Rap Stone (Large 3” – 6” stone) $ No Bid $44.00/ton $21.50/ton 

Torpedo Sand (Trench Backfill) $9.00/ton $ No Bid $4.25/ton 

Mason Sand $14.00/ton  $ No Bid $4.25/ton 

#6 Washed Stone (Pipe bedding stone) $12.00/ton McHenry Pit $ No Bid $12.50/ton 

Pea Gravel $6.00/ton $ No Bid $3.50/ton 

Section III    
CA-6 (CA-6 Roadstone; Grade 8 Limestone; Grade 9 
Crushed Gravel) 
*We do NOT use any Recycled Concrete CA-6 

$11.00/ton 
Algonquin Pit Only 

$15.50/ton $4.25/ton 

RR1 Rip Rap Stone (Small 1” – 2” stone) $ No Bid $23.50/ton $12.50/ton 

RR3 Rip Rap Stone (Large 3” – 6” stone) $ No Bid $40.00/ton $21.50/ton 

Torpedo Sand (Trench Backfill) $9.00/ton $ No Bid $4.25/ton 

Mason Sand $14.00/ton  $ No Bid $4.25/ton 

#6 Washed Stone (Pipe bedding stone) $12.00/ton McHenry Pit $ No Bid $12.50/ton 

Pea Gravel $6.00/ton $ No Bid $3.50/ton 

Section IV    
CA-6 (CA-6 Roadstone; Grade 8 Limestone; Grade 9 
Crushed Gravel) 
*We do NOT use any Recycled Concrete CA-6 

$11.00/ton 
Algonquin Pit Only 

$15.50/ton $4.25/ton 

RR1 Rip Rap Stone (Small 1” – 2” stone) $ No Bid $23.50/ton $12.50/ton 

RR3 Rip Rap Stone (Large 3” – 6” stone) $ No Bid $40.00/ton $21.50/ton 

Torpedo Sand (Trench Backfill) $9.00/ton $ No Bid $4.25/ton 

Mason Sand $14.00/ton  $ No Bid $4.25/ton 

#6 Washed Stone (Pipe bedding stone) $12.00/ton McHenry Pit $ No Bid $12.50/ton 

Pea Gravel $6.00/ton $ No Bid $3.50/ton 

Savings $ $ $ 

Sent to 6 potential bidders. Submittals received from 3. 


