TABULATION SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 8/13/2014

Bid/RFP: Bid 14-66 Solid Waste Disposal & Recycling
Equipment & Services

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
VENDOR Advanced Disposal Groot Industries MDC Environment Services
CITY/STATE Davis Junction, IL. Elk Grove Village, IL. Rockford, IL.
ORIGINAL SIGNATURE Yes Yes Yes
MANDATORY PAGES Yes Yes Yes
Base Option Option Base Option Option Base Option Option
Year Year 2 Year 3 Year Year 2 Year 3 Year Year 2 Year 3
Monthly Monthly Monthly Monthly Monthly Monthly Monthly Monthly Monthly
Charge Charge Charge Charge Charge Charge Charge Charge Charge
RECYCLE/TRASH BID
Admin. Bldg—-6 Yd
Weekly Pickup Freq: 1 65.00 68.25 71.66 34.10 35.12 36.17 26.20 26.20 26.20
Recycle Container
Admin. Bldg-6Yd
Weekly Pickup Freq: 1 71.50 75.08 78.83 58.26 60.00 61.80 105.00 105.00 105.00
Trash Container
Building A—4Yd
Weekly Pickup Freq: 1 65.00 68.25 71.66 25.40 26.16 26.95 26.20 26.20 26.20
Recycle Container
BuildingA-6Yd
Weekly Pickup Freq: 1 71.50 75.08 78.83 58.26 60.00 61.80 105.00 105.00 105.00
Trash Container
Gov. Ctr. — 28 Yd Compactor
Weekly Pickup Freq: Per Pull 175.00 183.75 192.84 195.00 205.00 215.00 275.00 275.00 275.00
Recycle Container
Gov. Ctr. — 40 Yd Compactor
Weekly Pickup Freq: Per Pull 395.00 141.75 435.49 465.00 475.00 485.00 750.00 750.00 750.00
Trash Container




TABULATION SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 8/13/2014
Bid/RFP: Bid 14-66 Solid Waste Disposal & Recycling
Equipment & Services

OPTIONAL

Gov. Ctr. — 26 Yd Self-
Contained Compactor
Weekly Pickup Freq: Per Pull
Trash Container

495.00

519.75

545.74

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

550.00

550.00

550.00

Health/Animal Ctrl -2/2 Yd
Weekly Pickup Freq: 1
Recycle Container

65.00

68.25

71.66

30.34

31.25

32.19

26.20

26.20

26.20

Health/Animal Ctrl -4 Yd
Weekly Pickup Freq: 1
Trash Container

65.00

68.25

71.66

51.62

53.17

54.76

40.00

40.00

40.00

Div. of Transp. -1 Yd
Weekly Pickup Freq: 1
Recycle Container

47.63

50.01

52.51

15.26

15.73

16.20

26.20

26.20

26.20

Div of Transp.—20 Yd Roll Off
Weekly Pickup Freq: Per Pull
Trash Container

295.00

309.75

325.24

375.00

385.00

395.00

375.00

375.00

375.00

Valley Hi—10 Yd Roll Off
Weekly Pickup Freq: Per Pull
Recycle Container

175.00

183.75

192.94

195.00

205.00

215.00

105.00

105.00

105.00

Valley Hi— 25 Yd Self-
Contained Compactor
Weekly Pickup Freq: Per Pull
Trash Container

495.00

519.75

545.74

465.00

475.00

485.00

550.00

550.00

550.00

TOTAL

2,480.63

2,604.67

2,734.90

7,053.23

7,261.43

7,469.87

2,959.80

2,959.80

2,959.80

OPTIONAL

500 Russel Court—1.5 Yd
Weekly Pickup Freq: 1
Recycle Container

65.00

68.25

71.66

16.20

16.70

17.20

26.20

26.20

26.20

\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\ OPTIONAL

500 Russel Court—2 Yd
Weekly Pickup Freq: 1
Trash Container

23.83

25.04

27.00

38.34

39.49

40.68

35.00

35.00

35.00




TABULATION SHEET Date: 8/13/2014
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept  Bid/RFP: Bid 14-66 Solid Waste Disposal & Recycling
Equipment & Services

TOTAL 88.83 93.29 98.66 54.54 56.19 57.88 61.20 61.20 61.20

COMPACTOR LEASE BID—INCLUDES LEASE & FULL SERVICE MAINTENANCE ON HYDRAULIC COMPACTORS

Gov. Ctr —28 Yd Compactor

Number of Compactors: 1 340.00 340.00 340.00 235.00 235.00 235.00. 70.00 70.00 70.00
Recycle Container

Gov. Ctr— 40 Yd Compactor

Number of Compactors: 1 230.00 230.00 230.00 235.00 235.00 235.00 70.00 70.00 70.00
Trash Container

OPTIONAL
Gov. Ctr.~ 26 Yd Compactor 375.00 375.00 375.00 70.00 70.00 70.00
Number of Compactors: 1 : ’ : No Bid No Bid No Bid ) ) :

Trash Container

Valley Hi—25 Yd Compactor

Number of Compactors: 1 375.00 375.00 375.00 250.00 250.00 250.00 70.00 70.00 70.00
Trash Container

TOTAL 1,320.00* 1,320.00 1,320.00 720.00 720.00 720.00 280.00 280.00 280.00

OPTION — LEASE/PURCHASE

COMPACTOR LEASE/PURCHASE BID-INCLUDES LEASE & FULL SERVICE MAINTENANCE ON HYDRAULIC COMPACTORS

Gov. Ctr —28 Yd Compactor

Number of Compactors: 1 766.00 766.00 766.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 814.00 814.00 814.00
Recycle Container

Gov. Ctr—40 Yd Compactor

Number of Compactors: 1 475.00 475.00 475.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 814.00 814.00 814.00
Trash Container

OPTIONAL
Gov. Ctr.— 26 Yd Self-

. 770.00 770.00 770.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 839.00 839.00 839.00
Contained Compactor

Number of Compactors: 1




TABULATION SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 8/13/2014

Bid/RFP: Bid 14-66 Solid Waste Disposal & Recycling
Equipment & Services

Trash Container

Valley Hi-25 Yd Self-
Contained Compactor

770.00

770.00 770.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 839.00 839.00 839.00
Number of Compactors: 1
Trash Container
TOTAL 2,781.00* 2,781.00 2,781.00 0.00** 0.00** 0.00%** 3,306.00 3,306.00 3,306.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,670.46 6,798.96 6,934.56 7,827.77** 8,037.62** 8,247.75** 6,607.00 6,607.00 6,607.00

*dx&**PLEASE SEE BID SUBMISSIONS FOR VENDOR NOTES EXPLAINING THEIR BID******

VENDOR

VENDOR

VENDOR




TABULATION SHEET Date: 8/13/2014
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept  Bid/RFP: Bid 14-66 Solid Waste Disposal & Recycling
Equipment & Services

VENDOR Republic Services Waste Management
CITY/STATE Elgin, Il. Lombard, IL.

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE Yes Yes Yes

MANDATORY PAGES Yes Yes Yes
Base Option Option Base Option Option Base Option Option
Year Year 2 Year 3 Year Year 2 Year 3 Year Year 2 Year 3
Monthly Monthly Monthly Monthly Monthly Monthly Monthly Monthly Monthly
Charge Charge Charge Charge Charge Charge Charge Charge Charge

RECYCLE/TRASH BID

Admin. Bldg—-6 Yd

Weekly Pickup Freq: 1 52.00 53.50 55.20 48.06
Recycle Container

Admin. Bldg-6Yd

Weekly Pickup Freq: 1 65.00 66.95 69.00 59.75
Trash Container

Building A—4Yd

Weekly Pickup Freq: 1 35.00 36.05 37.15 38.00
Recycle Container

BuildingA-6Yd

Weekly Pickup Freq: 1 65.00 66.95 69.00 59.75

Trash Container

Gov. Ctr. — 28 Yd Compactor

Weekly Pickup Freq: Per Pull 190.00 195.70 201.60 129.00
Recycle Container

Gov. Ctr. — 40 Yd Compactor

Weekly Pickup Freq: Per Pull 745.00 767.35 790.40 129.00
Trash Container

OPTIONAL

Gov. Ctr. — 26 Yd Self- No Bid No Bid No Bid 154.00
Contained Compactor




County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

TABULATION SHEET

Date: 8/13/2014
Bid/RFP: Bid 14-66 Solid Waste Disposal & Recycling
Equipment & Services

Weekly Pickup Freq: Per Pull
Trash Container

Health/Animal Ctrl -2/2 Yd
Weekly Pickup Freq: 1
Recycle Container

35.00

36.05

37.15

25.00

Health/Animal Ctrl -4 Yd
Weekly Pickup Freq: 1
Trash Container

45.00

46.35

47.75

39.84

Div. of Transp.—1Yd
Weekly Pickup Freq: 1
Recycle Container

20.00

21.00

22.00

20.00

Div of Transp.—20 Yd Roll Off
Weekly Pickup Freq: Per Pull
Trash Container

330.00

340.00

350.00

129.00

Valley Hi— 10 Yd Roll Off
Weekly Pickup Freq: Per Pull
Recycle Container

45.00

46.35

47.75

80.11

Valley Hi— 25 Yd Self-
Contained Compactor
Weekly Pickup Freq: Per Pull
Trash Container

525.00

547.75

557.00

No Bid

TOTAL

2,152.00

2,217.00

2,284.00

911.51%%**

OPTIONAL

500 Russel Court—1.5 Yd
Weekly Pickup Freq: 1
Recycle Container

20.00

22.00

24.00

22.00

26.200PTIONAL
500 Russel Court—2 Yd
Weekly Pickup Freq: 1
Trash Container

30.00

31.00

32.00

30.00




TABULATION SHEET Date: 8/13/2014
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept  Bid/RFP: Bid 14-66 Solid Waste Disposal & Recycling
Equipment & Services

TOTAL 50.00 53.00 56.00 52.00

COMPACTOR LEASE BID—INCLUDES LEASE & FULL SERVICE MAINTENANCE ON HYDRAULIC COMPACTORS

Gov. Ctr —28 Yd Compactor

Number of Compactors: 1 175.0 175.00 175.00 No Bid No Bed No Bid
Recycle Container

Gov. Ctr— 40 Yd Compactor

Number of Compactors: 1 175.00 175.00 175.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Trash Container

OPTIONAL

Gov. Ctr.— 26 Yd Compactor . . .
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Number of Compactors: 1

Trash Container

Valley Hi—25 Yd Compactor

Number of Compactors: 1 175.00 175.00 175.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Trash Container

TOTAL 525.00 525.00 525.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

OPTION — LEASE/PURCHASE

COMPACTOR LEASE/PURCHASE BID-INCLUDES LEASE & FULL SERVICE MAINTENANCE ON HYDRAULIC COMPACTORS

Gov. Ctr —28 Yd Compactor

Number of Compactors: 1 175.00 175.00 175.00 188.00 No Bid No Bid
Recycle Container

Gov. Ctr—40 Yd Compactor

Number of Compactors: 1 175.00 175.00 175.00 188.00 No Bid No Bid
Trash Container

OPTIONAL

Gov. Ctr.— 26 Yd Self-
. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Contained Compactor

Number of Compactors: 1




County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

TABULATION SHEET

Date: 8/13/2014

Bid/RFP: Bid 14-66 Solid Waste Disposal & Recycling
Equipment & Services

Trash Container

Valley Hi-25 Yd Self-
Contained Compactor

175.00 175.00 175.00 197.00 No Bid No Bid
Number of Compactors: 1
Trash Container
TOTAL 525.00 525.00 525.00 573.00 No Bid No Bid
GRAND TOTAL | 3,252.00*** | 3,323.00*** 3,390.00*** | 1,536.51%**** No Bid No Bid

*dx&**PLEASE SEE BID SUBMISSIONS FOR VENDOR NOTES EXPLAINING THEIR BID******

*Equipment purchase is amortized over a 36 month duration
** No Bid on some options
***No Bid on some options
****No Bid on some options

Sent to 12 potential bidders
Submittals received from 5.




