SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14
Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS
City/State TAMPA. FL
Original Signature
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il

December 1, 2014

December 1, 2015

December 1, 2016

November 30, 2015

November 30, 2016

November 30, 2017

SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY

Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section Il Box Case Box Case =V'—6)X Case
SM-LG no'
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered po
XLG aeJ
X ~
Brand/Mfg #: nn L % (4
L
Section lll Box Case ‘gox Caﬂnb Box
0 L% [
SM-LG [a I
. Nl |
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl | ¥ A |
XLG N I‘ ' h
| I\. |
Brand/Mfg #: Nu
Section IV Box Case Box ' Box Case
SM-LG I n GI
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free 1’
XLG Ieb
AN
Brand/Mfg #: 9@ Fl r
Section V Box | n &’ Case Box Case Box Case
. \ %4
BIac.k Nitrile Powder Free SM-LG h
6 mil
Textured grip XLG —
Puncture & abrasion resistant 3XL
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil . MXLG
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #:

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY




SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14
Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor CPR SAVERS & FIRST AIDE
City/State SCOTTSDALE AZ
Original Signature
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG I V e
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered Alnl o
XLG qpu
Brand/Mfg #: (e '
ran g A
Section Il Box Case N@I J Case P Case’ t‘.a
[ 4
0 it
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl sy an?
RE ou
. gL 1 I"l
Brand/Mfg #: w’l I
Section IV Box Case oX CasFD Box Case
oY
SM-LG I ua
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free i Al‘,'
XLG
09
Brand/Mfg #: v
Section V Box G Box Case Box Case
BIac.k Nitrile Powder Free SM-LG 0
6 mil
Textured grip XLG — !
Puncture & abrasion resistant 3XL
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil . MXLG
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #:

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY




SUMMARY SHEET

County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14

Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor HP PRODUCTS
City/State ALSIP IL
Original Signature
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il

December 1, 2014

December 1, 2015

December 1, 2016

November 30, 2015

November 30, 2016

November 30, 2017

SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY

Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG ive
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered ‘5,
XLG norl
Brand/Mfg #: R ”’r
Section Il Box Case ( ﬂ Case :h gax Case I
NV gV HI
. -nn |
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl U’ I I
XLG sp IJ D
f . va ’ 57
Brand/Mfg #: . r! H
Section IV Box Case N@E’ox Cas;l wl v Box Case
j )
SM-LG | deu
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free GIL
n
” >
Brand/Mfg #: e‘
Section V Box 4_9@? Box Case Box Case
BIac.k Nitrile Powder Free SM-LG by
6 mil
Textured grip XLG — |
Puncture & abrasion resistant 3XL
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil . MXLG
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #:

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY




SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14

Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor TRONEX
City/State MOUNT OLIVE NJ
Original Signature
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered ‘V’e
XLG 5
A
Brand/Mfg #: OUI
Section lll Box Case Box . Reglse Bpe Case
¥ ’
SM-LG on I | Q
. Py -4 ’
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl P g 1w
XLG 0[ ml
f‘p ~ 1)
Brand/Mfg #: J u
Section IV Box Case Case "Ep_‘ Case
SM-LG i I i
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free g ‘de
XLG GI U
Tell
Brand/Mfg #: @s II
Section V Box Case n [0)4 Case Box Case
BIac.k Nitrile Powder Free SMLLG al I
6 mil ‘A
Textured grip XLG — NU o
Puncture & abrasion resistant 3XL
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil . MXLG
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #:

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY




SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14
Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor MIDWEST MEDICAL
City/State DAYTONA FL
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY YES
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | $6.70 $67.00 $6.83 $68.30 $6.97 $69.70
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG $6.70 $67.00 $6.83 $68.30 $6.97 $69.70
Brand/Mfg #: Digicare Optigrip
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered
XLG No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand/Mfg #:
Section lll Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl
XLG No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand/Mfg #:
Section IV Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | $8.04 $80.40 $8.20 $82.00 $8.37 $83.70
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free
XLG $8.04 $80.40 $8.20 $82.00 $8.37 $83.70
Brand/Mfg #: Digicare Frontline 9”
Section V Box Case Box Case Box Case
Black Nitrile P F
oo itrile Powder Free SMAG | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Textured grip XLG — . . . . . .
Puncture & abrasion resistant XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil
mi . M-XLG | $10.00 $100.00 $10.20 $102.00 $10.40 $104.00
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #: Digicare

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY




SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14
Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor HENRY SCHEIN
City/State IRMO SC
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il

December 1, 2014

December 1, 2015

December 1, 2016

November 30, 2015

November 30, 2016

November 30, 2017

SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY YES
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG s (D
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered ‘iv /
XLG onb
410
Brand/Mfg #: Feal’
A J
Section lll Box Case Case Box Case (
SM-LG I I 5' ' al
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl A on' Dl
XLG
R@.‘pp . ay
Brand/Mfg #: on WI
Section IV Box Case Box Chel Box Case
SM-LG {'G Irlb
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free ‘;v
XLG cihev
Brand/Mfg #: ( |01 v
Section V Box U v Box Case Box Case
— )
BIac.k Nitrile Powder Free SM-LG 0 r
6 mil
Textured grip XLG — 0
Puncture & abrasion resistant 3XL
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil . MXLG
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #: Microflex Safe Grip SG375L

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY




SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14
Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor GARDEN STATE MEDICAL
City/State LAKEWOOD NJ
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY YES
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG
Brand/Mfg #: 'ﬁ
Section Il Box Case Box Case OPSI OX Case
I'
SM-LG 0 Sp
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered e J
XLG on r‘ I
( e A
Brand/Mfg #: | q J H al
Section lll Box Case Box Eﬁol Box (
’ »
SM-LG ( 44 “-h s v
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl 'on A 'l v
N L
Brand/Mfg #: U
Section IV Box Case Box 9 se Box Case
L
SM-LG qhee
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free f > Ad
XLG oduc
Brand/Mfg #:
Section V Box Case Box Case Box Case
BIac.k Nitrile Powder Free SM-LG
6 mil
Textured grip XLG —
Puncture & abrasion resistant 3XL
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil . MXLG
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #:

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY




SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14
Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor BOUNDTREE MEDICAL
City/State DUBLIN OH
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il

December 1, 2014

December 1, 2015

December 1, 2016

November 30, 2015

November 30, 2016

November 30, 2017

SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY YES
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered s 'e
XLG nSIV
Brand/Mfg #: An&
v"
Section lll Box Case lBon ‘ Case . Box Case
} o
W ihlo n
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl ‘Sly iu'v
s il m
. -CF o
Brand/Mfg #: 67 s h vu
'
Section IV Box Case @ Case A Mt!yx Case
SM-LG I udeu
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free 'nc V
XLG I
i
Brand/Mfg #: c qe
Section V Box Caje| t J Box Case Box Case
— HV
BIac.k Nitrile Powder Free SM-LG au
6 mil R
Textured grip XLG — 0 I
Puncture & abrasion resistant 3XL
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil . MXLG
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #:

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY




SUMMARY SHEET

County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14

Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor HUTCHINS & HUTCHINS
City/State WAYNESBOR VA
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY YES
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | $6.25 $62.50 $6.44 $64.40 $6.64 $66.40
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG $6.25 $62.50 $6.44 $64.40 $6.64 $66.40
Brand/Mfg #: Innovative Healthcare 153100 — 153350
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
il Y e di $ {
Glove did not meet specs
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section lll Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | $3.52 $35.20 $3.63 $36.30 $3.74 $37.40
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl
XLG $3.52 $35.20 $3.63 $36.30 $3.74 $37.40
Brand/Mfg #: Innovative Healthcare 153100 — 153350
Section IV Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG . L
Glove did not meet specs
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section V Box Case Box Case Box Case
Black Nitrile Powder F
. ;fil lrile Fowderrree SM-LG | $7.06 $70.60 $7.27 $72.70 $7.49 $74.90
Textured grip XLG —
Puncture & abrasion resistant Only $7.06 $70.60 $7.27 $72.70 $7.49 $74.90
Brand/Mfg #: Amercare 1400-1 —» 1400-4
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff .
15 mi Gl d not meet
. | MXLG ove adid no eel SpecCs
extured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #:

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY




SUMMARY SHEET Date: 10/16/14
County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor A DAIGGER & CO
City/State VERNON HILLS IL
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY YES
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered » ve
XLG ql
v
Brand/Mfg #: oop
Section lll Box Case Box A a.gsle Box Case
Tel L
SM-LG 0 ' e I
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl ¥ bly llal
XLG pon hml
~
. ‘ v-
Brand/Mfg #: F 1 +$a bb
. Ad |
Section IV Box Case BN nn Case leu Case
| °4
SM-LG I de
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free “IL
XLG nb
: D ;9
Brand/Mfg #: ’6
Section V Box Case e pt‘ Case Box Case
BIac.k Nitrile Powder Free SM-LG duv
6 mil or
Textured grip XLG — 0 I’
Puncture & abrasion resistant 2XL
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case

Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil

Textured grip

Puncture & abrasion resistant

M-XLG

Brand/Mfg #:

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY




SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14
Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor PRO2
City/State PINOLE CA
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY YES
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG [
Glove did not meet specs——
XLG \T
Brand/Mfg #:
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG p n
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered !Ove—‘d-l—d—n-(
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section lll Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG -
‘ D
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl = Ove—(
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section IV Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | $4.85 $48.50 $5.14 $51.40 $5.45 $54.50
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free
XLG $4.85 $48.50 $5.14 $51.40 $5.45 $54.50
Brand/Mfg #: CRANBERRY CONTOUR 3116-S; 3117-M; 3118-L; 3119-XL
Section V Box Case Box Case Box Case
Black Nitrile P F
oo itrile Powder Free SMAG | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Textured grip XLG - . . . , , .
Puncture & abrasion resistant XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil
mi . M-XLG No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #:

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY




SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14

Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor PROFESSIONAL MEDICAL & SURGICAL SUPPLY
City/State NEW LENOX IL
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY YES
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered i Ve
XLG I
19
Brand/Mfg #: n
Section lll Box Case Box o I'Case Box Case
SM-LG 0' I lhle
. 2l P
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl Slv-
XLG n hlﬂl
r_1 ~el V }
Brand/Mfg #: eb by
Section IV Box Case Case I ‘M Case
SM-LG I I de
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free "|IV
XLG n
R [+
Brand/Mfg #: P eet"
Section V Box Cas.e . Gt D [0)4 Case Box Case
BIac.k Nitrile Powder Free SM-LG , du
6 mil
Textured grip XLG — 0
Puncture & abrasion resistant 3XL
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil . MXLG
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #:

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY



SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14

Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor NEOGEN
City/State LANSING MI
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY YES
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered
XLG
-:Ve
Brand/Mfg #: 5'
Section lll Box Case Box P Box Case
Al
SM-LG I‘ /
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl il 6 i
XLG ID H al
Or‘ 5 ﬂtt
Brand/Mfg #: ﬂn (1 l
Section IV Box Case Box » V%[se Box‘,h v Case
NO[I i
SM-LG d
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free de-
XLG u
Av
Brand/Mfg #: q I
Section V Box Case \Sh Case Box Case
. | I
BIac.k Nitrile Powder Free SM-LG c'[
6 mil
Textured grip XLG — -
Puncture & abrasion resistant Only n
Vv
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil . MXLG
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #:

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY




SUMMARY SHEET Date: 10/16/14
County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor STAPLES
City/State BROOMFIELD CO
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year lll
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY YES
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | . i
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section Il Box Case Box Box Case Box
SM-LG n
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section lll Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG -
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section IV Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG (\ u
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free JIO\Le—dld—th—meJet—specS—
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section V Box Case Box Case Box Case
BIac.k Nitrile Powder Free SM-LG .
Glove did not meet specs
Textured grip XLG — e A
Puncture & abrasion resistant 3XL
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil
m! ) M-XLG | $8.76 $87.60 $8.76 $87.60 $8.76 $87.60
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #: AMBITEX L620

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY



SUMMARY SHEET Date: 10/16/14
County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor MISSION MEDICAL
City/State EATONTOWN NJ
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY YES
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | $4.40 $39.00 $4.50 $40.00 $4.60 $41.00
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG $4.40 $39.00 $4.50 $40.00 $4.60 $41.00
Brand/Mfg #: VIBRANT 98225-98229 AURELIA/SUPERMAX
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | $3.90 $34.00 $4.00 $35.00 $4.10 $36.00
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered
XLG $3.90 $34.00 $4.00 $35.00 $4.10 $36.00
Brand/Mfg #: VINTAGE 28826-28829 AURELIA/SUPERMAX
Section lll Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | $2.90 $27.00 $3.00 $28.00 $3.10 $29.00
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl
XLG $2.90 $27.00 $3.00 $28.00 $3.10 $29.00
Brand/Mfg #: SYNTHETICVARE PVE5600-5604 EMERALD GLOVES
Section IV Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG I n N
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section V Box Case Box Case Box Case
Black Nitrile Powder F
oo e TOMEETTTES SM-LG | $7.60 $69.00 $7.80 $71.00 $8.00 $73.00
Textured grip XLG —
Puncture & abrasion resistant XL $7.60 $69.00 $7.80 $71.00 $8.00 $73.00
Brand/Mfg #: SEMPERFORCE BKNF104-106 SEMPERMED GLOVES
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff .
15 mi Gl did not meet '
M-XLG (
ove did not meet specs
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #:

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY



SUMMARY SHEET

County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14
Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS
City/State CUDAHY WI
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il

December 1, 2014

December 1, 2015

December 1, 2016

November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY YES
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG .
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | $6.96 $69.60 $7.14 $71.40 $7.32 $73.20
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered
XLG $6.96 $69.60 $7.14 $71.40 $7.32 $73.20
Brand/Mfg #: MICROFLEX FM0150S, FM0150M, FM0150L, FM0150XL
Section lll Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG H
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section IV Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | $61.17 $61.70 $6.33 $63.30 $6.50 $65.00
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free
XLG $6.17 $61.70 $6.33 $63.30 $6.50 $65.00
Brand/Mfg #: DYNAREX 6502, 6503, 6504, 6505
Section V Box Case Box Case Box Case
Black Nitrile P F
oo itrile Powder Free SMAG | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Textured grip XLG — . . . . . .
Puncture & abrasion resistant XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
Bmil MXLG |  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #:

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY




SUMMARY SHEET

County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14

Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor LABSOURCE
City/State NORTHLAKE IL
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il

December 1, 2014

December 1, 2015

December 1, 2016

November 30, 2015

November 30, 2016

November 30, 2017

SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY YES
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section Il Box Case Box Box . Case Box
SM-LG SIV e
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered
XLG
) ‘e
Brand/Mfg #: NBnn (
L4
Section lll Box Case [o)4 Cass‘sl Box I
of b
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl sv,.
XLG ii-h
Brand/Mfg #: Nﬁn W'
Section IV Box Case Box . ”I:la Box Case
SM-LG 5 In J
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free ’lee'
XLG q
ot
Brand/Mfg #: ”
Section V Box . Box Case Box Case
. \
BIac.k Nitrile Powder Free SM-LG No
6 mil
Textured grip XLG —
Puncture & abrasion resistant 3XL
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil . MXLG
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #:

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY




SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14

Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor INTERBORO PACKAGING
City/State MONTGOMERY NY
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY YES
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
Gl not meet specs
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | $3.38 $33.80 $3.88 $38.80 $4.46 $44.60
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered
XLG $3.38 $33.80 $3.88 $38.80 $4.46 $44.60
Brand/Mfg #: AURELIA LP-E
Section lll Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
. Dl s 1
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl IO >
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section IV Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free t—sp‘eGF
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section V Box Case Box Case Box Case
Black Nitrile Powder F
. ;fil lrile Fowderrree SM-LG | $6.29 $31.45* $7.23 $36.15* $8.31 $41.58*
Textured grip LG~ $6.97 $34.85* $8.02 $40.10* $9.22 $46.10*
Puncture & abrasion resistant 3XL : : : : : :
Brand/Mfg #: SAFETY ZONE
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
Bmil MXLG | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #:

*We can only ship 100/box; 10 boxes/case

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY



SUMMARY SHEET Date: 10/16/14
County of McHenry Purchasing Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor SOUTHLAND MEDICAL
City/State ORANGE CA
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY YES
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG i\,e
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered ‘Is,
XLG 00[
Brand/Mfg #: r
Section lll Box Case Norl Case .bl&x Case
SM-LG ' SI ml
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl JI P
XLG S Su
Re stih v
Brand/Mfg #: nn | wru I
3 L4
Section IV Box Case Case A ea oX Case
v~
SM-LG I G
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free ‘5 }
XLG e
he
Brand/Mfg #: b
g% L
Section V Box Ca uu Box Case Box Case
BIac.k Nitrile Powder Free SM-LG
6 mil 0
Textured grip XLG — v
Puncture & abrasion resistant 2XL
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil . MXLG
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #: SMCBLUE SMCBS

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY



SUMMARY SHEET

County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14

Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor CICERO MFG
City/State GLENVIEW IL
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY YES
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG ive
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered rIS,
XLG 0
[
Brand/Mfg #: UVI’
Section lll Box Case Nm( Case .h e Box Ci\sgl
w L] L)
SM-LG ' S|U B I a
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl UI |
XLG 5 Su
Re "y
Brand/Mfg #: N n 1 WI IIl
4
Section IV Box Case Box C#U Box Case
117
SM-LG InG u
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free ‘s P
XLG e
nh@
Brand/Mfg #: _Vt D
Section V Box ‘- %’3 Box Case Box Case
BIac.k Nitrile Powder Free SM-LG IJ
6 mil 0
Textured grip XLG — v
Puncture & abrasion resistant 3XL
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil . MXLG
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #:

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Sub

mittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY




SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14
Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor CCP INDUSTRIES
City/State RICHMOND HEIGHTS OH
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY YES
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered 10
XLG SIV
Brand/Mfg #: %e
Section lll Box Case fo) Case 'é Box Case
|
SM-LG i I / ' a
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl ‘ISI iu.
XLG 00 Ibm
Brand/Mfg #: ’ ll,h slu’
I | J
Section IV Box Case Case . 5‘;( Case
SM-LG Iud
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free 1 c.
XLG If
Brand/Mfg #: f‘
Section V Box Casi ¢ |G | Box Case Box Case
Blac.k Nitrile Powder Free SM-LG oaU
6 mil (a
Textured grip XLG — NU '
Puncture & abrasion resistant 3XL
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil . MXLG
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #:

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY




SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14
Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor MEDLINE
City/State MUNDELEIN IL
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY YES
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | $4.20 $42.00 $4.326 $43.26 $4.456 $44.56
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG $4.20 $42.00 $4.326 $43.26 $4.456 $44.56
Brand/Mfg #: MEDLINE CUR
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | $4.10 $41.00 $4.223 $42.23 $4.350 $43.50
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered
XLG $4.10 $41.00 $4.223 $42.23 $4.350 $43.50
Brand/Mfg #: MEDLINE MG
Section lll Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | $3.00 $30.00 $3.09 $30.90 $3.183 $31.83
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl
XLG $3.00 $30.00 $3.09 $30.90 $3.183 $31.83
Brand/Mfg #: MEDLINE HOME
Section IV Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | $6.00 $60.00 $6.18 $61.80 $6.365 $63.65
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free
XLG $6.00 $60.00 $6.18 $61.80 $6.365 $63.65
Brand/Mfg #: MEDLINE MDS
Section V Box Case Box Case Box Case
Black Nitrile Powder F
oo e TONEETTTES SM-LG N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Textured grip XLG —
Puncture & abrasion resistant 3XL N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil
m! . M-XLG | $8.00 $80.00 $8.24 $82.40 $8.487 $84.87
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #: MEDLINE 485602-03-04

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY




SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Bid/RFP: D

Date: 10/16/14

isposal Gloves

Vendor SHEPARD MEDICAL PRODUCTS
City/State ROSELLE IL
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year lll
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY YES
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
love did not meet specs
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free \J1 e B
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section Il Box -100ct Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG (\ .
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered v-]! V€—d—l—d—n—ojt .I .I !ep.t -.pecs
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section lll Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG h »
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl \ - | ! D "
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section IV Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG I .
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section V Box Case Box Case Box Case
Black Nitrile Powder F
. ;fil lrile Fowderrree SM-LG | $5.30 $53.00 $5.30 $53.00
Textured grip XLG —
Puncture & abrasion resistant 3XL $5.30 $53.00 $5.30 $53.00
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box -50ct Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil
mi . M-XLG | $6.19 $61.90 $6.19 $61.90 No Bid No Bid
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #: ULTIMATES 05342080, 05343080, 05385080

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY



SUMMARY SHEET

County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14
Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor GOLF STAR SUPPLY
City/State LARO FL
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year lll
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY YES
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG n
Glove did ne t specs
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered
XLG No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand/Mfg #:
Section lll Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG -
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl UG !()Ve—de—th
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section IV Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG p "
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free !0V&d—|—d—n—(
XLG
Brand/Mfg #: SEMPERMED SEMPERSURE
Section V Box Case Box Case Box Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free
. SM-LG .
6 mil Glove did not me¢ ce
Textured grip LG — \VIAC B R A IS N > o
Puncture & abrasion resistant 3XL
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil
mi . M-XLG No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #:

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY



SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14

Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor ELKHORN CHEMICAL
City/State ELKHORN WI
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY ONLY FOR SECTION | & I
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered 5 e
XLG V
ns
Brand/Mfg #: ool
Section lll Box Case Bﬁx J Case Box Case
' e
SM-LG | ' I
. N‘ alh 1
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl ! 3'" -ua-
XLG on h
N 4P
Brand/Mfg #: 3[’ . S
Section IV Box Case No X Case | w LIBox Case
SM-LG Ideu
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free Vol
XLG nu
R ts
Brand/Mfg #: 16
Section V Box asey i Box Case Box Case
BIac.k Nitrile Powder Free SM-LG
6 mil a
Textured grip XLG — 0 J
Puncture & abrasion resistant 3XL
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil . MXLG
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #:

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY




SUMMARY SHEET

County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14

Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor PERFORMANCE SAFETY GROUP
City/State FENTON MO
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY ONLY FOR SECTION I, 11, I, IV
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | $4.989 $44.98 $4.989 $44.98 $4.989 $44.98
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG $4.989 $44.98 $4.989 $44.98 $4.989 $44.98
Brand/Mfg #: PSG SKINTEX
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | $4.298 $42.98 $4.298 $42.98 $4.298 $42.98
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered
XLG $4.298 $42.98 $4.298 $42.98 $4.298 $42.98
Brand/Mfg #: PSG SKINTEX
Section lll Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | $2.498 $24.98 $2.498 $24.98 $2.498 $24.98
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl
XLG $2.498 $22.98 $2.498 $24.98 $2.498 $24.98
Brand/Mfg #: PSG SKINTEX
Section IV Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | $4.498 $44.98 $4.989 $44.98 $4.989 $44.98
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free
XLG $4.498 $43.98 $4.989 $43.98 $4.989 $43.98
Brand/Mfg #: PSG SKINTEX
Section V Box Case Box Case Box Case
gli::ilr Nitrile Powder Free SM-LG
Textured grip oo Non-Responsive Full Box of Samples not received
Puncture & abrasion resistant 3XL
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil . .
M-XLG -
Textured grip Non-Responsive Full Box of Samples not received
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #: ‘

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY




SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14
Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor TRU MED
City/State JACKSONVILLE FL
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY ONLY FOR SECTIONS I, 11, llI, IV AND V
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | $5.00 $50.00 $5.00 $50.00 $5.00 $50.00
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG $5.00 $50.00 $5.00 $50.00 $5.00 $50.00
Brand/Mfg #: DURASENSE
Section Il Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG | $5.00 $50.00 $5.00 $50.00 $5.00 $50.00
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered
XLG $5.00 $50.00 $5.00 $50.00 $5.00 $50.00
Brand/Mfg #: DURASENSE
Section lll Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG r\ .
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl \3"‘
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section IV Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG I -
[T =1\ 7/Q " Q
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free IHOVe _—m-eelt—spe S
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section V Box Case Box Case Box Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free SM-LG
6 mil Claviea Aid ne + enace
Textured grip XLG — PIVVSG UTU 1] L IOMYLY
Puncture & abrasion resistant 3XL
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil . .
M-XLG -
Textured grip Non-Responsive Full Box of Samples not received
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #: ‘ ‘

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY




SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing

Date: 10/16/14
Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

Vendor ICS JAIL SUPPLIES
City/State WACO TX
Original Signature YES
Year | Option Year Il Option Year Il
December 1, 2014 December 1, 2015 December 1, 2016
November 30, 2015 November 30, 2016 November 30, 2017
SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY ONLY ON SECTIONS I, 11, lll, AND V
Description Size
Section | Box Case Box Case Box Case
SM-LG
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free
XLG
Brand/Mfg #:
Section Il Box Case Box Case d Box Case
SM-LG SIV
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered 0' ¥
XLG ﬁ, p
’
Brand/Mfg #:
, ot
Section Il Box Case X Case‘ C! Box Ce“;ta
SM-LG OIIa N lb ﬂll
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl D i
XLG 2@ 'fh b
[ on ) 1l 1
Brand/Mfg #: N wl
|
Section IV Box Case Box (lzl Box Case
|V
SM-LG q In
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free éetw
XLG
L oh
Brand/Mfg #: l
Section V Box D Box Case Box Case
BIac.k Nitrile Powder Free SM-LG 0 |
6 mil
Textured grip XLG —
Puncture & abrasion resistant 3XL
Brand/Mfg #:
Section VI Box Case Box Case Box Case
Autopsy Gloves — extended cuff
15 mil MXLG
Textured grip
Puncture & abrasion resistant
Brand/Mfg #:

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY




