Bid Tabulation
McHenry County Purchasing

Bid 25-7593 DOT 2025 Sign Materials

RoadSafe US Standard
Eberl Iron High Star Lightle Traffic Sign
Works Traffic Enterprises MDSolutions |Systems Franklin Park [Vulcan Signs
Buffalo NY Bartlett 1L Frankfort OH |Plain City OH |Woodridge IL |IL Foley AL
Group 1 U-channel posts &
Post pounder adapter $5,560.18 $6,061.35 $6,849.70 $7,345.00 No bid No bid No bid
Group 2 Aluminum Blanks No Bid $12,549.25 |$13,302.25 $13,615.00 No bid $10,276.95 $9,753.25
Group 3 Sign material roll
goods No Bid $36,941.25 [$28,238.13 $30,379.24 $32,486.84 No Bid $27,578.52
Group 4 Sign Faces No Bid $10,227.00 |$5,180.85 $3,680.25 No bid No Bid $4,391.55
Group 5 Roll up warning sign
assemblies No Bid $9,464.40 $9,114.00 $8,080.00 $6,225.78 No Bid $7,401.27
Group 6 Sign mounting
hardware No Bid No bid No Bid $6,369.00 No Bid No Bid No bid
Group 7 Traffic Control devices|No Bid $43,099.75 [No Bid No Bid $39,649.40 No Bid No bid
Group 8 Corrugated Sign
Panels No Bid $4,580.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid
Minimum purchase
requirements are based on
supplier requirements for
Exceptions None None None None None None ALL roll goods
Responsive - Responsible Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
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